/ﬁ\ 504 Broad Street a Story Ciry, IA 50248

1

1.

1L

IV.

VI

VIIL

VIIIL.

| RN

& CiryofStoryCity.org

| City b
..... ! 7

COUNCIL AGENDA
TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 5, 2023 - 6:00 P.M.
CITY HALL - SECOND FLOOR

CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL, 6:00 P.M.
APPROVE/AMEND THE AGENDA

APPROVAL OF THE AUGUST 21, 2023 REGULAR MEETING
MINUTES

CITIZEN APPEARANCE:
A)

LEGAL ITEMS:

A)  Ordinance No. 339 — Amending Chapter 156 (Building Codes) of the
Code of Ordinances, Final Reading

B)  Ordinance No. 340 — Clarifying Services Charges and Rates for
Service by Amending Sections 92.01 and 92.02 of the Code of

Ordinances, Final Reading
&)

ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS:
A)  Approve Site Plan for M.H. Eby Plant 2 Expansion
B)  Approve Construction Project Submittals:

1. Construction Pay Application No. 2 for the Railroad Crossing
Improvements Project

2. Change Order No. 3 for the Railroad Crossing Improvements

Project
3. Change Order No. 2 for the Carousel Field F encing Project
4
C)
PERMITS:
A)

MAYOR & CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEMS:

A)  Discussion, with Possible Action, on Proposed Cameras in the
North Park

» Home of the 1913 Herschell-Spillman Antique Carousel «



IX.

XI.

B)  Discussion on Parking on Forest Avenue between Henryson and
Northridge.

C)
APPROVAL OF BILLS AND CLAIMS

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL COMMENTS REGARDING
NON-AGENDA ITEMS

ADJOURNMENT



STORY CITY, IOWA August 21, 2023

Mayor Jensen called the council meeting to order on Monday August 21, 2023, at 6:00
p-m. at City Hall.

Present: Mayor Jensen, Administrator Jackson
Council Members: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, and Sporleder
Absent: Attorney Larson

Also Present: Nicole Englehardt, EDC; Shanon McKinley, GCC; Scandia West Board
Members; Bart Clark, B&L Properties; Lynn Dahlsten and Jenna Wishteyah

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by O’Connor, to approve the agenda.
Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Motion by Ostrem, seconded by Phillips, to approve the August 7, 2023 regular meeting
minutes.

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

CITIZEN APPEARANCE

A)  Scandia West Condominium Association
Presentation of concerns by the Scandia West Condo Association board regarding
a project in their building

LEGAL ITEMS

A)  Resolution No. 23-61 — Setting Date for Public Hearing on Urban
Renewal Plan Amendment for the Story City Consolidated Urban
Renewal Area
Motion by Phillips, seconded by O’Connor, to approve
Resolution No. 23-61 — Setting Date for Public Hearing for September 18,
2023 on Urban Renewal Plan Amendment for the Story City Consolidated Urban
Renewal Area
Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder
Nay: None
Motion Carried.

B)  Resolution No. 23-62 — Approving the City of Story City’s
Participation in the Revitalize lowa’s Sound Economy (RISE)



O

D)

E)

A)

Program — Local Development Funding — for Roadway Improvements
Motion by Ostrem, seconded by Sporleder, to approve

Resolution No. 23-62 — Approving the City of Story City’s
Participation in the Revitalize Iowa’s Sound Economy (RISE)
Program — Local Development Funding — for Roadway Improvements
Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Resolution No. 23-63 — Approving Release of Mortgage Lien (COAD
Enterprises LLC) and Authorizing the Mayor and City Clerk to
Execute Same on Behalf of the City

Motion by Solberg, seconded by Ostrem, to approve

Resolution No. 23-63 — Approving Release of Mortgage Lien (COAD
Enterprises LLC) and Authorizing the Mayor and City Clerk to
Execute Same on Behalf of the City

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Ordinance No. 339 — Amending Chapter 156 (Building Codes) of the
Code of Ordinances, Second Reading

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by O’Connor, to approve

Ordinance No. 339 — Amending Chapter 156 (Building Codes) of the
Code of Ordinances, Second Reading

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Ordinance No. 340 — Clarifying Services Charges and Rates for
Service by Amending Sections 92.01 and 92.02 of the Code of
Ordinances, Second Reading

Motion by O’Connor, seconded by Sporleder, to approve
Ordinance No. 340 — Clarifying Services Charges and Rates for
Service by Amending Sections 92.01 and 92.02 of the Code of
Ordinances, Second Reading

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS

Approve Site Plan for B&L Properties I-35 Industrial Park Building

Bart Clark was present to offer information and answer questions about the
project. Administrator Jackson reported that approval of the site plan was



B)

C)

A)

B)

recommended by P & Z.

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by O’Connor, to approve Site Plan for B&L
Properties I-35 Industrial Park Building

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Approve Construction Project Submittals:

1. Construction Pay Application No. 3 for the Water Main

Improvement Project

2. Construction Pay Application No. 1 for the Railroad Crossing
Improvements Project

3. Change Orders No. 1 and 2 for the Railroad Crossing

Improvements Project

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by O’Connor, to approve Construction Pay

Application No. 3 for the Water Main Improvement Project for $166,255.41;

Construction Pay Application No. 1 for the Railroad Crossing Improvements

Project for $77,958.83; Change Orders No. 1 for $7,500 and 2 for $ 670.15 for the

Railroad Crossing Improvements Project

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Review Financial Highlights for Fiscal Year 2022-23
Administrator Jackson presented information on the city’s fund balances

MAYOR & CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEMS

Hearing on Vicious Dog — Lynn Dahlsten and Jenna Wishteyah

839 Hillcrest Dr., #2

Lynn Dahlsten and Jenna Wishteyah presented information to council about their
dog and the reported incident. Mayor and council recommended the issuance of a
formal warning about the dog.

Motion by Solberg, seconded by O’Connor, to approve the warning on the
Hearing on Vicious Dog — Lynn Dahlsten and Jenna Wishteyah

839 Hillcrest Dr., #2

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Request to have Chickens: Travis Campbell — 711 4™ St.

Motion by O’Connor, seconded by Solberg, to approve request to have 6 chickens,
no ducks or roosters, Travis Campbell — 711 4% St.

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None



C)

D)

E)

Motion Carried.

Sidewalk Improvement Applications:

1. Jennifer and James Schroeder — 312 Elm Ave

Motion by Solberg, seconded by Sporleder, to approve Sidewalk Improvement
Applications Jennifer and James Schroeder — 312 Elm Ave

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Mayor Appointment to the Library Board of Trustees, Subject

to Approval by the City Council

Motion by Solberg, seconded by Phillips, to approve Mayor Appointment of
Ashlee Mullenbach to the Library Board of Trustees

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Schedule Next City Council Meeting

Motion by Phillips, seconded by Solberg, to approve the schedule change for the
Next City Council Meeting for Tuesday Sept. 5™ at 6:00 in recognition of the
Labor Day Holiday

Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

APPROVAL OF BILLS AND CLAIMS

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by O’Connor, to approve bills and claims
Aye: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL COMMENTS REGARDING
NON-AGENDA ITEMS

e CM Sporleder: request for update on old hardware building
o Administrator Jackson: no new information at this time

¢ Administrator Jackson:
o Bertha Bartlett Library has hired a new director
o There are only about 40 water meters that have yet to be replaced
o We are expecting new site plans for expected growth in businesses



in the city
o We are 90% complete with our drawings on the WW Treatment

plant
o Per request by Shanon McKinley, the council will place on the
agenda the issue of installing cameras at the North park

There being no further business before council, the meeting adjourned at 7:26 p.m.

ATTEST:

Heather Slifka, Cit)-' Clerk Mike Jensen, Mayor



ORDINANCE NO. 339

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 156 (BUILDING CODES) OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE INFORPORATED CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA:

SECTION 1. Chapter 156 of the Story City Code of Ordinances is hereby repealed in its entirety and
replaced with the following:

CHAPTER 156

BUILDING CODES

156.01 Title 156.67 Plumbing Code

156.02 Adoption of Building Codes 156,08 Electrical Code

156.03 Building Code 156.09 Fire Code

156.04 Residential Code 156.10 Property Maintenance Code
156.05 Mechanical Code 156.11 Energy Conservation Code
156.06 Fuel Gas Code 156.12 Existing Building Code

156.01 TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Building Codes of the City of Story City, lowa, may be cited as
such, and will be referred to herein as the "Story City Building Code(s)."

156.02 ADOPTION OF BUILDING CODES. The following codes are hereby adopted as, and constitute, the Building
Codes of the City of Story City, lowa, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving,
removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, and maintenance of buildings or structures
in the City.

156.03 BUILDING CODE. The provisions of the International Building Code, 2018 edition, as published by the
International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and
deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City

LA L

Building Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code™.

2. Section 101.4.1 Gas. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and add at the end of the
section: “All references in this code to the International Fuel Gas Code shall be interpreted to refer to the Story
City Fuel Gas Code.”

3. Section 101.4.2 Mechanical. Delete “International” and insert in tieu thereof “Story City” and add at the end
of the section: “All references in this code to the International Mechanical Code shall be interpreted to refer to
the Story City Mechanical Gas Code.”

4. Section 101.4.3 Plumbing. Delete “International Plumbing Code™ and insert in lieu thereof “Story City
Plumbing Code™ and add at the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Plumbing
Code shall be interpreted to refer to the Story City Plumbing Code.”



5. Section 101.4.4 Property maintenance. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and
add at the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Property Maintenance Code shall
be interpreted to refer to the Story City Property Maintenance Code.”

6. Section 101.4.5 Fire prevention. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and add at
the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Fire Code shall be interpreted to refer to
the Story City Fire Code.”

7. Section 101.4.6 Energy. Delete “International™ and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and add at the end of
the section: “All references in this code to the International Energy Conservation Code shall be interpreted to
refer to the Story City Energy Conservation Code.”

8. Section 101.4.7 Existing buildings. Delete “International” and insert in licu thereof “Story City” and add at
the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Existing Building Code shall be
interpreted to refer to the Story City Existing Building Code.”

9. Section 101.4 Referenced Codes. Add Subsection 101.4.8; “101.4.8 Electrical. The provisions of the Story
City Electrical Code shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair, and replacement of electrical systems,
including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings, and appurtenances. All references in this code to NFPA 70
shall be interpreted to refer to the Story City Electrical Code.”

10. Section 104.11 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment. Add
Subsection 104.11.3: “104.11.3 Manufactured home installation. The lowa Administrative Code 661,
Chapter 16, Div. VI, Part 2, Manufactured Home Construction, is hereby adopted for installation of mobile
(manufactured) homes.”

11. Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #1. Delete 120 and insert in lieu thereof 200,
12. Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #2. Delete existing text.

13. Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #6. Delete existing text and insert: “Sidewalks
and driveways located entirely on private property, and not more than 30 inches above adjacent grade, and not
over any basement or story below, and not part of an accessible route.”

14. Section 107.1 General. Delete “in two or more sets”.
15. Section 107.3.1 Approval of construction decuments. Delete this section.

16. Section 903.4.2 Alarms. Delete existing text and insert: “An approved audible and visual device, located
on the exterior of the building in an approved location, shall be connected to each automatic sprinkler system.
Such sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single
sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of
the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.”

17. Section 907.1. General. Add Subsection 907.1.4: “907.1.4 Fire alarm control panels (FACP). Each
building shall have no more than one fire alarm control panel. Installation of the fire alarm control panel shall
not exceed six feet in height, measured from the floor to the top of the control panel. Exception: Suppresion
system releasing panels are not required to meet the height requirement or the limitation on the number of
panels.”

18. Section 1009.2 Continuity and components. Add Iltem Number 11: “11. Concrete, asphalt, or other
approved hard-surface exterior walking surfaces.”

19. Section 1010.1.6 Landings at doors. Add Subsection 1010.1.6.1: “1010.1.6.1 Landing frost protection.
Exterior landings required by Section 1010.1.5 to be at the same elevation on each side of the door shall be
provided with frost protection.”

20. Section 1028.5 Access to a public way, Add at the end of the section: “Components of exterior walking
surfaces shall be hard-surfaced.”



21. Section 1030.4 Window wells. Add Subsection 1030.4.3: *1030.4.3 Window well drainage. All window
wells shall be provided with approved drainage.”

22. Section 1301.1.1 Criteria. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City”.

23. Section 1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. Insert: “City of Story City, lowa™ and “as adopted
in City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 160”.

24. Section 1807.1.5 Concrete and masonry foundation walls. Add Exception #2 and Table 1807.1.5: “2.
Concrete and masonry foundation walls supporting buildings of conventional light-frame wood construction
shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with Table 1807.1.5.
Table 1807.1.5
Prescriptive Foundation Walls Supporting Light-Frame Construction®®*

f(l;l:':lﬁl;tﬁ';i Thickness of Reinforcement size and Reinforcement size
walld foundation wall placement in concrete wall and placement in
TR
Gross | Net® | Concretef | Masonry® Horizontal Vertical AT
No. 4 bar within No. 4 bar at 0.075 square inch bar
: T . 5 127 of the top and e at 96" o.c. vertically in
<8 <1'-8 7.5 8 727 0.c
- - ) bottom of the wall maxim'u;n cells fully grouted with
and at mid-height Type M or S grout
No. 4 bar at
, . on » Refer to No. 4 bar at 24” .
>8 >7-8 8 R404.1 2 o.c. maximum 20. o.c. i Refer to 1807.1.6
maximum!

a. Concrete floor slab to be nominal 4” thick. If such floor slab is not provided prior to backfiil, one 36 vertical No. 4 bar shall be
embedded in the fooling at maximum 84" o.c. spacing or a full depth nominal 2" depth x 4" width keyway shall be installed in
the footing.

b.  All reinforcement bars shall meet ASTM A6175 grade 40 minimum and be deformed. Placement of bars shall be 3” from the
inside face of the wall and meet the provisions of chapters 18, 19, and 21 of the International Building Code.

c.  Material used as backfill shall be carefully placed granular soil of average or high permeabitity and shall be drained with an

approved drainage system as prescribed in Section 1805.4 of the International Building Code. Where soils containing a high

percentage of clay, fine silt, or similar materials of low permeability or expansive soils are encountered or where backfill
materials are not drained or an unusually high surcharge is to be placed adjacent to the wall, a specially designed wall shall be
required.

Maximum foundation wall height is 10” gross and 9'-8" net.

Net foundation wall height measured from top of basement slab to top of foundation wall

The thickness of concrete foundation walls supporting 3 floors shall be increased 2"

The thickness of masonry foundation walls supporting 3 floors shall be increased 4™

No. 5 bar at 24" o.c. maximum is an approved alternative.

No. 5 bar at 30" o.c. maximum is an approved alternative.

Mortar for masonry walls shall be Type M or S and masonry shall be laid in running bond.

k. If masonry block is 12" nominal thickness, wall may be unreinforced.”

SR e A

25. Section 1809.5 Frost protection, Exception 2. Delete existing text and insert: “Area of 1,000 square feet
or less for light-frame construction or 400 square feet for other than light-frame construction.”

26. Section 1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction. Delete existing Table 1809.7 and all
footnotes and insert:

“Table 1809.7
Prescriptive Footings Supporting Walls of Light-Frame Construction®b<4=f

Number of floors Thickness of Thickness of foundation Width of | Thickness
supported by the foundation walls walls (inches), concrete footing of footing
footing® {inches), concrete block (inches) (inches)
1 8 8 16 8
2 8 8 16 8
3 10 12 18 12

a.  Depth of perimeter footings shall be at least 42" below final grade



b.  The ground under the floor shatl be permitted to be excavated to the elevation of the bottom of the footing.

¢. Interior stud-bearing walls shall be permitted to be supported by isolated footings. The footing width and length shall be twice the
width shown in this table, and footings shall be spaced not more than 6 feet on center.

d.  Spread footings shall have a minimum of 2- #4 continuous horizontal reinforcement bars.

e. Foundation walls shall have a minimum of #4 reinforcement bars 18” on center in each direction.

f.  Trench footings are allowed as a continuous 8 inch trench for single-story woed frame structures with spans nol exceeding 16
feet. The trench must be at least 42 inches below finished grade and have at least two #4 horizontal reinforcement bars. Bars must
tie into abutting adjacent structure.

g. Footings shall be permitted to support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of floors. Footings supporting a roof only shall
be as required for supporting one floor.”

27. Section 2902.6 Small Occupancies. Add at the end of the section: “Water dispensers in accessible locations
and within accessible reach ranges may be substituted for the required drinking fountain in business occupancies
determined to require only one drinking fountain by occupant load.”

28. Section 3109.1 General. Delete “International” and inseit in lieu thereof “Story City”.

156.04 RESIDENTIAL CODE. The provisions of the International Residential Code for One-and Two-Family
Dwellings, 2018 edition, as published by the International Code Council, except for Part VII—Plumbing, and Part
VIII—Electrical; and with the addition of Appendix Chapters G, H, and J, are hereby adopted by reference, subject to
the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions:

1. Section R101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City

1 0

Residential Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code™.

2. Section 104.11 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment. Add
Subsection 104.11.2: “104.11.2 Manufactured home installation. The lowa Administrative Code 661,
Chapter 16, Div. VI, Part 2, Manufactured Home Construction, is hereby adopted for installation of mobile
(manufactured) homes.”

3. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #2. Delete existing text.

4. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #5. Delete existing text and insert: “Sidewalks
and driveways located entirely on private property.

5. Section R106.1 Submittal documents. Delete “in two or more sets”,
6. Section R106.3.1 Approval of construction documents. Delete this section.

7. Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria. Amend Table 301.2(1) to include the
following values:

Ground Snow Load: 25 PSF

Wind Speed (mph): LS

Topographic effects: NO

Special wind region: NO

Wind-borne debris zone: NO

Seismic Design Category: A

Weathering: Severe

Frost line depth: 42~

Termite: Moderate to Heavy

Winter Design Temp: -1°F

Ice Barrier Underlayment Required: YES

Flood Hazards: As adopted in City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter
160

Air Freezing Index: 1896

Mean Annual Temp: 48.2°F



Elevation: 1010 ft

Latitude: 42°N
Winter heating: -1°F
Summer cooling: 90°F
Altitude correction factor: 0.97
Indoor design temperature: TO°F
Design temperature cooling: 15°F
Heating temperature difference: TT°F
Cooling temperature difference: 15°F
Wind velocity heating: 15 MPH
Wind velocity cooling: 7.5 MPH
Coincident wet bulb: 74°F
Daily range: M
Winter humidity: 30%
Summer humidity: 50%

8. Section R303.3 Bathrooms. Delete existing text and insert: Bathrooms shall be provided with a mechanical
ventilation system. The minimum ventilation rates shall be 50 CFM for intermittent ventilation or 20 CFM for
continuous ventilation. Ventilation air from the space shall be exhausted directly to the outside of the dwelling.

9. Section R310.2.4 Emergency escape and rescue openings under decks and porches. Add at the end of
the section: “All cantilevered construction elements shall be regulated in accordance with this sectton.”

10. Section R311.3.2 Floor elevations for other exterior doors, Exception. Delete “two” and insert in lieu
thereof “three”.

1. Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. Add Exception #2: “2. Townhouse
structures that contain eight or fewer dwelling units and in which the gross finished and unfinished floor area
on all levels, including basements and exclusive of attached garages, is less than 18,000 square feet.”

12. Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems. Add Exception #2: “2. Dwellings
that do not exceed 8,000 square feet or more of enclosed floor space on all levels, including basements and
exclusive of attached garages.”

13. Section R326.1 General. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City”.

14. Section R403.1.1.1 Conventional light-frame wood construction. Add Subsection R403.1.1.1 and Table
R403.1.1.1: “R403.1.1.1 Conventional light-frame wood construction. Footings supporting concrete

foundations and buildings of conventional light-frame wood construction shall be permitted to be designed in
accordance with Table R403.1.1.1.

Table R403.1.1.1
Prescriptive Footings Supporting Walls of Light-Frame Construction®~%*
Number of floors supported by the Width of footing Thickness of footing
footing® (inches) (inches)
1 16 8 -
2 16 8
3 18 12

a.  Minimum 2,000 psf soil bearing pressure, Soil bearing pressures less than 2,000 psf shall use Tabtes R403.1(1) through
R403.1{3) and Figure R403.1(1) or R403.1.3, as applicable.

b.  Depth of perimeter footings shall be at least 42” below final grade

¢.  The ground under the floor shall be permitied to be excavated to the elevation of the bottom of the footing.

d. Interior stud-bearing walls shall be permitted to be supported by isolated footings. The fooling width and length shall be twice the
width shown in this table, and footings shall be spaced not more than 6 feet on center.

e.  Spread footings shall have a minimum of 2- #4 continuous horizontal reinforcement bars.



t.  Trench footings are allowed as a continuous 8 inch trench for single-story wood frame structures with spans not exceeding 16
feet. The trench must be at least 42 inches below finished grade and have at least two #4 horizontal reinforcement bars. Bars must
tie into abutting adjacent structure.

g.  Footings shall be permitted to support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of floors. Footings supporting a roof only shall
be as required for supporting cne floor.”

15. Section R403.1.4.1 Frost protection, Exception #1. Delete “600” and insert in lieu thereof “1,000”.

16. Section R404.1.3.2.3 Foundation walls for cenventional light-frame wood construction. Add
Subsection R404.1.3.2.3 and Table R404.1.3.2.3: “R404.1.3.2.3 Foundation walls for conventional light-
frame wood construction, Concrete and masonry foundation walls supporting buildings of conventional light
frame wood construction shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with Table R404.1.3.2.3.
Table R403.1.1.1
Prescriptive Foundation Walls Supporting Light-Frame Construction™®*

Height 0 . Thickness of Reinforcement size and Reinforcement size
foundation . . .
4 foundation wall placement in concrete wall and placement in
Lzl masonry walli*
Gross | Net® | Concrete' | Masonry® Horizontal Vertical y
No. 4 bar within 0.075 square inch bar
12" of th d No. 4 bar at - . .
<g | <7-8” 757 8" of the top an 197 o.c. at 96” o.c. vertically in
- - ’ bottom of the wall maxirr{um cells fully grouted with
and at mid-height Type M or S grout
No. 4 bar at
; ' o " Refer to No. 4 bar at 24" ,,
>8 >7'-8 8 R404.1.2 o.c. maximum" 20. o.c. i Refer to R404.1.2
maximum'

. Concrete floor slab to be nominal 4 thick. If such floor slab is not provided prior to backfill, one 36” vertical No. 4 bar shall be
embedded in the footing at maximum 84" o.c. spacing or a full depth nominal 2” depth x 4" width keyway shall be installed in
the footing.

m. All reinforcement bars shall meet ASTM A6175 grade 40 minimum and be deformed. Placement of bars shall be 3” from the
inside face of the wall and meet the provisions of chapters 18, 19, and 21 of the International Building Code.

n.  Material used as backfill shall be carefully placed granular soil of average or high permeability and shall be drained with an

approved drainage system as prescribed in Section 1805.4 of the International Building Code. Where soils containing a high

percentage of clay, fine silt, or similar materials of low permeability or expansive soils are encountered or where backfill
materials are not drained or an unusually high surcharge is to be placed adjacent to the wall, a specially designed wall shall be
required.

Maximum foundation wall height is 10" gross and 9°-8" net.

Net foundation wall height measured from top of basement slab to top of foundation wall

The thickness of concrete foundation walls supporting 3 floors shall be increased 2.

The thickness of masonry foundation walls supporting 3 floors shall be increased 4”

No. 5 bar at 24" o.c. maximum is an approved alternative.

No. 5 bar at 30” 0.c. maximum is an approved alternative.

Mortar for masonry walls shalt be Type M or § and masonry shall be laid in running bond.

If masonry block is 12 nominal thickness, wall may be unreinforced.”

SETTRRLoTO

17. Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency. Delete all sections except N1101.1.
18. Section N1101.1.1 Criteria. Add Subsection N1101.1.1: “N1101.1.1 Criteria. Buildings regulated by this
code shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the Story City Energy Conservation Code.”

156.05 MECHANICAL CODE, The provisions of the State of [owa Administrative Rule 641—Chapter 61 are hereby
adopted by reference, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions, and shall be known as
the Story City Mechanical Code. References to section numbers will be to sections in the International Mechanical
Code.

1. Section 106.3.1 Construction documents. Delete “in two or more sets”.
2. Section 106.4.1 Approved construction documents. Delete this section.

3. Section 106.4.6 Retention of construction documents. Delete the final sentence of this section.



4. Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule. Delete existing text and insert: “A fee for each permit required by this code
shall be paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by the Building Official.”

5. Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds. Delete existing text and insert: “The Building Official is authorized to establish
a refund policy.”

6. Section 108.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who violates a provision of
this code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, or repairs work
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building Official, or of a permit issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.”

7. Section 108.5 Stop work orders. Delete the final sentence of this section and insert in lieu thereof: “Any
person who shall continue any work regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject
to penalties as prescribed by law.”

156.06 FUEL GAS CODE. The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 edition, as published by the
International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and
deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City Fuel
Gas Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code™.”

2. Section 106.3.1 Construction documents. Delete “in two or more sets”.
3. Section 106.5.1 Approved construction documents. Delete this section.
4. Section 106.5.6 Retention of construction documents. Delete the final sentence of this section.

5. Section 106.6.2 Fee schedule. Delete existing text and insert: “A fee for each permit required by this code
shall be paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by the Building Official.”

6. Section 106.6.3 Fee refunds. Delete existing text and insest: “The Building Official is authorized to establish
a refund policy.”

7. Section 108.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who violates a provision of
this code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, or repairs work
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building Official, or of a permit issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.”

8. Section 108.5 Stop work orders. Delete the final sentence of this section and insert in lieu thereof: “Any
person who shall continue any work regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject
to penalties as prescribed by law.”

156.07 PLUMBING CODE. The provisions of the State of [owa Administrative Rule 641—Chapter 25 with the
addition of Chapter 1, except Sections 101 and 102, Appendix A, Appendix B, Appendix C, and Appendix D of the
Uniform Plumbing Code, 2018 edition, as published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials, are hereby adopted by reference, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions,

and shall be known as the Story City Plumbing Code. References to code sections will be to sections of the Uniform
Plumbing Code.

1. Section 104.4.1 Approved Plans or Construction Documents. Delete this section.
2. Section 104.4.6 Retention of Plans. Delete the final sentence of this section.
3. Section 104.5 Fees. Delete “and as set forth in the fee schedule, Table 104.5.”.



4. Section 104.5.3 Fee Refunds. Delete existing text and insert: “The Authority Having Jurisdiction is
authorized to establish a refund policy.”

5. Section 105.2.6 Reinspections. Delete “To obtain reinspection, the applicant shall file an application

therefore in writing upon a form furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with
Table 104.5.”.

156.08 ELECTRICAL CODE. The provisions of the State of lowa Administrative Rule 661—Chapter 504 are hereby
adopted by reference, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions, and shall be known as
the Story City Electrical Code:

1. Reserved.

156.09 FIRE CODE. The provisions of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition, as published by the International
Code Council, with the addition of Appendix Chapters B, C, D, and 1 are hereby adopted, subject to the following
additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City Fire

9 93

Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

2. Section 105.1.2 Types of permits. Add at the end of the section: “A certificate of occupancy issued pursuant
to the provisions of the International Building Code may be considered as equivalent to an operational permit,
Building, mechanical, electrical, and plumbing permits issued pursuant to the provisions of their respective
codes may be considered as equivalent to a construction permit.

3. Section 105.4.1 Submittals. Delete “in two or more sets”.
4. Section 105.4.6 Retention of construction documents. Delete the final sentence of this section.

5. Section 110.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Persons who shall violate a provision of
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or
do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit
or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.”

6. Section 112.4 Failure to comply. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who shall continue any work
regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by
]aw"?

7. Section 308.1.4 Open-flame cooking devices, Exception 2. Delete existing text and insert: “LP-gas cooking
devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater than 20 pounds.”

8. Section 308.1.4 Open-flame cooking devices, Exception 3. Delete this exception.

9. Section 903.4.2 Alarms. Delete existing text and insert: *“An approved audible and visual device, located on
the exterior of the building in an approved location, shall be connected to each automatic sprinkler system. Such
sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler
of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the
automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.”

10. Section 907.1. General. Add Subsection 907.1.4: “907.1.4 Fire alarm control panels (FACP). Each
building shall have no more than one fire alarm control panel. Installation of the fire alarm control panel shall
not exceed six feet in height, measured from the floor to the top of the control panel. Exception: Suppression
system reteasing panels are not required to meet the height requirement or the limitation on the number of
panels.”



11. Section 1009.2 Continuity and components. Add Item Number 11: “t1. Concrete, asphalt, or other
approved hard-surface exterior walking surfaces.”

12. Section 1010.1.6 Landings at doors, Add Subsection 1010.1.6.1: “1010.1.6.1 Landing frost protection.
Exterior landings required by Section 1010.1.5 to be at the same elevation on each side of the door shall be
provided with frost protection.”

13. Section 1028.5 Access to a public way. Add at the end of the section: “Components of exterior walking
surfaces shall be hard-surfaced.”

14. Section 1030.4 Window wells. Add Subsection 1030.4.3: “1030.4.3 Window well drainage. All window
wells shall be provided with approved drainage.”

15. Section 5704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. Delete existing text and insert
in lieu thereof: “Storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited within
the limits of the Residential (R), Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and PUD zoning districts established by
City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

16. Section 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. Delete existing text and insert
in lieu thereof: “Storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited within
the limits of the Residential (R}, Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and PUD zoning districts established by
City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

17. Section 5806.2 Limitations. Delete existing text and insert in lieu thereof: “Storage of flammable cryogenic
fluids in stationary containers outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits of the Residential (R),
Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and PUD zoning districts established by City of Story City Code of
Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

18. Section 6104.2 Maximum capacity within established limits. Delete existing text and insert in lieu
thereof: “The aggregate capacity of any one installation of liquefied petroleum gas storage shall not exceed a
water capacity of 2,000 gallons within the limits of the Residential (R), Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and
PUD zoning districts established by City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

156.10 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE. The provisions of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2018
edition, as published by the International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions,
modifications, insertions, and deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City

LI 1)

Property Maintenance Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code™.

2. Section 102.3 Application of other codes. Delete existing text and insert: “Repairs, additions, or alterations
to a structure, or change of occupancy, shall be done in accordance with the procedures and provisions, as
applicable, of the Story City Building Code, Story City Energy Conservation Code, Story City Existing Building
Code, Story City Fire Code, Story City Fuel Gas Code, Story City Electrical Code, Story City Mechanical Code,
Story City Residential Code, and Story City Plumbing Code.”

3. Section 103.5 Fees. Delete “as indicated in the following schedule™ and insert in lieu thereof “in accordance
with the schedule as established by the code official™.

4. Section 112.4 Failure to comply. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who shall continue any work
regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by
law.”

5. Section 302.4 Weeds. Insert: 12 inches”.
6. Section 304.14 Insect Screens. Insert: “April 1" and “October 317,



7. Section 404.4.1 Room area. Delete “one person” and insert in lieu thereof “two persons”.
8. Section 602.3 Heat supply. Insert: “October 1" and “April 30”.
9. Section 602.4 Occupiable work spaces. Insert: “October 1” and “April 30”.

156.11 ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE. The provisions of the International Energy Conservation Code as
currently adopted and amended by the Towa State Building Code Bureau shall apply to all matters governing the design
and construction of buildings for energy efficiency. Administration shall be as prescribed in the Story City Building
Code and these regulations shall be known as the Story City Energy Conservation Code. Construction or work for which
a permit is required shall be subject to 3rd party inspections. The Building Official is authorized to accept reports of
approved inspection agencies, provided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to qualifications and reliability. Any

portion that does not comply shall be corrected and such portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by
the Building Official.

156.12 EXISTING BUILDING CODE. The provisions of the International Existing Building Code, 2018 Edition, as
published by the International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions, modifications,
insertions, and deletions:

I. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City
Existing Building Code.

2. Section 106.1 General. Delete “in two or more sets”.

3. Section 106.3.1 Approval of construction documents. Delete this section,

156.13 SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE. The provisions of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code,
2018 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions,
modifications, insertions, and deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City
Swimming Pool and Spa Code, hereinafter known as “this code”.

2. Section 105.3 Construction documents. Delete “in two or more sets”.
3. Section 105.5.6 Retention of construction documents. Delete the final sentence of this section.

4. Section 105.6.2 Fee schedule. Delete existing text and insert: “A fee for each permit required by this code
shall be paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by the Building Official.”

5. Section 105.6.3 Fee refunds. Delete existing test and insert: “The building official is authorized to establish
a refund policy.”

6. Section 107.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who shall violate a provision
of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair
a pool or spa in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit
issued under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.”

7. Section 107.5 Stop work order. Delete the final sentence of this section and insert in lieu thereof: “Any
person who shall continue any work regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject
to penalties as prescribed by law.”

SECTION 2, REPEALER. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions
of this ordinance are hereby specifically repealed.



SECTION 3. SEVERABILITY CLAUSE. If any section, provision or
part of this ordinance shall be adjudged to be invalid or unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect
the validity of the ordinance as a whole or any section, provision or part thereof not adjudged invalid or
unconstitutional.

SECTION 4. WHEN EFFECTIVE. This ordinance shall be in effect from and after its adoption
by the City Council and publication thereof as provided by law.

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 5% day of September, 2023.

ATTEST:
Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk




MINUTES RE: ORDINANCE 339:

The foregoing ordinance was considered for the first time by the City Council on
August 7, 2023. It was moved by Councilperson Phillips, and seconded by
Councilperson O’Connor, and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the Council, as
follows:

AYE: Phillips, O’ Connor, and Sporleder

NAY:

ABSENT: Ostrem and Solberg

The ordinance was considered for the second time by the City Council on August 21
2023. The second reading was moved by Councilperson Sporleder, and seconded by
Councilperson O’Connor, and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the Council, as
follows:

>

AYE: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, and Sporleder

NAY:

ABSENT:

The ordinance was considered for the third and final time by the City Council on
September 5, 2023. The third and final reading was moved by Councilperson __,and

seconded by Councilperson , and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of
the Council, as follows:

AYE;

NAY:

ABSENT:

WHEREUPON, the Mayor declared Ordinance No. 339 duly passed and the title agreed
upon this 5™ day of September, 2023.

ATTEST:
Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk




ORDINANCE NO. 340

AN ORDINANCE CLARIFYING SERVICES CHARGES AND RATES FOR SERVICE
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 92.01 AND 92.02 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF
THE CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA,

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE INFORPORATED CITY OF STORY
CITY, IOWA:

SECTION 1. Sections 01 and 02 of Chapter 92 of the Story City Code of Ordinances
(Sections 92.01 and 92.02) are hereby repealed in its entirety and replaced with the following:

92.01 SERVICE CHARGES. Each customer shall pay for water service provided by the City
based upon use of water determined by meters provided for in Chapter 91. Each location, building,
premises, connection, or individual rental unit within a rental property which is served off of a
single meter shall be considered a separate and distinct customer, whether owned or ontrolled by
the same person.

92.02 RATES FOR SERVICE. Water service shall be furnished at the following monthly rates
within the City:

1. Base Rate (Minimum Bill). Each customer, including each individual rental unit within a
rental property served by a single meter, shall pay a base rate of $20.04 per month. Consumers
with yard meters shall pay an additional base rate of $6.22 per month for each yard meter.

2. Usage Rate. In addition to the base rate, each customer shall pay for water used at the rate
of $6.22 for any amount up to 100 cubic feet and $6.22 per 100 cubic feet for amounts over 100
cubic feet, prorated to the actual amount used. This usage rate shall increase by $0.20 per 100
cubic feet beginning with the November 2021 billing, and an additional $0.20 each November in
the years 2022, 2023 and 2024.

The Base Rate shall automatically increase by 3 percent (3%) or an amount equal to the increase
in the Consumer Price Index, whichever increase is less, at the November billing each year.

SECTION 2., REPEALER. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the
provisions of this ordinance are hereby specifically repealed.



SECTION 3. SEVERABILITY CLAUSE. If any section, provision or part of this
ordinance shall be adjudged invalid or unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the
validity of the ordinance as a whole or any section, provision or part thereof not adjudged invalid
or unconstitutional.

SECTION 4. WHEN EFFECTIVE. This Ordinance shall be in effect from and after its
adoption by the City Council and publication thereof as provided by law.

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 5™ day of September, 2023.

Mike Jensen, Mayor ATTEST: Heather Slifka, City Clerk
I hereby certify that the foregoing was published as Ordinance No. 340 on the day of
September, 2023.

Heather Slifka, City Clerk



MINUTES RE: ORDINANCE 340:

The foregoing ordinance was considered for the first time by the City Council on
August 7, 2023, It was moved by Councilperson Sporleder, and seconded by

Councilperson Phillips, and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the Council, as
follows:

AYE: Phillips, O’Connor, and Sporleder

NAY:

ABSENT: Ostrem and Solberg

The ordinance was considered for the second time by the City Council on August 21,
2023. The second reading was moved by Councilperson O’Connor, and seconded by

Councilperson Sporleder, and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the Council, as
follows:

AYE: Ostrem, Phillips, Solberg, O’Connor, and Sporleder

NAY:

ABSENT:

The ordinance was considered for the third and final time by the City Council on
September 5, 2023. The third and final reading was moved by Councilperson , and

seconded by Councilperson , and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of
the Council, as follows:

AYE:

NAY:

ABSENT:

WHEREUPON, the Mayor declared Ordinance No. 340 duly passed and the title agreed
upon this 5" day of September, 2023.

ATTEST:
Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk




DATE: August 30, 2023

TO: Lorena Wasion, E.L.
Snyder & Associates
2727 SW Snyder Blvd
Ankeny, [A 50023
RE: EBY Plant 2 Expansion-Site Plan Review

Project No. 7044.013
City of Story City, lowa (City)

FOX Strand has completed the third review for the EBY Plant 2 Expansion Site Plan as received on
August 30, 2023 via email. Please address the following comments:

General Comments

1. This review letter does not make comment on fire code, sprinkling requirements, fire
accessibility or building code. Said review and subsequent comments shall be left for City fire
officials and City building review officials where applicable. Further comments by the Fire
Chief or Safe Building may be forthcoming.

2. Developer has stated that an NPDES permit will be provided.
3. Developer has stated that a sand/oil separator will be installed in the wash bay.
4. The Developer is requesting a waiver of the parking stall requirement to allow for gravel parking

stalls in lieu of paved parking. Per 165.05, 61: “Parking space” means a permanently surfaced
area, enclosed in the main building or in an accessory building, or unenclosed, having an area
of not less than 9 feet by 19 feet, 171 square feet exclusive of driveways, permanently reserved
Jor the temporary storage of one automobile and connected with a street or alley by a surfaced
driveway which affords satisfactory ingress for automobiles.

Discussion is necessary whether the City will allow the required parking stalls for this site to be
surfaced with gravel. FOX Strand can support allowing the proposed parking stalls to be
surfaced with gravel if the Council elects to do so. If an issue arises where the gravel parking
area is not being maintained, or if vehicular parking is spilling into the City right of way, the
City should reserve the right to require Eby to pave the parking per Code.

Lighting Plan
5. Please provide the photometric plan or state when one will be submitted. Lighting plan shall

show no spillover to the south.

Elevation Plans
6. Developer has stated that the building exterior will match the current structure. Overhead doors
will also match existing.

FOX Strand recommends approval of the Site Plan subject to the comments above. Please provide a
signed .pdf of the storm water calculations via email for our records.

MSH $ji§ \AMEN7000-- 709517044401 3\Correspondence\R aviews\3rd ReviewA2023 08 30 - SP - MH Eby Plant 2 Expansion - 3rd Review.docx



Lorena Wasion, E.L

EBY Plant 2 Expansion—Site Plan Review
Page 2

August 30, 2023

Please deliver 5 signed half-sized plan sets to City Hall by Thursday, August 31, 2023 at 12pm
(noon) for P&Z and Council review.

Site Plan Review Schedule

Planning & Zoning: September 5, 2023 at 5:15 P.M. at Story City City Hall

Council Meeting: September 5, 2023 at 6 P.M., at Story City City Hall

If you have any questions or concerns, please contact Mitch Holtz at 515-233-0000. FOX Strand
reserves the right to modify and/or add to these comments.

Sincerely,

FOX Strand
Zi/tch Holtz, P.E.

Attachments

c: Mark Jackson, City Administrator, City of Story City

MSH:sj IS \AME!\T000—709% 704410 1 3 Cormespondence'Reviews'3rd Review' 2023 08 30 - SP - MH Eby Plant 2 Expansion - 3rd Revicw.docx



133HE LWL

'"ONI ‘S3LVIO0SSY 8 ¥IAANS
NOISNVdJX3 Z LNV1d AS3 'HW

« dVIN ALINIDIA

Nl IORLINGS NOSIOMS Covy “SRmES it Thedved WED
Nl WALLNOG WOMOME O UMES WUOLS ‘DNCYYD 006

|
ST YACe “ANTY
WL

Tamfl YMO! 'ALID AHOLS
[]
[]

BT ow ey

I T

(L]
i | are0 mm] HoaL veano |

paary c7-52-40] BLEII00 ALED Wil BY
TaESET WLEIWI00 ALK W BY

0012 188ys

- - L, a| - = . |_1 %
VMOI * ALID AHO1S
13341S JAITO HOIY 8081

NOISNVdX3d ¢ INVId AG8d HIN

HO4
SNV'1d 41IS




NOLLYINHOANI LO3rodNd

'"ONI ‘S31VIJ0SSY B ¥IAANS
NOISNVdX3 Z LNV1d AS3 'H'W

TN VA ANDINY
W LEE

LS HOOM S0Pl A | D252 1

YMOI "ALID ANOLS

Lo
rn

13

3

HS080LEL

i ] i T
oN et mon| 003 e o] men maial
A

LOLD toeys

[N ——— T VAN ATV BY GAION Repwa L300 [

Ll 3 L0M ARannl LY RERLYICN LIAncd BHL M Ty RAAHl BRI v KOV anting “
10 v TG 40 HLHON 713 AYMOBIY OISR 0 LIS 0672 U L eyl Aoyt O TN 1 e VB Iy e v T Dy I
W SGE=AT] LEVLYSTTe] SSTYOLI=N  COBMND e a e O BV ABAMNS T CRLEDCE B 4O NADHE EINN QIVONIOE '3 e A MO O
VELIOTD - BRIV BN O P :o.:an.zgii..o.. PRERR ccaapeilyetii] oy A WLV 118 sy oo - e
VG pir-y on LawiLiY ey Eotl ool
QMY LNSSOONT WiEH) BN TR MOABAMNE BH TEAR MOXBN
EXUYWHONI WRELLYR Rake BL SMFRELLIC A L VWY OL LYERIAC B0 AYR ONINGYM ALTILD i
SN ALCANALLAASOEL M - 4 B Bl 0 WO L0 WELCHY WO SO B - = '
MONTIEN MBS LVLRYED SRMLLOMLL/STIONYR SEE0Y RO (AMIV, FONSOAR FOLLICUBLTVID WIHLO GNY "R B
HLISE 4O LEVE DO EUE.B!UIS TWOHLLIYIN ACHYY WRAD POLE LY nirian MO kv Buey SR75 OHY S WLV Bdter ONACUCREONT  © 'NOLLKINOD 'S0 "Bt 3HI BY TEMA IV 'SRUrILN DVASTENE Gt [l
“TONES T 0 HINGN ¥ IP9748 ¥ LSV W MAOTTTIA MU VR 07 GPEY Ao ivawm o L e TR et K
SN ATT HOTIOONSIS] S TRMILION 0 PO IHAT L OO AL "CHMTING BHL OMESLAE SIANSE 20 NOLLYI0" SHL SMINALIRO .
DL 90H SIS 0 CRPRUDAE B9 0L OFIM TYIOM DMLLYMDMICUOMLYO'Y > cn :
“BANITINVE 4O LTBM 2013 WI0D EIVA B S WOKNY HCLLYAYE WOLIVELLESAM NI WL SO0 O RLYRdRd Y
LRI ATIC HOM 40 HUNOT G233 D AULEYIA O ML MVED0 21 17 FHOHATTTL LT CRIOALYHLS FEHOST ON WY ATNG BIWIDNef I SR Gl PN BVAE AUILN ¥ 40 MOYONIGY ML MONCRAL G0 e sonsriccne T IRTIRITE
o PO IR T WIODOM WD BUNLIMLLE G FUNLINKLE AW i v e o vimeos I
15V 5 A RN 0 HINOI e ) AT G LA Ao D A S PO A Ll e L fe el g oL CTRAFTITG
OF L666PATTE SV LLLSTSNT ™3 W TIVEOLLN  WOLea ADUBN TTIH NI W VD0 e e e Foipreom . |
AlrL
FONVIING ALE) ANOLE 0 HLYON 5% Hii0E DT KA OOV TV.AI000 SBLL NEHLLIWA CEINIY.LNCES IV L8 " AN L Ne orvowsme o [
0 LV 01 TI0 MO 20 1T O LY ot LA MRS 138 b v NAROHE LOW L0 AR AVTIWOS T 110 4 HO IV IV YIATY AP0 B T TUN R MY bt [
TS TEATT CYPRLELTIT=] ST EVTHOLIN [T MO WLV ALMLLA Bl MAVA SEEBHLNIFU Bhii M AOHE By SRLMLIN 40 TRAT ALTWTD B
NOLVIDOREY ALFRLI ICHR WacH VAL BINIOAIOD DTN f
NOULOPEWGLINT CRLSIAY ¥ LTRMLE SANO HIAL IO LEM S19% HuIkt 20 16D 20 LB 0 DN ST (RS0 ANY 20 LWL B0
2995 IO 0NGR! 30 HLNOS 213 ¥ STV U HAWA VG 21 LT O ATIMALTIVEN L1vD0Y VO NEIED0 O WX "AVVERZTIN BY QIDER, ATWOLA I DY v
FCARATT SHRORES b B P ] ZHI0HR FRTOTIN QY RUIBACO SHITING KIHTNOOG MY - 1
4O LIVR.OFF FINVIING 40 LERN 5 AT T 3T T OVIHAEAC B0 o Lol
LIS BATIO R T HLBOR, VAN T 40 7 B LS Y e - i
PEREZ HTHOPE =) W IvIvaii=N -] LR NN LIDOU. ETT » b
‘WILEAS LSO NOIKDO TIV: BN WMD) TML WO TEATISY I = o= =
O34 P08 LS3M “TULNBLLS FESOLR SRR LA S L1 T AGHS MOLLVIOAE oV Vg VLGS AT a v, oo e wves
ORI ISIMIPSTI-A X IMLLH 001D NOLLVROINI LSVINDD ALTLA am o b pondownn |
T
LR ARAMIE B~ OBANEO L (0 GAOE HODSEN L IaEIE STV a_g—. “ " el ey wp b
PO AALEAS ELVMIGHOOD TVNOIDI VIR a o et p— :
- - oy, oy
SINGa ToRINGS TIVS SNO i i mmem B
W [+:] e e D] b
—VMOl T =S
] a Ty D
— - g o
a a L ]
a 17 oy
H " ol o,
L] L d wdir wang
- - e A el Ay
- - N o Srhg AR
- Y vy s
- - e gy
[ - [
. ° oo Ty m—
MOLLINMLISICED E11 WON EIVAM DN BNOLLVIN0'Y MOLLISINDE) AJVIA GV DA - - Do o2 i v
24 DLNON ALILN TWACWOD 0} MOLAYMINDS TALLNLLN NARALEE RINVANTD) WANGIMOH | H
OV WILLYDA B4 NI NIVANIVIN TN EDMIEROMS AUMLEN TH ASRELA OL WOLAMLNGS L4 v e gutine ]
[ | = LT
WOLLIVELLEIGD OL Ok q =] L e e ]
WIAD 511 QWY "ALNACD W0y ‘WIGIAONS SIUANEE ALTLLN HLLA EERAMTE AL BRHINYMY ) npaiyy nty
WBMLE ANY ONY BNOMITTL “TWORLLOTI BVE PraflLVN ILLYNIGWCOS 0L WILOVAINGD B —_— —t— g s maeg warny
LN S Wy [pp—
RO W LPTUBY DSCVUD ¥ VOLNLLNGD AR LT 38 TR SUITRANGT) JO0C TMLNG)
NOIROMS BOR TBY CHIYMG NOLLWILENGES 4O STL B LY AL NO STMVAR TR
BV STNEVIN OMLIID HOWOME CHITTVIEN ¥CJ FTRENOSSEY 30 THAE MOLTVILNOD HL 9t N i
3snoNaNe I LW BL 1L TLNIKEOM - = |.-_.L.ull oy N
TIMIFINGO 1 JIVAD T 04 SXRYHLLUNGAY ALY DMLLIKKY ANY 4O LNIFLLSTOY HL T p—— e ok v s A
T BEOvaS DRIV p—— e o -
Z UZPYR ATIFIL ¥ 8 EIRLIALLY NOLOMTLLINGS A% YD I MIOR CPey BAWRIARS) R yinaibp-]
e s} + vk boscwe s RATFALE DAROBCIN veCles IFWRDO QWY L] DINVITT) ¥4 STRINCMEDY B WOLTVILNGD THL '€ e e r— p—— e by
TRLON IO STTIN OFLLION PV DAY =
Tl v A s BTV MO TYNGLLKIOY I BT e e Care s 4 ) MHINY EPQYHO TIHEIN KUY NAOHS ENCLIYATS LOJE ONY SMIOLNGO TRNOItMS TFF L et gy - i-lhl."_u_
SNGI o) avo BRIV MBI O HLaBO B WAl L OVIRE Ty —— — —f— O p——e
vl Fav, TFTHJ WO 10 50 OL EVINY TIV A0k SOB40L FRODOLE GV JRULS 0L ¥GLOVMINGD "1} RS g— ——tg— pp—
.
(I VNN € DNROITTON AN S BTl YL i LI LV BUMI0 ORACIY WY DL LOBMON NI QLN CILLYNOSIOcS 8 o) ol e gty
QROBs XVl DMWY NWIOL 0 00U TWVUII0NN 0 O CRVFOMING FIVIVBIVI TIV LVGRNYIL ONY GVC L WOLOVILNGD T8 % oy
TP SV e Lt ]
....... POUSIALLISGS O WORLs N APEAACTS 13 TIY 40 HOLVCLN 102w TEOMt S &OO o] @
S eihizsodled I Iy SNOLKHNCD) O O WYL S WML BSOS b0 E3Cov b - hitonyd
Vi B 5 0 B B Ol | BT SURACTLOND QAL B SVaR FONS oty TS BHL 18 ANVESESB0 B0 AW ENOLIYIABD WOIED JO JHL L LY NRWEVOR VY ——
SINZNFHINDTY ONDHY SSEVACED TREN S0 ASS I 40 SNV B SR NI SR e — fuast
“ZLNNI00 LINEEY L MO AIOMERIOIN PR — JE—— ) anny
. cuon mTma 3 Qe LT TR —— e _-!{ﬂ.._i!
2% LI WY ey g .
L OF 107 WSO LA DO TACIADT TIVHE S CHTVLIG L T .
1894 08 E] o ey NEBLIA ASHYRRsIER] ¥ 0 LNBAN BHL RESCTL X =
nim o] AL VIOV R0 Ok KOVOTIOO OWY WRVALYWY Ec o) Sk [+ =
FUVL00 UM TUACOVE TIERIMOONS N0 BY TENVIHLIN Y QY ETIHAVM LONUIENCD ¥ _ — -
SNOUYINDIY 3Ny W, DirwulD B DL IOl SWNOH I LIVIN —=— Ol il
W DTN ALNNOD NGd ONY TOANGM MILLYH FIRSON S0 WIIONT WINWO AALON —_ —_— Is..ﬂ‘-!
RLLENGH Age 28 EAOLLIY CNY LISBVION “BINYUY ey P8 031 ML OL SO0 agmng
Izl Lo 2y 91 206 CENMADR B MWD WLOLL ONINOZ TR DOt [ IO AMACTVOR BHL 53 ENCLLNC LT 80 3em e kv e
Lo gl g evr IO vl tekat Kk ALY NOLLTINGS Pk R TRLNG) SVl P O WD BHL prsraman oo
o iy SWane A HLLICY LIS RLNIFERSNG B MM BONYCUCIOV H (IKHACRS 18 Tl TOMINCS M4Vl T 7 pae s
Torw oW o oix "t 10T S} veomg B0 - =
TUOLITNLE JO BN oG v Sy pa—"
CNBTH S UTWE VI EYNAL OREOSOM W11 SITUOAY ALY3d0Nd o (RS M ouma ey
G eTD 8 T TR CIRO-S0M ‘AL nabyy by
Lrors wvric ANt SAE0UA TUCIIN 40 LUNEPLIEV ThY OFY AHY Q1 LIS ALIRCUS 48 Ted RIS R0 BuL O SUGHTONN SN Oy SECUL VLD NITRAYLE 2 L il
X 0 L00 DCy L2 T 0 LIS O0THZ HLNOM DL LD QMY ENAN0 TAPOWOORY L M — P
[P IE  VINY SAOVATY OMLLICA WLOL ALMNGD ALY T, 50 FLZLIBLOT WIS LN IR S0 10 G B 3 TRSueval Ladech R 28Tonig LD SO MELIOD Bl LY ENCUVILATIS Lt PR S TR
el e VI ALNNGS ALl A A0S 20 ALY O EBOVIVV) AMY NOUYLAOCR MO TYACAIM 20 KAMOHE LON ERUNLYRLLE OWy BB ALTLLN el
(s ok coxree EsanOt AR CHLLEDD e R e e TI LORLOWS TIAELA TIY 40 KLIIO ONY MOLLYD0T LOVKE ToMILLITA DNNIRALLIO WOul %
L) 5V 1V A0 ' HOLLKGOY HL> MOMBAIOITHE Hifvid SEBMARE 9t L. LT LU0 THIONOVET 3 UOLIVALLIOD MOLLIMLLINGE) DHIVIO AVWESEIIN S EUPOVOW AL HUM &= ] ¥ad
S b T S 7k Ty NOILdIMO530 ALY3d08d ALVWICHOOD OHY FILLALLOY NOLLITULINO; A CHINMIDDN OL VOB FVITAONM ALMILT AMLCN 'L
SNOLLYIND WD JLS 3Sva FE=Ea]
SZLON TVHINID




002D eayg

|
j

o
w
o]
S
=z
2]

==k

NV1d NOISNIWIO

NOISNVdX3 T LNV1d AG3 ‘HW

' *ONI ‘SILVIO0SSY ® YIAANS

T A AN
Wl ket

T YMOI “ALID AMOLS
+
T

B0 TIVHE RLNWRACHUSS LU 4O FIRINLLI GNLLIDO QL SEVTTY0 NIV OL Y
Tre

SUR000'CZL onmshia

LR AN W

CILLYIMM NOWYSO LG AL H RIY NWOHE

IFELLIILN BRLL IVRLL LNviRrwiv: LOW SO0 MEHLWNY ARAM BHL OINOONYEY

0 KaANEE b WL VEWY 3HL M EELLILA HONE T BERGIN0D WAOHE TR
TR LVHL TRLMWYWAYYD OM SO NOARANNS SHL TINVLS0 BOWOOTY NODNNY
NOUVRIOSS AdAl ity WOl SLIVIOT RERE BAYH RO SBUNLN BHL

5 i
[
1
[
i
i Iemogvmainun v
’ __h SILON TYHINID NYTd NOISNIWID

aae. wey| 500 dermemc| T WD ko

wrwaarnu | e LT
Sy
B ELETGD AL W34 Y

00ZD ieays

[a ] am
parry




00ED leeys

HYBOeU(T) g

ERLY IPSESVE

(. 4
[T1]
a
S
z
1]

'"ONI ‘S3LVIJ0SSY 8 ¥IQANS
NOISNVdX3 Z INV1d AG3 ‘H'N

NY1d TOULNOO NOISON3 ANV ‘HIMIS WHOLS ‘ONIOVYD

sianir e, |
ETD00 VInOE AnTNy
CATR MPOAME ‘M8 (242

VMO 'ALID AHOLS

STBOB0TES nmmkg
e ] Ee
NOWRAI

Lt Red 03 dvphcy| T sswbg
A uo
(-47-90) ANTIOD AL B34 BY
00| ALNINGD AL Md Y

DOED teayg
vl e |

“

Aot
"
E
!

1

i
/
—IL—

e

-

- I - ks ]
& ﬂm — = - — .....‘E "
— .t S [ ——— 2y — — — —— — A = — —_—— R — — —qhar — — Y 7P U —" o —— 3 = — ey —
e = — — i — S b ¥ R A e T awr..vnl-_._ﬂn.r..‘v\l.,\isi.: ,.I\p.||m.
- L
I {1 T

| o

L~ - ATt
||||||||| -
||||||||||||||| - &
oort TG LW
£l DAY ONY DIOTIE
SALLLLNYIO

RO B ©'0 WAL ¥ BUGHIN ALL) BHL (L CRERAG
BV RLEEA BN QL1 CEEEN TS AESVE MOLLNL 30 BH) 40 TPTIOA 3L %

UL DR

) IOMLNGT
WO ML A TSR TV N Y MIRACE QMNOWD
LAY VIRV IR P NP LI iy R LT BV I LNOD

P v Oty HONGW MIRLIY LT Tl O IOMILNGD NORAR ¥

U 48 TR B1VY AV DN

W oev ™ T

CHTLLIND RYIY Th WIAD “TOR0L ROV NOLLMBALAMOD: DMAND
WEISOME A LLOTAMD Y (LS MO VIRt T CLL L0 GERE A T

“Rpvent Faknas €11 H.LKY 5 Fuirery O CYIRIERY CRITRM B0
A3 B QL1 vy Thv ot RO B0 WY oS O WOLSWRLWGS 'L

$310N ONIOYHD




E;Eil!ig.ﬂlﬂl.—iii .

HYBOBOTTL i paiied

N vt e
AL MO VS LI ¥ 0L LIS vy v 1 B e Srestl
o. ggio{hil‘lgi
« i%i.‘!i!g!

ALINEIOD G TOVIGLE K IV W SRLINIEVA AMVLINVE AMNAOJPELL
M NS0 VUM U MOV TRAMIMLO CRLCH TR s B
A

A0wa Timw HSweh WY

'"ONI 'S3LVIO0SSY ® ¥IQANS

I
2004 rintn ' AEDRY
OATN MERDANE "MW'E LT

. v
LV B £LNERACUS WO
LI B L
MG BRI | ek}
ayTvLma TOMLNOD
"KLY e
5 SOl L VAlal) 0L L ZNIO) SV CNV-TRCVAID WA ML
HOVIN FYTRY TY WOOH 1Y el 1) (OO HOL W W08 LY YOMLHED
WOrSOME TAY LT I WO TINNEYIRY WRLADD AR TV e §

ORISR TSN MO ENOALIY TSV TV

O LTI SR W3 HAWVH 0 YR At BACHER TS

CPNOMDMIICIN MO SAYMECVIINAEY “Drivncicl “SAwainas) ‘LN E
[t

W EY NS EIRNEYE WALNOD LAIFROIN e Y LTI TIEN ‘§

NOISNVdX3 T LNV1d AH3 'H'IN
£
A

€11 DALY ILNGON O §ANSIRIRNTOI TYNOLLICOY WO osfebil) JOLL (L M
TRl v 1 ) Tl WO NS $4OLLITT IO WL PRAOLE B

.

ALY LA ML SR IV T REMNIVIA TOMUNOO NOMSONS

L MW LW 1L BTV L e SN TYROULIKIIY L
O LI ok LIV v Er. Th L RLH WO LA 0TI WL RO

dah el pg—— —— g =4

2] om el ==Y umoi'ALD ANOLS NV 1d TONLNOD NOISONS NV ‘HAMIS WNOLS ‘ONIGVHD

|
|
I
i
|
-
g
|
|
|1 — R T S S U
} WA P 40 SUSPRRACY T B a0
3 4 PRI IV EaSVALNCORIM T DY MOLVALLAO0 VUENED BUL fram
S | B ARSI NOLLDMLOtA TYLMEANOARAND T A NS ¥ SR T P
m == —~ I = TIUALLYY P S000S beL AR VESRTY TRV LW PRI VO
¥ - A | RE € O LIid e ekt eds s MVACIADD IO LTUFONN 841 |
5 m -~ \ | wm S 00 W DO A3 PALOL TN LI BOANHONC VLW NS
m 2 (2l | N7 4 / | g o e » s 403 s
= m m m . NS \ 1 mm (| __ CMMOTION SYIY Hx.ﬁi " T 0 !E-_.lu!.ﬂpq:lll
- m i 4 E ! mn (I v T LA WAL WO Ol IR0 KTy ARBAKALLY IIYNCEVEN 0T
f - \ g __ HOESCACE HLLWA AWV0C CRHBNTIVLED NI FYH MIACD OMricesh “AsnEhaton da'vAsids SO DMV e
Tl 3 U | | MLV VIR PUN VIO S VLNV Y ONILI L9 B0V AN MABALLYA B WY 4O URIVTD T B ARY PRl TR MEIOND
™ 7/ ’ ri I S FVH4 DORCHAIE: HOMOA WLLIY LU IOAL I CRLLACO) MOS0 L om Ten e
- 3 | | g YL 48 MU LY 1Y LAY oAt ) LY ¥ v 0 VRO OSRD TV
- ' | T T TN HEEROUR W IWAY A TVMENIGS CONEN. LR VO ICARON B 4403 PO SO sk L3O L. ACHS NOLITTION ¢
2 = - ! g, B W RTI 10 9L RV WO L Ol £ S POV SRS B T WOBOWD 1 prie LI G i AYREROIN Th L TR WOLIMING)
¥ T s P mmsss= I & L TEIRCNS PO ANY ooy L% llives NYITED 1) B ‘LI
& H - - TR0 FYIMY TIY IO RORI0U T ML MILEND) (s I ] EROMONTM THVLLY 40 LUEIPLLVARD YPRCH B X0 YU
F -4~ PR [ m WERCAT 4 TALDE Y LU MO vt T GL M3 BT AN T AL LTS WD NS P08 Y IO WL T
5 .~ o . IVt g L Hudli) P Peery O Oviadi SEITR MO N
2 ocmm Iy L0 0 L YR TIY D BORE WL o €1, W L) LTIl NSO RV NERLNBATR HOLLITTIGN ¥
2 ﬂmm n m i SILON ONIOYHO S3LON NOLLN3AIHd ROLULNTIOL




gli! i 5205 waoy ‘Ao Aicis | ] i
é g; il 1 .1 F Eﬁﬂm e (A

G100

MH Eby Plant Number 2 Addition
Rich Olive Street

NOLLOMILSNGD HOd IOW L@[N]

T
b et bt P

P SR LI L i H T O

|

Story City, lowa 50248

i
T T . In
as!ihsimi!hi!!imilh :iii!ilihiasigﬁ!z ﬁ%l ih!iiii ! .!!hii

cosdutantsnnnBlany s8000e vaened sHconvpact 30000 16 sstonriunins Sufsll

ool
lu i il Iill!‘i!l!!h HIH !sgﬂi;ﬂ!!; E%iiiisgii!u!:i ! iil!! himiliﬂ

LT 1P :illinnl:tt: evede.anand £ abbe.2ebld, !!:5::! Hrcttosi et ennlahiatiag.

I 1
. I :i!z!hi!!i!!liln s i W,
1y,

ST sdeTabi.cneer o verbadtoaer veedSur adunsl S3I0nals. ol bualobore b

¥
§ bt e bt bbb o

JUPEPRR BT ] TTT TN | ITST) ST PESUNIPOT SOUTTL 111 [TSRTOTS | JOISTNN SR pure T I8 S




aAqoedsia 1SamULON

NOILIQAV ¢ INVid A8 'H'IN




Construction Pay Estimate No. 2

Project Description:

Railroad Crossing Improvements

Date of Contract: July 10, 2023
Contractor: Owner:
Manatt's Inc. City of Story City
Ames, lowa Story City , lowa
Base Contract Price $187,648.20 Materals on Hand $0.00
{See Attached Tab)
Change Orde C1.1 $7,500.00
c2.1 $679.15 Construction Completed to Date $191,844 .70
{See Attached Tab)
Total Amount Earned to Date $191,944 .70
Less Previous Payment $77,958.83
Less Retainage 0.0% $0.00
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE $195,827.35 AMOUNT DUE THIS ESTIMATE $113,985.87
Requested by Coniractor:
W /,‘Z"
e : nacel” _3-27-2023
Manatt's Inc # ille Date
Recommended by Engineer:
8-30-2023
%ﬁz&y -l sy Senior Project Manager
Theresa Stromberg#urphy, P.E. Title Date
Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc.
Approved by Owner:
City of Story City Title Date
Prepared by:
Clapsaddie-Garber Associates
Ames, lowa

CGA Project No. 1709.06



008 - 02 ¥76'16:8 0005 (ST LHIS =7 ST 1205815 STvint
OT0LE ONT TINNONG Relivial g
JOYNVLTY HSINKH QL % Aa3137dn00 $) gaHoLS Q01E3d SNOAIYd 2D0Hd
FINYIVE LINNOWY ATLN3STIHA| SIHL LNNOWY & LNNOWY LIVHINOD
S Wi0L STVIIWA _ SIVI0L e
0035 JCCH %00t S1'6.9% i 61895 b 00 05 Q 5. GLYT 516498 ] £ G 1NG BUURP) HHdN 01 #7p i JRGE SUDFIRaY| (i) |
s Jacs %001 OF D05 48 [ R T 503 ] 00005 1% DDC0SZS | L 51| VeBRar ) wrean AG ATRP 0) 91D UOLIZaou0 UGRpY] ) _ [
JBO SDLBLY
[ K05 V00 | W00 es 3 D0OE TS ! 00CS, 70 % T 7 ToURING) RRRG¥ ] SABOIDId PECINED V-666-0000
o0CS 0005 W%eC) 00 00025 B0 OG0T 0003 0000023 0025 V 3 TOUTE A, 353065 VOs0 L)
05 05 0005 %00t 00005 28 0000545 D0 0% [T TR T =T VOTETION, T
W0 5 T00% %001 [ 1 00 007 25 o0Us oTeIs s J0v0s T T 51 Tanng uGmorITRID)] v0.014
0005 00005 €5 %0 0605 0 w003 0 1305 q 00005TS  Jeovnses . 51 0 M, JORHOWG] V01000
oG 0% ~00Cs WOaL 00 Bar 55 ] oC 827 55 i TICs [ 6P JoCveERls S0 | ov I TUS GURIRI0; BU FR0S [FL0IUBALILY VOICE
00 0% 06 0% %0Ck 00 C00'5S b 0000058 ! [ 0 0000058 Jwocoss : [ T e, AR | V0008
[ tocs 0008 R001 069195 z B00L5% z 5568 0 05195 B0ES H V3 TPUBES| DUN TOGING PORFTS S0e08
[T 0008 Y00t 680128 10t 1680023 0L 0005 0 16 80 23 00 1615 W | vit BUIGUANE A IBAICE SOCTHR [ AL i PO H0200
[T 00 9025 %ECL OC Ft8 £% BES 00 1P9 LS %85 00 08 0 0BLv 15 G5 75 | As TEAODa 1R E) HOVOL
o0 Cs 0008 WOGL 00 0v8S, 0z 0O 0¥ES 0z 0008 i] D0 0¥65 & [+ 75 TBUILUTAR 0 QEDE B0 S0t0L
00 TS 0005 %001 W0OSLES 5C 00 057 €5 GE 0008 00CSL TS %655 2 | A5 D 0L
00 CS BOCs %001 AU OAE 15 75 BODOC 15 Z6 0005 0 0CO0C 15 [poses S %S WIS Jo [RAOLAY L0toL
0C08 00°58S5" %EDL 00561 9§ 0¥ 00564928 EDY o008 4] 0005505 Joovys [T AS L WHH aaseg B0ZCL
0C 05 [ ROOL 09 VIS BZh 09, el B2l C0os 0 FIYILs oo es w2 | L 2V JBEND OUT G| T3 010L
0008 DOCS Fa01 5LTS 1S 3 SLErS1S 15 0TS ] SLZvS L5 [sCoes 5 | As Za0E
00 0% 21618 WiCt 00 P57 115 For) OIS 36¢ 00TS 0 LTS IS Jooxis er | AS T2
08 ©9 00E 2% %0 [ 0 DOTs 0 W [ CHO0E¢E 5P Ve 8 | A8 EXH
[EEH 0005 0G| BCTIr 15 58 [ o9 3008 0 [CE LTl LY % | A0 WOLOE ‘0L S3TE) wONEATIR| 0107
2 UOTRIAG - HUAS DROIS
o008 [ %00% 00003 28 1 0605 0 T0005 25 T 000523 Joo 005 2% T 5% FoVRINSU| Aqer] RAISaT0Id PROIREH| V5680000
w0 0TS %00 0000025 1 0005 0 0C 000 28 L 0C C00 25 000 15 T 51 FOUREA, AIBIRAED V00 1)
0005 20°CS %00+ 0000525 00 05 0 00 205 £5 ! 000525 0005 LS v 3 WO 051
o0 00C3 0D C0005 25 0005 0 [T ! 00005 TS Jpones TS T 5% Tprng LomnnsuoD) VOLELL
0005 00 %S 00+ DOOOS EE 536§ [ 00C0S €X T 00005 £5 mua.qm T 5t WO ORI V0.0 0t
o008 ] 004S HOOL 0062755 S0 00 627 55 50 0acs 0 Goezrss  [powssvis  [s0 av Ton i st BUZIFU®) Bu POSS [RUOIURALGS) vOLG6
0008 00 08 WOOT 0G 005§ [ 1] 00TO0'SS 1 ogoo0ss  Joorores B 5" o)) Sl ) Askdduia -0
B0 [5%53 %001 009195 z I3 (¥ 009153 T 009165 Joosoes T va wpuada pus 1eauds ety ©-02C8
D0CS oC 0% QUL T FER S EZ L 00Ts 7 EL Y2725 £Z L Vi SUOLIEM, PIng] UBTH SBUDUTY isuaNe g peiiE] a8
T0CS 00EZrs- | W6OL WSS BET 50°D: FTIES [ 15 TEAGLEY 1A HOVC/
00Ts 00258 %if 00020028 20 60T 00'020°028 H0E AS L WH Tea Ak 8020
T0Ts DO¥LiS | %EOL B0 w15 65 PLL 53 DORLGES vik i) 2 "0 J2n5 DUk G I0L0L
00Cs 001235 | iUt T0 069 65 OEY 00035 DA06H 63 OEy A5 I TOL0Z
00CS 0005 2001 S [ 0005 & DS ELE LS 3] A5 S0LCE
0005 00 05 %00% TOEEL 55 65 0655 0 DILE! 55 55 CEAS G =) X H
V UGIAK - J9ARE LOTBUTHEEM
09) |too)| JVAOL | 505 | (snnonv aoniad zo_.,_»oé_ X _._RZm, 2 |Nouvondav
(o0.0) [HSNFOL| % |OSMOLSONV 5 00 | ) oo LR SIHL g SNOIATHD P i | 110 [sunn SHOM 40 NOLLAINIS 30
2ovNIvIINE SONVIVE 01T LINOD Tv10L |ALNISINd SHL INOOWY § INNOWY ANNOWY ALD TVEOL LOVELNGD LINN S
INNOHY STVRRELYN $ Wi01
$wiOL
GALITHGN0D
Y D d ] N N 3 r [ | i H 9 | ] als g | ON LAk | v
SZOT/L8 /M0 - £COT/AT/LE ‘0COIEAd HOS S06L91 Nd
£20Z/2/8  31V0A NOILYOIITddY Sudwanosdw) Sussa) peolyey [
T# ‘ON NOILYDITddY LIVHLINOGD 321Md LINN
L 30 I ‘39vd LNSWAYC HOd NOILYINddY




N 2120 E. 13th St.

"A TT Ames, Towa 50010
"A ’ INC. wWww. manatts.com

8/22/2023

Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc

1523 South Bell Ave, Suite 101

Ames, [A 50010

Re: Story City Railroad Improvements Regrading on Broad Street

Dear Theresa,

L am requesting a change order for the regrading and additional hydrosceding at
the Broad Street railroad tracks on the southeast side.

We completed our backfilting and installed the hydrosceding on the southeast side
of the Broad Street tracks on 8-15-2023 alicr that Union Pacilic took their equipment

across the backfill and hydroseeded areas and newly paved concerete sidewalks and
created ruts in the backfill arcas.

I am requesting an additional $1,650.11 for the regrading and additional hydrosceding ol
the disturbed arcas on the southeast side of the Broad Street tracks.

Sincercly,

0%

David I'yrpak
Project Manager

Phone = 515-233-2005  Fax » 515-232-8741



CHANGE ORDER NO. 3

PROIJECT DESCRIPTION: Railroad Crossing Improvements CHANGE ORDER SUMMARY

PROIJECT NUMBER: 1679

DATE OF CONTRACT: July 10, 2023 NET CHANGE THIS ORDER (+ OR -): $1,650.11
OWNER: City of Story City REVISED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE:

CONTRACTOR: Manatt's, Inc.

CHANGE ORDER NO. XX

1TEM $ AMOUNT INCREASE OR

NOD DESCRIPTION OF WORK QUANTITY UNITS UNIT COST DECREASE

C02.2 Regrading and hydroseeding on Broad Street 1.00 LS 1,650.11 $1,650.11
NET CHANGE THIS ORDER {(+ OR -):| & 1,650.11
NET CHANGES PREVIOUS ORDERS:| $ 8,179.15
TOTAL NET CHANGES TO DATE:| § 9,829.26

RIOR APPROVED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE: 8/15/2023

DAYS INCREASED OR DECREASED: 0.00
REVISED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE;
REQUESTED BY CONTRACTOR APPROVED BY OWNER

a/ "

David TyrpaX, Project Manager
Manatt's, Inc. City of Story City, lowa

RECOMMENDED BY ENGINEER

hoan Pl
Theresa Strombefg-Murpy, PIE.

Clapsaddie-Garber Associates, Inc.

QGA oAGE 107 2



Change Order No. 2

To: City of Story City

From: ISG

Date: August 31st, 2023

Subject: Carousel Field Fencing Project
DESCRIPTION

Change Order No. 2 includes the following changes:

- Scoreboard Adjustments
o As requested by the City, the scoreboard will be relocated approximately 20" down the first base line to provide
a better line of sight to the scoreboard. The relocation will include removal of the existing scoreboard from the
supports and disconnecting the electrical components. After the scoreboard is removed, new supports will be
installed in the location determined by the city and the existing scoreboard will be mounted to the new
supports. The scoreboard electrical components will be connected to allow the scoreboard to function in the
new location.

- Field Light Utility Box
o When installing the third base dugout, the location of the Field Light Utility Box was different from the plan
location. The existing location of the utility box lands in the concrete slab directly behind the third base dugout.
To ensure protection of the wiring and components inside of the utility box, the material was changed from the

exiting green plastic to a Quazite box. The Quazite box will provide adequate strength to protect all items
housed inside.

- Fence Topper

o The Poly-Cap Fence Topper standard color is safety yellow, to match the existing red fence topper along the
outfield fence, the Poly-Cap Fence Topper will be changed to red in color.



CHANGE ORDER NO.: 02

Owner: City of Story City Owner’s Project No.:

Engineer; ISG Engineer’s Project No.: 21-25690
Contractor: Minturn, Inc. Contractor’s Project No.:

Project: Carousel Field Fencing Project

Contract Name:

Date Issued: August 16, 2023 Effective Date of Change Order: August 21, 2023

The Contract is modified as follows upon execution of this Change Order:

Description:
a. Light Pole Wility Box
i. Due to the location and material of the existing electrical utility box for the stadium light pole, the
material of the utility box will be switched to increase strength and protect the fixtures inside, when
poured in concrete.
b. Scoreboard
i. Incudes all work to remove existing scoreboard, disconnect the electric connection, remove existing
support posts and footing, install new footings and supports, reinstall existing scoreboard, install new
electrical to make connections and move the scoreboard.,
c. Fence Topper
i. Includes the change in price for the Poly-Cap Fence Topper to be red in color.
Attachments:
Change in Contract Times
[State Contract Times as either a specific date or a number
Change in Contract Price of days)

Original Contract Price:

S 259,895.00

Original Contract Times:

Substantial Completion: April 1, 2024

Ready for final payment: May 1, 2024

(Increase] from previously approved Change Orders 1 to No. 1

s 2,134.00

{Increase] [Decrease] from previously approved Change
Orders N/A to No. N/A:

Substantial Completion: 0 Days

Ready for final payment: 0 Days

Contract Price prior to this Change Order:

s 302,029.00

Contract Times prior to this Change Order:
Substantial Completion: April 1, 2024

Ready for final payment: May 1, 2024

Increase this Change Order:

$ 855219

[Increase) [Decrease] this Change Order:

Contract Price incorporating this Change Order:

$ 310,581.91

Substantial Completion: 0 Days
Ready for final payment: 0 Days

Contract Times with all approved Change Orders:
Substantial Completion: April 1, 2024
Ready for final payment: May 1, 2024

EICDC® C-941, Change Order EJCDC® C-941, Change Order, Rev.1.
Copyright® 2018 National Soclety of Professional Engineers, American Council of Engineering Companies
and American Society of Civil Engineers. All rights reserved.
Page1ofl



Recommended by Engineer (if required) Accepted by Contractor

By:

Title:  Civil Engineering Group Leader

Date: July 18, 2023

Authorized by Owner Approved by Funding Agency (if applicable)

By:
Title:

Date:

EJCDC® C-941, Change Order EICDC® C-941, Change Order, Rev.1.
Copyright® 2018 National Society of Professional Engineers, American Councll of Engineering Companies
and American Soclety of Civil Engineers. All rights reserved.
Page 2 of 2



( I | ] City of Story City, IA

Vendor Name

Department: 1110 - POLICE DEPARTMENT
MET LIFE SMALL BUS CNTR

WELLMARK

WINDSTREAM

KARL FORD

KARL FORD

Department: 1150 - FIRE DEPARTMENT
LESTER REFRIGERATION
BLACK HILLS ENERGY

Department: 1160 - FIRST RESPONDERS
BOUND TREE MEDICAL LLC
HOKEL MACHINE SUPPLY

Department: 1190 - ANIMAL CONTROL
HEARTLAND PET HOSPITAL

Department: 2210 - STREET/ROADWAY MAINT
MET LIFE SMALL BUS CNTR
WELLMARK

GRIMES ASPHALT & PAVING
JOHNSON REPAIR

IA DEPT TRANSPORTATION

1A DEPT TRANSPORTATION
BLACK HILLS ENERGY
MENARDS COMMERCIAL CAPI
VAN WALL

VAN WALL

VAN WALL

VAN WALL

ZIEGLER

Department: 2250 - SNOW & ICE
1A DEPT TRANSPORTATION

Department: 4410 - LIBRARY
WELLMARK

WELLMARK

AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
THE AMES TRIBUNE

EARLY BIRD WINDOW WASHI
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES

Description [Payable)

ADED COVERAGE

GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
PHONE/POLICE
parts/service

warrantee work, oil change

ice machine repairs
GAS SERVICE

medical supplies, PPE
oxygen

impound fees

ADSD COVERAGE

GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
cold mix

mower blades

beads reflectorize, snow fenc
beads reflectorize, snow fenc
GAS SERVICE

monthly bill/receipts

Misc parts

Misc parts

Misc parts

Misc parts

loader

beads reflectorize, snow fenc

GROUP HEALTH/OENTAL
GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
books

books

books

books

books

books

Books

books

newspaper subscription
cleaning

books

books

Books

CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT

By Segment (Select Below)
Payable Dates 8/21/2023 - 9/1/2023

Amount

144.00

5,558.89

76.74

822.59

71.38

Department 1110 - POLICE DEPARTMENT Total: 6,673.60

237.50
38.25
Department 1150 - FIRE DEPARTMENT Total: 275.75

427.52
54.30
Department 1160 - FIRST RESPONDERS Total: 481.82

200.32
Department 1190 - ANIMAL CONTROL Total: 200.32

48.00
2,678.07
310.50
71.75
194.04
270.40
35.26
49,95
25.70
39.79
335.90
562.55
3,316.02
Department 2210 - STREET/ROADWAY MAINT Total: 7,937.93

911.15
Department 2250 - SNOW & ICE Total: 911.15

404.79
134.93
8.03
15.95
22.57
8.99
12.99
10.54
24.99
16.99
278.40
80.00
123.37
16.98
14.25

9/1/2023 2:16:50 PM

Page 1 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT
Vendor Name

AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES
HINSON CONSULTING, LLC
HINSON CONSULTING, LLC
CENTER POINT PUBLISHING
CENTER POINT PUBLISHING
CENTER POINT PUBLISHING
BAKER & TAYLOR

BAKER & TAYLOR

BAKER & TAYLOR

BAKER & TAYLOR

BAKER & TAYLOR

BAKER & TAYLOR

BAKER & TAYLOR

BAKER & TAYLOR

SABRINA GOGERTY

STORY CITY SPACE CENTER
CONVERSE CONDITIONED AIR
STATE HISTORICAL SOCIETY O
AUREON COMMUNICATIONS
GALE/CENGAGE LEARNING
INGRAM LIBRARY SERVICES
INGRAM LIBRARY SERVICES
SOUTH BAMILTON RECORD-N
VISA/BERTHA BARTLETT
VISA/BERTHA BARTLETT

Department: 4330 - PARKS
MET LIFE SMALL BUS CNTR
WELLMARK

ULINE

ANGELA HALLADAY

BLACK HILLS ENERGY

JOE LUCAS

MENARDS COMMERCIAL CAPI
VAN WALL

Department: 4440 - RECREATION DEPARTMENT

MET LIFE SMALL BUS CNTR
ARNOLD MOTOR SUPPLY
AMERICAN RED CROSS
MENARDS COMMERCIAL CAP|
NEVADA PARKS AND REC

Department: 4445 - SWIMMING PQGOL
JOE LUCAS

ACCO UNLIMITED

ACCO UNLIMITED

BLACK HILLS ENERGY

BLACK HILLS ENERGY

MENARDS COMMERCIAL CAPI

Department: 5540 - PLANNING AND ZONING
FOX ENGINEERING ASS0C, IN
FOX ENGINEERING ASS0C, IN
FOX ENGINEERING ASSOC, IN

Department: 6300 - PARTIAL SELF FUNDING
BENEFITS INC

Description (Payable)

Books
employment
employment
books

baoks

books

baoks

baoks

baoks

books

books

books

books

books
cleaning
August rent
inspection
subscription
phone

books

books

books

BBPL subscription
programming
programming

AD&D COVERAGE
GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
cleaning supplies
Cleaning C/H August
GAS SERVICE
reimbursement- parts
monthly bill/receipts
Misc parts

AD&D COVERAGE
Pain sprayer CO2
CPR Training
monthly bill freceipts
CIRL fees

reimbursement- parts
pool chemicals/supplies
pool chemicals/supplies
GAS SERVICE

GAS SERVICE

monthly bill/receipts

site plan reviews
site plan reviews
site plan reviews

Claims/010-0041

Payable Dates: 8/21/2023 - 9/1/2023

Department 4410 - LIBRARY Total:

Department 4430 - PARKS Total:

Department 4440 - RECREATION DEPARTMENT Total:

Department 4445 - SWIMMING POOL Total:

Department 5540 - PLANNING AND ZONING Total:

Amount

36.57
100.00
100.00

83.13
139.02

30.71

45.53

-2.51

65.54

£6.11

70.08
175.77

32.35

90.69
300.00

60.00
150.73

24.95

79.16
349.48
547.80

11.49

32.00
300.00

48.00

4,110.37

32.00
395.30
121.83
100.00

35.26

8.51
116.76
9.54
819.20

16.00
36.95
140.00
167.16
650.00

1,010.11

8.23
581.70
393,80

48.56
418,97
43.02

1,494.28

417.50
740.75
1,394.50
2,552.75

140.00

9/1/2023 2:16:50 PM

Page 2 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT
Vendor Name

BENEFITS INC

Department: 6611 - EXECUTIVE (MAYQOR, ADM)

MET LIFE SMALL 8US CNTR
WELLMARK

Department: 6620 - FINANCIAL AD {CLERK,TREA)

MET LIFE SMALL BUS CNTR
PETTY CASH

WELLMARK

WELLMARK
SIMMERING-CORY

RK DIXON

STAPLES

Department: 6650 - CITY HALL/SENIOR CENTER

WELLMARK

EARLY BIRD WINDOW WASHI
EARLY BIRD WINDOW WASHI
ANGELA HALLADAY

BLACK HILLS ENERGY

Department: 6670 - DATA PROCESSING

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC
DELL MARKETING LP

Department: 8761 - CAPITAL PROJECT

MANATTS INC
EMERGENT ARCHITECTURE
EMERGENT ARCHITECTURE

Department: 8766 - WATER MAIN IMPROVEMENTS

KELLER EXCAVATING

Department: 8779 - WASTEWATER TREATMENT

MSA PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Department: 9211 - STORM DRAINAGE

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC

Department: 9810 - WATER UTILITY

IOWA DEPT OF NATURAL RES
MET LIFE SMALL BLS CNTR
WELLMARK

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC
USA BLUE BOOK

USA BLUE BOOK

USA BLUE BOOK

BIG STATE INDUSTRIAL SUPPL
BIG STATE INDUSTRIAL SUPPL
SAM, LLC

FERGUSON WATERWORKS #2
BLACK HILLS ENERGY
MENARDS COMMERCIAL CAPI
STORY CITY POSTMASTER
SEILER INSTRUMENT & MFG.

Description (Payable)
Group health

AD&D COVERAGE
GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL

AD&D COVERAGE

Postage

GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
licenses, permits, fiscal mana
XEROX parts + service

office supplies

GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
window cleaning
window cleaning
Cleaning C/H August
GAS SERVICE

TYLER CONVERSION
computer

Pay App 1 RR Crossing Improv
design
design

Pay app 4 RR Crossing Improv

WWTF Phase (|

TYLER CONVERSION

Construction permit for lining
AD&D COVERAGE

GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
TYLER CONVERSION

supplies

supplies

supplies

tools

supplies

professional GPS/GIS services
meters

GAS SERVICE

monthly bill/receipts

WATER UTILITY BILLS

parts

Payable Dates: 8/21/2023 - 9/1/2023

Department 6300 - PARTIAL SELF FUNDING Total:

Department 6611 - EXECUTIVE {(MAYOR, ADM) Total:

Department 6620 - FINANCIAL AD (CLERK.TREA) Total:

Department 6650 - CITY HALL/SENIOR CENTER Total:

Department 6670 - DATA PROCESSING Total:

Department 8761 - CAPITAL PROJECT Total:

Department 8766 - WATER MAIN IMPROVEMENTS Total:

Department 8779 - WASTEWATER TREATMENT Total:

Department 9211 - STORM DRAINAGE Total:

Amount

144.00
284.00

16.00
1,681.39

1,697.39

128.00
144.69
1,681.39
1,656.39
613.00
436.87
212.22

4,872.56

169.42
250.00
250.00
262.50

42.09
974.01

20.00
990.49

1,010.49

77,958.83
20,611.00

63,052.02

161,621.85

166,255.41

166,255.41

106,480.00

106,420.00

8.00
8.00

100.00
32.00
1,851.25
176.00
99.45
204.86
155.48
376.94
263.76
2,950.00
480.00
35.26
443.50
246.81
7,093.52

9/1/2023 2:16:50 PM

Page 3 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT
Vendor Name

AGSOURCE LABORATORIES

Department: 9815 - SEWER UTLITY
MET LIFE SMALL BUS CNTR
WELLMARK

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC
CENTRAL PUMP & MOTOR
CENTRAL PUMP & MOTOR
ACCUJET LLC

BLACK HILLS ENERGY

STORY CITY POSTMASTER

Description {Payable)
DW Coliform

AD&D COVERAGE

GROUP HEALTH/DENTAL
TYLER CONVERSION

Work to pump WWTP
Work to pump WWTP

Yr 5 annual clean & televise
GAS SERVICE

WATER UTILITY BiLLS

Payable Dates: 8/21/2023 - 9/1/2023
Amount

14.50
Department 9810 - WATER UTILITY Total: 14,623.33

32.00

1,951.25

186.00

2,461.38

578.23

23,942.39

3693

246.81

Department 9815 - SEWER UTLITY Total: 29,444.9%

Grand Total: 513,739.31

9f1/2023 2:16:50 PM

Page 4 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT

Fund Summary
Fund
001 - GENERAL FUND
033 - GILBERT PUBLIC LIBRARY
110 - ROAD USE TAX
115 - PARTIAL SELF FUNDING
316 - WATER PROJECTS
327 - WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT
329 - RR CROSSINGS PROJECT
333 - LIBRARY EXPANSION PROJECT
600 - WATER UTILITY
610 - SEWER UTILITY
740 - STORM WATER DRAINAGE

Grand Total:

Account Summary

Account Number
001-1110-6150
001-1110-6332
001-1110-6373
001-1150-6320
001-1150-6371
001-1160-6507
001-1190-6413
001-4410-6150
001-4410-6320
001-4410-6373
001-4410-6490
001-4410-6500
001-4410-6502
001-4410-6506
001-4410-6770
001-4410-6771
001-4410-6772
001-4410-6773
001-4430-6150
001-4430-6320
001-4430-6330
001-4430-6371
001-4430-6498
001-4430-6507
001-4440-6150
001-4440-6320
001-4440-6413
001-4445-6320
001-4445-6332
001-4445-6371
001-4445-6507
001-5540-6490
001-6611-6150
001-6620-6150
001-6620-6490
001-6620-6506
001-6620-6508
001-6650-6150
001-6650-6320
001-6650-6371
001-6670-6450
001-6670-6504

Account Name
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
VEHICLE REPAIR & MAIN
TELEPHONE

BUILDING & GROUNDS
UTILITIES

MISC. OPERATING SUPP
PAYMENTS TO OTHER A
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
BUILDING & GROUNDS
TELEPHONE
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
PROGRAMMING
TECHNOLOGY

OFFICE SUPPLIES
MAGAZINES

AUDIO

BOOKS

VIDEO

INSURANCE, GROUP HE
BUILDING & GROUNDS
MOTOR VEHICLE MAINT
UTILITIES
CONTRACTUAL SERVICES
MISC. OPERATING SUPP
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
BUILDING & GROUNDS
PAYMENTS TO OTHER A
BUILDING & GROUNDS
VEHICLE REPAIR & MAIN
UTILITIES

MISC, OPERATING SUPP
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
OFFICE SUPPLIES

PETTY CASH/POSTAGE
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
BUILDING & GROUNDS
UTILITIES
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
MINOR EQUIPMENT

Payment Amount
25,845.88
326.77
8,849.08
284.00
166,255.41
106,480.00
77,958.83
83,663.02
14,623.33
29,444.99
8.00
513,739.31

Payment Amount
5,702.89
893.97
76.74
237.50
38.25
4381.82
200.32
404.79
590.73
79.16
100.00
8.03
300.00
137.62
335.35
24,99
1,750.39
52.54
427.30
125.27
9.54
35.26
100.00
121.83
16.00
204.11
750.00
43.02
8.23
467.53
975.50
2,552.75
1,657.39
3,465.78
613.00
649.09
144.69
169.42
762.50
42.09
20.00
990.49

Payable Dates: 8/21/2023 - 9/1/2023
Report Summary

9/1/2023 2:16:50 PM

Page 5 of &6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT

Account Number
033-4410-6150
033-4410-6490
033-4410-6502
033-4410-6772
110-2210-6150
110-2210-6331
110-2210-6350
110-2210-6371
110-2210-6499
110-2210-6504
110-2210-6526
110-2250-6504
115-6300-6150
316-8766-6798
327-8779-6490
329-8761-6798
333-8761-6798
600-9810-6150
600-9810-6210
600-9810-6371
600-9810-6419
600-9810-6490
600-9810-6499
600-9810-6504
600-9810-6507
600-9810-6520
610-9815-6150
610-9815-6350
610-9815-6371
610-9815-6419
610-9815-6490
740-9211-6490

Project Account Key

t#None“

Account Summary

Account Name
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
TECHNOLOGY
BCOOKS
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
MOTOR VEHICLE OPER.
EQUIPMENT REPAIR &
UTILITIES
MISCELLANEQUS
MINOR EQUIPMENT
ROAD MAINT. SUPPLIES
MINOR EQUIPMENT
{NSURANCE, GROUP HE
CAPITAL PROJECT
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
CAPITAL PROJECT
CAPITAL PROJECT
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
DUES & SUBSCRIPTIONS
UTILITIES
DATA PROCESSING
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
MISCELLANEQUS
MINOR EQUIPMENT
MISC. OPERATING SUPP
METERS, CLAMPS, HYDR
INSURANCE, GROUP HE
EQUIPMENT REPAIR &
UTILITIES
DATA PROCESSING
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
PROFESSIONAL SERVICE
Grand Total:

Project Account Summary

Grand Total:

Payment Amount
134.93
100.00

48.00
43.84
2,726.07
65.49
3,723.67
35.26
243.99
562.55
580.90
911.15
284.00
166,255.41
106,480.00
77,958.83
83,663.02
1,983.25
100.00
35.26

422 81
14.50
376.94
263.76
542.95
10,883.86
1,983.25
3,039.61
36.93
442.81
23,942.39
8.00
513,739.31

Payment Amount

513,739.31

513,739.31

Payable Dates: 8/21/2023 - 9/1/2023

9/1/2023 2:16:50 PM

Page 6 of 6



	Agenda
	Minutes
	Ordinance 339
	Ordinance 340
	Administrative Items
	Bills & Claims

