504 Broad Street 4 Story City, 1A 50248

S | |
| I ® CityofStoryCiry.org
‘ 515.733.2121
E: 7

IL.

HIg

IV.

VL

COUNCIL AGENDA
MONDAY, AUGUST 21, 2023 - 6:00 P.M.
CITY HALL - SECOND FLOOR

CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL, 6:00 P.M.

APPROVE/AMEND THE AGENDA

APPROVAL OF THE AUGUST 7, 2023 REGULAR MEETING
MINUTES

CITIZEN APPEARANCE:

A}  Scandia West Condominium Association
B)

LEGAL ITEMS:

A)  Resolution No. 23-61 — Setting Date for Public Hearing on Urban
Renewal Plan Amendment for the Story City Consolidated Urban
Renewal Area

B)  Resolution No. 23-62 — Approving the City of Story City’s
Participation in the Revitalize lowa’s Sound Economy (RISE)
Program — Local Development Funding — for Roadway Improvements

C)  Resolution No. 23-63 — Approving Release of Mortgage Lien (COAD
Enterprises LLC) and Authorizing the Mayor and City Clerk to
Execute Same on Behalf of the City

D)  Ordinance No. 339 - Amending Chapter 156 (Building Codes) of the
Code of Ordinances, Second Reading

E)  Ordinance No. 340 — Clarifying Services Charges and Rates for
Service by Amending Sections 92.01 and 92.02 of the Code of
Ordinances, Second Reading

F)

ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS:

A)  Approve Site Plan for B&L Properties [-35 Industrial Park Building
B)  Approve Construction Project Submittals:

1. Construction Pay Application No. 3 for the Water Main
Improvement Project

» Home of the 1913 Herschell-Spillman Antique Carousel «



VIL

VIIL

IX.

XL

2. Construction Pay Application No. 1 for the Railroad Crossing

Improvements Project

3. Change Orders No. 1 and 2 for the Railroad Crossing
Improvements Project

4

C)  Review Financial Highlights for Fiscal Year 2022-23

D)

PERMITS:

A)

MAYOR & CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEMS:

A)  Hearing on Vicious Dog — Lynn Dahlsten and Jenna Wishteyah
839 Hillcrest Dr., #2

B)  Request to have Chickens: Travis Campbell — 711 4% St.

C)  Sidewalk Improvement Applications:
1. Jennifer and James Schroeder — 312 Elm Ave
2.

D)  Mayor Appointment to the Library Board of Trustees, Subject
to Approval by the City Council

E)  Schedule Next City Council Meeting

F)

APPROVAL OF BILLS AND CLAIMS

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL COMMENTS REGARDING
NON-AGENDA ITEMS

ADJOURNMENT



STORY CITY, IOWA August 7, 2023

Mayor Jensen called the council meeting to order on Monday August 7, 2023, at 6:00 p.m. at
City Hall.

Present: Mayor Jensen, Administrator Jackson
Council Members: Phillips, O’Connor, and Sporleder
Absent: CM Ostrem, Solberg

Also Present: Tyler Fredriksen and Nicole Englehardt, EDC; Shannon McKinley, GCC; Becky
Senti, Betty Grinde, Mary Harris, Chris and Dash Isebrand, Scout Troupe 101

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by O’Connor, to amend the agenda to remove administrative
item Review Financial Highlights for Fiscal Year 2022-23 until next meeting.

Aye: Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Motion by O’Connor, seconded by Phillips, to approve the July 17, 2023 regular meeting
minutes.

Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

CITIZEN APPEARANCE
Dash Isebrand and Chris Isebrand appeared for Scout Troupe 101 for the Civic Merit Badge

Betty Grinde asked about the library bids. The mayor and city administrator explained that the
library board voted to recommend to the city council to that they reject the library bids.
Administrator Jackson gave a brief explanation on the financial shortfall and the process of
moving forward.

LEGAL ITEMS

A) Resolution No. 23-59 — Rejecting Bids for the for the Bertha Bartlett
Public Library — Addition & Renovation Phase 2 Project
Motion by O’Connor, seconded by Sporleder to approve Resolution No. 23-59 —
Rejecting Bids for the for the Bertha Bartlett Public Library — Addition &
Renovation Phase 2 Project
Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder
Nay: None
Motion Carried.

B) Resolution No. 23-60 — Setting a Public Hearing on the Environmental Review for
the Proposed Application for a State Revolving Loan Fund (SRF) for the
Construction of a New Wastewater Treatment Plant
Motion by Sporleder, seconded by Phillips, to approve Resolution No. 23-60 —



C)

D)

A)

B)

A)

Setting a Public Hearing on the Environmental Review for the Proposed
Application for a State Revolving Loan Fund (SRF) for the Construction of a New
Wastewater Treatment Plant. The public hearing will be held on Sept. 18" at 6
p.m.

Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Ordinance No. 339 — Amending Chapter 156 (Building Codes) of the

Code of Ordinances, First Reading

Motion by Phillips, seconded by O’Connor, to approve Ordinance No. 339 —
Amending Chapter 156 (Building Codes) of the Code of Ordinances, First
Reading

Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Ordinance No. 340 — Clarifying Services Charges and Rates for
Service by Amending Sections 92.01 and 92.02 of the Code of
Ordinances, First Reading

Administrator Jackson reported that clarifying the language will simplify
interpretation.

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by Phillips, to approve
Ordinance No. 340 — Clarifying Services Charges and Rates for
Service by Amending Sections 92.01 and 92.02 of the Code of
Ordinances, First Reading

Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

ADMINISTRATIVE ITEMS

Approve Construction Pay Application No. 2 for the 2023 Street

Improvements Project

Motion by O’Connor, seconded by Phillips, to approve construction pay application No.
2 to Manatt”s for $105,718.

Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Review Financial Highlights for Fiscal Year 2022-23
Did not review, will be placed on the agenda for August 21%.

MAYOR & CITY COUNCIL AGENDA ITEMS

Request from GCC to Close Pennsylvania Avenue from Broad Street
to the Alley on September 7%
Motion by Phillips, seconded by O’Connor, to approve Request from GCC to Close



B)

C)

Pennsylvania Avenue from Broad Street to the Alley on September 71"
Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Request from EDC for Funding to Upgrade Interstate 35 Business

Park Sign.

Tyler Fredericksen, EDC, reviewed the proposed improvements and funding
request.

Motion by Phillips, seconded by O’Connor, to approve $4000 allocation to the
EDC for the Request for Funding to Upgrade Interstate 35 Business Park Sign
Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

Sidewalk Improvement Applications:

1. Roger Pohlman — 831 Maple Court

2. Jane Stowe — 203 Pennsylvania Avenue

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by Phillips, to approve Sidewalk improvement
applications by Roger Pohlman — 831 Maple Court and Jane Stowe — 203 Pennsylvania
Avenue

Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

APPROVAL OF BILLS AND CLAIMS

Motion by Sporleder, seconded by O’Connor, to approve bills and claims.
Aye Phillips, O’Connor, Sporleder

Nay: None

Motion Carried.

MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL COMMENTS REGARDING
NON-AGENDA ITEMS

¢ (M O’Connor reported that the baseball fence project has started

There being no further business before council, the meeting adjourned at 6:10 p.m.

ATTEST:

Heather Slifka, City Clerk Mike Jensen, Mayor



l ///%I\l 504 Broad Street a Story City, IA 50248

@ CityofStoryCity.org

\S“'y Ciw 515.733.2121
[ 4

To: The Honorable Mayor & City Council ,°

From:Mark A. Jackson, City Administrator ’T’m\

Re: Resolution No. 23-61 — Setting Date for Public Hearing
on Urban Renewal Plan Amendment

Date: August 21, 2023

Presented for Mayor and City Council consideration is Resolution No. 23-61 for
the purpose of setting a public hearing for September 18, 2023, at 6:00 p.m. on a
proposed amendment to the Urban Renewal Plan

The proposed Urban Renewal Plan Amendment includes the following;:

Fareway
Pursuant to the terms of the Memorandum of Understanding between the City and

Fareway entered into on February 20, 2023, the City agreed to make a forgivable
loan to Fareway in the amount of $800,000 for acquisition of property for the
construction of a grocery store. The disbursement of the loan shall be made within
60 days of the commencement of the Fareway grocery store.

In addition, the City agreed to make TIF payments in an amount not to exceed
$375,000 over a period of not more than 15 years. TIF payments will be funded
exclusively with the incremental property tax revenue derived from the property.

Broad Street Reconstruction Project Phase 3

The project includes the reconstruction of Broad Street from Garfield Avenue to
Park Avenue, including the intersection of Broad Street and Park Avenue.

The estimated cost of the project is $778,307. Financing for the proposed project
will come from the 2021A bond proceeds. In addition, the City has been awarded a
grant from CIRTPA in the amount of $280,000. The continued reconstruction of

Broad Street was identified by the Mayor and City Council as a strategic priority
goal.

» Home of the 1913 Herschell-Spillman Antique Carousel «



Page 2

Story Street Improvements — Grand to Grove

The scope of the street pavement rehabilitation includes HMA milling and overlay
with full depth patch replacements, spot repairs of PCC curb and gutter,
installation of ADA accessible sidewalks, and rehabilitate various public utility
structures.

B&L Properties
Pursuant to the terms of the agreement entered into on February 20, 2023, between

the City and B&L Properties (Bart Clark), the City agreed to sell Lot 2, I-35
Business Park Fourth Addition to B&L Properties in the amount of $121,500. B&L
Properties agreed to construct commercial building(s) on said lot. In addition to a
five-year sliding scale tax abatement, the City agreed to make an economic

development grant to B&L Properties on terms to be determined by future mutual
agreement,

Downtown Building Grant Program
One of the strategic priority goals identified by the Mayor and City Council is the

rehabilitation and renovation of downtown buildings. It is recommended that the
City establish a downtown rehabilitation and renovation building grant program.
Funding in the amount of $100,000 will come from a $100,000 loan from the
Hospital Fund and be repaid with future tax increment financing (TIF) revenues. If
approved, I will recommend program guidelines at a future City Council meeting,.



Story City / 421081-94 / Set Hrg UR Amend No Adds

RESOLUTION NO. 23-61

Resolution Setting Date for Public Hearing on Urban Renewal Plan Amendment
for the Story City Consolidated Urban Renewal Area

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Story City, lowa by resolution previously
established the Story City Consolidated Urban Renewal Area (the “Urban Renewal Area”) and

adopted an urban renewal plan (the “Plan”) for the governance of initiatives and projects therein;
and

WHEREAS, an amendment (the “Amendment”) to the Plan has been prepared would
authorize the undertaking of new urban renewal projects in the Urban Renewal Area consisting
of (1) providing tax increment financing support to Fareway Stores, Inc. in connection with the
construction of a new building for use in the business operations of a Fareway grocery store; (2)
using tax increment financing to pay a portion of the costs of constructing street improvements;
(3) providing tax increment financing supportto B & L Properties, L.L.C. in connection with the
construction of a commercial and industrial spec building in the I-35 Business Park; (4) using tax

increment financing to pay a portion of the costs of the City’s Downtown Building Grant
Program; and

WHEREAS, it is now necessary that a date be set for a public hearing on the
Amendment;

NOW, THEREFORE, Be It Resolved by the City Council of the City of Story City, Iowa,
as follows:

Section 1. This City Council will meet at the City Hall, Story City, Iowa, on
September 18, 2023, at 6:00 p.m., at which time and place it will hold a public hearing on the
proposed Amendment.

Section 2, The City Clerk shall publish notice of said hearing, the same being in the
form attached hereto, which publication shall be made in a legal newspaper of general circulation

in the City, which publication shall be not less than four (4) and not more than twenty (20) days
before the date set for hearing.

-6-
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP, ATTORNEYS, DES MOINES, IOWA



Story City / 421081-94 / Set Hrg UR Amend No Adds

Section 3, Pursuant to Section 403.5 of the Code of lowa, the City Administrator is
hereby designated as the City’s representative in connection with the consultation process which
is required under that section of the urban renewal law.

Passed and approved this August 21, 2023.

Mike Jensen, Mayor

Attest:

Heather Slifka, City Clerk

-7-
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP, ATTORNEYS, DES MOINES, IOWA



Story City / 421081-94 / Set Hrg UR Amend No Adds

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING ON
PROPOSED URBAN RENEWAL PLAN
AMENDMENT

Notice Is Hereby Given: That at 6:00 p.m., at the City Hall, Story City, Iowa, on
September 18, 2023, the City Council of the City of Story City, Iowa, will hold a public hearing
on the question of amending the urban renewal plan (the “Plan”) for the Story City Consolidated
Urban Renewal Area (the “Urban Renewal Area”) which would authorize the undertaking of
new urban renewal projects in the Urban Renewal Area consisting of (1) providing tax increment
financing support to Fareway Stores, Inc. in connection with the construction of a new building
for use in the business operations of a Fareway grocery store; (2) using tax increment financing
to pay a portion of the costs of constructing street improvements; (3) providing tax increment
financing support to B & L Properties, L.L.C. in connection with the construction of a
commercial and industrial spec building in the 1-35 Business Park; (4) using tax increment
financing to pay a portion of the costs of the City’s Downtown Building Grant Program. A copy
of the amendment is on file for public inspection in the office of the City Clerk.

At said hearing any interested person may file written objections or comments and may
be heard orally with respect to the subject matters of the hearing,

Heather Slifka
City Clerk

-8-
DORSEY & WHITNEY LLP, ATTORNEYS, DES MOINES, IOWA



Story City/421081-94/UR Plan Amend

CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA

URBAN RENEWAL PLAN AMENDMENT
STORY CITY CONSOLIDATED URBAN RENEWAL AREA

September, 2023

The Urban Renewal Plan (the “Plan”) for the Story City Consolidated Urban Renewal
Area (the “Urban Renewal Area”) is being amended for the purpose of identifying new urban
renewal projects to be undertaken therein.

1) Identification of Projects. By virtue of this amendment, the list of authorized
urban renewal projects in the Plan is hereby amended to include the following project
descriptions:

A.
Name of Project: = Fareway Stores, Inc. Project
Date of Council Approval of Project: September 18, 2023

Description of the Project and Project Site: Fareway Stores, Inc. (the
“Company”) has proposed to undertake the construction of a new commercial building
(the “Fareway Project”) for use in the business operations of a Fareway grocery store on
certain real property situated at 1550 Broad Street and 521 Factory Outlet Drive (the
“Fareway Property”) in the Urban Renewal Area. It has been requested that the City
provide tax increment financing assistance and an economic development forgivable loan
to the Company in support of the efforts to complete the Fareway Project.

The costs incurred by the City in providing tax increment financing assistance to the
Company will include legal and administrative fees (the “Admin Fees”) in an amount not
to exceed $15,000.

Description of Use of TIF: The City intends to enter into a development agreement
(the “Development Agreement”) with the Company with respect to the Fareway Project
and to provide (i) annual appropriation economic development payments (the
“Payments”) and (ii) an economic development forgivable loan (the “Forgivable Loan”)
to the Company thereunder.

The Payments, in an amount not to exceed $375,000, will be funded with incremental
property tax revenues to be derived from the Fareway Property.

The Forgivable Loan, in an amount not to exceed $800,000, will be funded with either

borrowed funds and/or an internal advance of funds on-hand. In any case, the City’s
obligations (the “Obligations™) entered into to by the City to fund the Forgivable Loan

4883-7865-9959\2



Story City/421081-94/UR Plan Amend

may be repaid with incremental property tax revenues to be derived from the Urban
Renewal Area.

It is anticipated that the City’s total commitment of incremental property tax revenues
with respect to the Project, including the Payments, the Forgivable Loan, and the Admin
Fees will not exceed $1,190,000, plus any interest expenses incurred by the City on any
borrowing undertaken for the funding of the Forgivable Loan.

B.
Name of Project:  Broad Street Reconstruction Phase 3 Project
Date of Council Approval of the Project: September 18, 2023

Description of Project and Project Site: The Broad Street Reconstruction Phase 3
Project will include (i) the construction of street, curb and gutter, water system, and
sidewalk improvements and (ii) the incidental utility, landscaping, site clearance and
cleanup work related thereto on and along Broad Street beginning at its intersection with
Garfield Avenue on the west and continuing to its intersection with Park Avenue on the
east.

It is expected that the completed Broad Street Reconstruction Phase 3 Project will cause
increased and improved ability of the City to provide adequate transportation
infrastructure for the growth and retention of commercial enterprises in the City.

Description of Properties to be Acquired in Connection with Project: The City will
acquire such easement territory and rights-of-way as are necessary to successfully
undertake the Broad Street Reconstruction Phase 3 Project.

Description of Use of TIF for the Project: It is anticipated that the City will pay for the
Broad Street Reconstruction Phase 3 Project with borrowed funds and/or the proceeds of
an internal advance of City funds on-hand. In any case, the City’s obligations will be
repaid with incremental property tax revenues derived from the Urban Renewal Area. It
is anticipated that the City’s use of incremental property tax revenues for the Broad Street
Reconstruction Phase 3 Project will not exceed $800,000, plus any interest expense
incurred by the City on any borrowing undertaken for the funding of the Broad Street
Reconstruction Phase 3 Project.

C.
Name of Project:  Story Street Improvements Project
Date of Council Approval of the Project: September 18, 2023

Description of Project and Project Site: The Story Street Improvements Project will
include (i) street resurfacing; and (ii) the incidental utility, landscaping, site clearance and
cleanup work related thereto on and along Story Street beginning at its intersection with



Story City/421081-94/UR Plan Amend

Grand Avenue on the west and continuing to its intersection with Grove Avenue on the
east.

It is expected that the completed Story Street Improvements Project will cause increased
and improved ability of the City to provide adequate transportation infrastructure for the
growth and retention of commercial enterprises in the City.

Description of Properties to be Acquired in Connection with Project: The City will
acquire such easement territory and rights-of-way as are necessary to successfully
undertake the Story Street Improvements Project.

Description of Use of TIF for the Project: It is anticipated that the City will pay for the
Story Street Improvements Project with borrowed funds and/or the proceeds of an
internal advance of City funds on-hand. In any case, the City’s obligations will be repaid
with incremental property tax revenues derived from the Urban Renewal Area. It is
anticipated that the City’s use of incremental property tax revenues for the Story Street
Improvements Project will not exceed $150,000, plus any interest expense incurred by
the City on any borrowing undertaken for the funding of the Story Street Improvements
Project.

D.
Name of Project: B & L Properties, L.L.C. Project
Date of Council Approval of the Project: September 18, 2023

Description of the Project: B & L Properties, L.L.C. (the “Developer”) has proposed to
undertake the construction of a commercial/industrial spec building (the “B & L Project”)
situated on certain real property (the “B & L Property”) in the I-35 Business Park in the
Urban Renewal Area. The completed B & L Project will include commercial and/or
industrial space for lease by the Developer.

The City will use tax increment financing to support the Developer’s construction of the
B & L Project.

The costs incurred by the City in providing tax increment financing assistance to the
Developer will include legal and administrative fees (the “Admin Fees”) in an amount
not to exceed $7,000.

Description of Use of TIF for the Project: The City intends to enter into a
development agreement (the “Agreement”) with the Developer with respect to the
construction of the completed B & L Project and to provide an economic development
grant (the “Grant™) to the Developer thereunder. The Grant will be funded with either
borrowed funds and/or an internal advance of funds on-hand. In any case, the obligations
entered into by the City to fund the Grant may be repaid with incremental property tax
revenues to be derived from the Urban Renewal Area. It is anticipated that the City’s
total commitment of incremental property tax revenues with respect to the B & L Project

-3-



Story City/421081-94/UR Plan Amend

will not exceed $125,000, plus the Admin Fees, plus any interest expense incurred by the
City on any borrowing undertaken for the funding of the Grant.

E.
Name of Project: = Downtown Building Grant Program
Date of Council Approval of Program:  September 18, 2023

Description of Program:  The City acknowledges the importance of a vibrant
downtown to the promotion of economic development in the Urban Renewal Area.
Under the Downtown Building Grant Program (the “Program”), the City will fund
economic development grants to eligible, local commercial business owners to assist such
local business owners with paying the costs of undertaking building improvement
projects and other projects approved by the City Staff. The City Staff will develop
appropriate materials, including agreements and applications, for the administration of
the Program.

Description of Use of TIF for Program: It is anticipated that the City will pay for
Program with borrowed funds and/or the proceeds of internal advances of City funds on-
hand. In any case, the City’s obligations (the “Obligations”) will be repaid with
incremental property tax revenues derived from the Urban Renewal Area. The amount of
incremental property tax revenues to be expended by the City in connection with
Program will not exceed $100,000 over the course of the City’s 2024 through 2028 fiscal
years, plus any interest expense incurred by the City on any borrowing undertaken for the
funding of the Program.

2) Required Financial Information. The following information is provided in
accordance with the requirements of Section 403.17 of the Code of Iowa:

Constitutional debt limit of the City: $16.599,253
Outstanding general obligation debt of the City: $ 9,331,146
Proposed debt to be incurred under the September, 2023

Amendment*: $ 2,365,000

* It is anticipated that some or all of the debt incurred hereunder will be subject to
annual appropriation by the City Council.



: //l/yﬁl\l 504 Broad Street a Story City, 1A 50248

@ CirtyofSroryCity.org

‘Sml'v Gtv 515.733.2121
4 v

To:  The Honorable Mayor & City Council
From: Mark A. Jackson, City Administrator /?V'M
Re:  Resolution No. 23-62 ~ Approving Submission
of a RISE Grant Application for Extension of Rich Olive Street
Date: August 21, 2023

Presented for Mayor & City Council consideration is Resolution No. 23-62 for the
purpose of authorizing the submission of a Revitalize Iowa’s Sound Economy
(RISE) grant to the lowa Department of Transportation for the extension of Rich
Olive Street in the Interstate 35 Business Park.

The City, along with the Story City EDC and Ames EDC, is negotiating with a
business for location in the Interstate 35 Business Park in an area identified in the
extension of Rich Olive Street. In addition, discussions have been taking place
with two other potential business prospects for location in this area as well.

The proposed project would construct approximately 1,160 lineal feet of roadway
on Rich Olive Street from Precision Parkway heading east. The estimated cost of
the project is $1,181,839 and the City is requesting $345,168 in RISE funds for the
roadway project. The City will also be applying to the Economic Development
District for Public Works and Economic Adjustment Assistance for funding in the
amount of approximately $491,502.

In addition, construction of the new roadway will provide direct access to 40 acres
of land in the Interstate 35 Business Park for economic development purposes.

The City’s funding match, estimated at $345,169, will come from tax increment
financing through either an internal loan or from the issuance of a bond.

» Home of the 1913 Herschell-Spillman Antique Carousel «



e

L4 DU ey
[ =T

¥ 130HVd

£1°T Av0¥ ALNNOD

VMOI ‘ALID AYOLS YIVd SSANISNA S¢-1

NOISNALXH LHHYLS HAI'TO HOIY

S ALVISYILN

L T
HIMIE APVLINYS

HIMIS MOLS

ONIDFIAMmLN

IR Ty ——

W HPEY ALY F Sy CYE O e 3016l s 1of bouw ampes 7 st SH1 PG 4 U T8




PRELIMINARY OPINION OF PROBABLE COST
Rich Olive Street 1200 ft Extension
Precision Parkway to Lot 5 - Fifth
Addition
Story City, lowa
RISE RISE TOTAL
ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT COST EUGIBLE [INELIGABLE| EXTENSION
Rich Olive Street

1 MOBILIZATION 1 ;s 3 35,000.00 $ 35,000.00 $ 35,000.00
2 TRAFFIC CONTROL 1 s s 2,500.00 $ 2,500.00 5 2,500.00
3 EXCAVATION, CLASS 10, ROADWAY AND BORROW 10670 cY § 5.00 § 53,350.00 $ §3,350.00
4 TOPSOIL, STRIP AND STOCKPILE, RESPREAD 3250 cY s 500 § 16,250.00 $ 16,250.00
5 GRANULAR SUBBASE, AND SUBGRADE PREP 110 SY § 15.00 $ 76,650.00 $ 76,650.00
6 PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT, 8 IN. 4380 sY § 55.00 $ 240,900.00 $ 240,300.00
7 STORM SEWER GRAVITY MAIN, TRENCHED 1320 LF § 10000 $ 132,000.00 $ 132,000.00
8 INTAKE 8 EA $ 5,000.00 $  40,000.00 $ 40,000.00
9 SUBDRAIN, PERFORATED PLASTIC PIPE, 6 IN. DIA. 2360 LF § 1400 $  33,040.00 S 33,040.00
10 SILTFENCE 2400  LF 3 200 $  4,800.00 $  4,800.00
11 INLET PROTECTION (FILTER SOCK) 8 EA $ 100.00 § 800,00 $  800.00
12 SEEDING AND FERTILIZING (URBAN) 2 AC § 400000 $ 800000 $  8,000.00
13 SANITARY SEWER GRAVITY MAIN, TRENCHED 1310  LF § 75.00 $98,250.00 $ 98,250.00
14  MANHOLE, SANTTARY SEWER, SW-301, 48 IN, a EA S 6,500.00 $26,000.00 $ 26,000.00
15 WATER MAIN, 12 IN 1200 LF § 60.00 $72,000.00 $ 72,000.00
16 WATER MAIN, FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY 5 EA S 8,000.00 $40,00000 $ 40,800.00
17 WATER MAIN, VALVE, GATE, 12" 3 EA S 4,700.00 $14,100.00 $ 14,100.00
18 MISC. CONSTRUCTION & CONTINGENCIES 15% $__ 9649350 $37,552.50 $ 134,046.00

Construction Subtotal Rich Olive St  $739,783.50) $287,502.50| $1,027,686.00)

— =z _I

15% Engineering, Survey & Administration 5154,151

'I'O'I'IAL ESTIMATED PROJECT COST 51,181,834

6/6/2023



The following resolution was offered by Councilperson
who moved its adoption.

RESOLUTION NO. 23-62
A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE CITY OF STORY CITY’S PARTICIPATION IN
THE REVITALIZE 10WA’S SOUND ECONOMY (RISE) PROGRAM - LOCAL
DEVELOPMENT FUNDING - FOR ROADWAY IMPROVEMENTS
WHEREAS, the State Code of Iowa has authorized the RISE program, and

WHEREAS, the Towa Department of Transportation is accepting applications for Local
Development funding, and

WHEREAS, the improved roadway will open up an additional 40 acres for economic
development purposes, and

WHEREAS, negotiations are taking place with one business and discussions with two
other additional businesses, and

WHEREAS, the location of these business prospects is contingent upon an improved
roadway, and

WHEREAS, this roadway will be maintained by the City of Story City and dedicated to
public use.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Story City,
Iowa, that the City endorses this project and states the following:

1. There is a Local Development need for the project and RISE Funds are
essential.

2. The City of Story City will accept said roadway as public property and will
maintain said road and construction of the roadway will be of adequate design.

3. The City of Story City agrees to pay the matching funds identified in the grant
application for the roadway project.

4. Arrangements have been made for non-roadway factors intrinsic to the project
including, zoning, water, sewer, and job training.

This motion was seconded by Councilperson , and,
upon roll call, was carried by an aye and nay vote, as follows:

AYE:

NAY:

ABSENT:




WHEREUPON, the Mayor declared the Resolution duly adopted this 21 day of August,
2023.

ATTEST:

Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk



The following resolution was offered by Councilperson
who moved its adoption:

RESOLUTION NO. 23- (03

A RESOLUTION APPROVING RELEASE OF MORTGAGE LIEN AND
AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND CITY CLERK TO EXECUTE SAME ON
BEHALF OF THE CITY OF STORY CITY

WHEREAS the City of Story City, lowa (“the City”), is Mortgagee under a mortgage
given by Mortgagor COAD Enterprises LLC;

AND WHEREAS said Mortgagor has repaid said loan, and therefore said mortgage
should be released of record by the City in order to clear title to the real estate in question;

AND WHEREAS the City Attorney has prepared a Release of said mortgage (a copy of
which is attached hereto and by this reference made a part hereof), which Release needs to be
approved by the City Council prior to the execution and delivery of same.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Story City,

Iowa, that said Mortgage Release is hereby approved, and the Mayor and City Clerk are hereby
authorized to execute same on behalf of the City.

This motion was seconded by Councilperson , and, upon roll
call was carried by an aye and nay vote, as follows:

AYE:
NAY:
ABSENT:

WHEREUPON the Mayor declared the Resolution duly adopted this 21st day of August
2023.

bl

ATTEST:
Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk




RELEASE OF REAL ESTATE MORTGAGE
Recorder’s Cover Sheet

Preparer Information:
Fred A. Larson

1345 Jacobson Drive

Story City, [A 50248

(515) 733-4336

Taxpayer Information:
COAD Enterprises LLC

618 Broad St., Suite B

Story City, IA 50248
Return Document To:
COAD Enterprises LLC

618 Broad St., Suite B

Story City, IA 50248
Mortgagee releasing mortgage:
The City of Story City, lowa
Mortgagor:

COAD Enterprises LLC
Legal Description: N/A

Document or instrument number of previously recorded documents: 2011-12423

©'The lowa State Bar Association 2021 ~ Form No. 129, Release of Real I-Zslateilortgage_
lowaDocs® Revised January 2016



RELEASE OF REAL ESTATE MORTGAGE

The City of Story City, lowa, the present owner of the mortgage hereinafter described, does
hereby acknowledge that a certain mortgage bearing date of December 5, 2011, made and
executed by COAD Enterprises LLC to The City of Story City, lowa, an lowa municipal
corporation, and recorded in the records of the office of the Recorder of Story County, lowa,
recorded as Inst. No. 2011-12423, on December 9, 2011, is redeemed, paid off, satisfied and
discharged in full.

Words and phrases herein, including acknowledgment hereof, shall be construed as in the
singular or plural number, and as masculine, feminine or neuter gender, according to the context.

Dated August 21, 2023,

THE CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA
an lowa Municipal Corporation

i3_y: Mike IEI’ISCI:II,- Mayo}_

By: Heather Slifka, C_IE/ Clerk

STATE OF IOWA, COUNTY OF STORY

This record was acknowledged before me on August 21, 2023, by Mike Jensen and
Heather Slifka, as Mayor and City Clerk. respectively, of the City of Story City, lowa.

Si_gnatu_ré of No't'ary Public

©The lowa State Bar Association 2021 Form No. 129, Release of Real Estate ’\-lorfgage
lowaDocs® Revised January 2016



ORDINANCE NO. 339

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 156 (BUILDING CODES) OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA.

BEIT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE INFORPORATED CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA:

SECTION 1. Chapter 156 of the Story City Code of Ordinances is hereby repealed in its entirety and
replaced with the following:

CHAPTER 156

BUILDING CODES

156.01 Title 156.07 Plumbing Code

156.02 Adoption of Building Codes 156.08 Flectrical Code

156.03 Building Code 156.09 Fire Code

156.04 Residential Code 156.10 Property Maintenance Code
156.05 Mechanical Code 156.11 Energy Conservation Code
156.06 Fuel Gas Code 156.12 Existing Building Code

156.01 TITLE. This chapter shall be known as the Building Codes of the City of Story City, lowa, may be cited as
such, and will be referred to herein as the "Story City Building Code(s)."

156.02 ADOPTION OF BUILDING CODES. The following codes are hereby adopted as, and constitute, the Building
Codes of the City of Story City, lowa, to regulate the erection, construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving,
removal, conversion, demolition, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, and maintenance of buildings or structures
in the City.

156.03 BUILDING CODE. The provisions of the International Building Code, 2018 edition, as published by the
International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and
deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title, Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City
Building Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code™.”

2. Section 101.4.1 Gas. Delete “International” and insert in tieu thereof “Story City” and add at the end of the
section: “All references in this code to the International Fuel Gas Code shall be interpreted to refer to the Story
City Fuel Gas Code.”

3. Section 101.4.2 Mechanical. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and add at the end
of the section: “All references in this code to the International Mechanical Code shall be interpreted to refer to
the Story City Mechanical Gas Code.”

4. Section 101.4.3 Plumbing. Delete “International Plumbing Code™ and insert in lieu thereof “Story City
Plumbing Code™ and add at the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Plumbing
Code shall be interpreted to refer to the Story City Plumbing Code.”



5. Section 101.4.4 Property maintenance. Delete ““International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City™ and
add at the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Property Maintenance Code shall
be interpreted to refer to the Story City Property Maintenance Code.”

6. Section 101.4.5 Fire prevention, Delete “International™ and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and add at
the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Fire Code shall be interpreted to refer to
the Story City Fire Code.”

7. Section 101.4.6 Energy. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and add at the end of
the section: “All references in this code to the International Energy Conservation Code shall be interpreted to
refer to the Story City Energy Conservation Code.”

8. Section 101.4.7 Existing buildings. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City” and add at
the end of the section: “All references in this code to the International Existing Building Code shall be
interpreted to refer to the Story City Existing Building Code.”

9. Section 101.4 Referenced Codes. Add Subsection 101.4.8: “101.4.8 Electrical. The provisions of the Story
City Electrical Code shall apply to the installation, alteration, repair, and replacement of electrical systems,
including equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings, and appurtenances. All references in this code to NFPA 70
shall be interpreted to refer to the Story City Electrical Code.”

10. Section 104.11 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment. Add
Subsection 104.11.3: “104.11.3 Manufactured home installation. The lowa Administrative Code 661,
Chapter 16, Div. VI, Part 2, Manufactured Home Construction, is hereby adopted for installation of mobile
{manufactured) homes.”

11. Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #1. Delete *120” and insert in lieu thereof 200"
12. Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #2. Delete existing text.

13. Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #6. Delete existing text and insert: “Sidewalks
and driveways located entirely on private property, and not more than 30 inches above adjacent grade, and not
over any basement or story below, and not part of an accessible route.”

14. Section 107.1 General. Delete “in two or more sets”.
15. Section 107.3.1 Approval of construction documents. Delete this section,

16. Section 903.4.2 Alarms. Delete existing text and insert: “*An approved audible and visual device, located
on the exterior of the building in an approved location, shall be connected to each automatic sprinkler system.
Such sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single
sprinkler of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of
the automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.”

17. Section 907.1. General. Add Subsection 907.1.4: “907.1.4 Fire alarm control panels (FACP). Each
building shall have no more than one fire alarm control panel. Installation of the fire alarm control panel shall
not exceed six feet in height, measured from the floor 1o the top of the control panel. Exception: Suppresion
system releasing panels are not required to meet the height requirement or the limitation on the number of
panels.”

18. Section 1009.2 Continuity and components. Add Item Number 11: *I1. Concrete, asphalt, or other
approved hard-surface exterior walking surfaces.”

19. Section 1010.1.6 Landings at doors. Add Subsection 1010.1.6.1: *1010.1.6.1 Landing frost protection.
Exterior landings required by Section 1010.1.5 to be at the same elevation on each side of the door shall be
provided with frost protection.”

20. Section 1028.5 Access to a public way. Add at the end of the section: “Components of exterior walking
surfaces shall be hard-surfaced.”



21. Section 1030.4 Window wells. Add Subsection 1030.4.3: *1030.4.3 Window well drainage. All window
wells shall be provided with approved drainage.”

22. Section 1301.1.1 Criteria. Delete “International™ and insert in lieu thereof “Story City”.

23. Section 1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. Insert: “City of Story City, lowa™ and “as adopted
in City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 160"

24, Section 1807.1.5 Concrete and masonry foundation walls. Add Exception #2 and Table 1807.1.5: *2.
Concrete and masonry foundation walls supporting buildings of conventional light-frame wood construction
shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with Table [807.1.5.
Table 1807.1.5
Prescriptive Foundation Walls Supporting Light-Frame Construction®?*

Helght'of Thickness of Reinforcement size and Reinforcement size
foundation . . .
d foundation wall placement in concrete wall and placement in
Ll masonry wall*
Gross | Net® | Concrete’ | Masonry® Horizontal Vertical y
No. 4 bar within 0.075 square inch bar
. No. 4 bar at it . ,
<g | <78 7§ g” 127 of the top and 12 o.c at 96" o.c. vertically in
- - ) bottom of the wall maxim'ur'n cells fully grouted with
and at mid-height Type M or S grout
No. 4 bar at
. ' on » Refer to No. 4 bar at 24" ”
>8 >7'-8 8 RA04.1.2 o.c. maximum® 20_ o.c. i Refer to 1807.1.6
maximum

a.  Concrete floor stab to be nominal 4" thick. If such floor slab is not provided prior to backfill, one 36" vertical No. 4 bar shalt be
embedded in the footing at maximum 84" o.c. spacing or a full depth nominal 2” depth x 4" width keyway shall be installed in
the footing.

b.  All reinforcement bars shall meet ASTM A6175 grade 40 minimum and be deformed. Placement of bars shall be 3" from the
inside face of the wall and meet the provisions of chapters 18, 19, and 21 of the International Building Code.

¢ Material used as backfill shall be carefully placed granular soil of average or high permeability and shall be drained with an

approved drainage system as prescribed in Section 1805.4 of the International Building Code. Where soils containing a high

percentage of clay, fine silt, or similar materials of low permeability or expansive soils are encountered or where backfill
materials are not drained or an unusually high surcharge is to be placed adjacent to the wall, a specially designed wall shali be
required.

Maximum foundation wall height is 10" gross and 9°-8" net.

Net foundation wall height measured from top of basement slab to top of foundation wall

The thickness of concrete foundation walls supporting 3 floors shall be increased 2.

The thickness of masonry foundation walls supporting 3 floors shall be increased 4"

No. 5 bar at 24” 0.c. maximum is an approved alternative,

No. 5 bar at 30" o.c. maximum is an approved altemnative.

Mortar for masonry walls shall be Type M or S and masonry shall be laid in running bond.

If masonry block is 12 nominal thickness, wall may be unreinforced.”

FTrTOMm Mo o

25. Section 1809.5 Frost protection, Exception 2. Delete existing text and insert: “Area of 1,000 square feet
or less for light-frame construction or 400 square feet for other than light-frame construction.”

26. Section 1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction. Delete existing Table 1809.7 and all
footnotes and insert:

“Table 1809.7
Prescriptive Footings Supporting Walls of Light-Frame Construction®<%f
Number of floors Thickness of Thickness of foundation Width of | Thickness
supported by the foundation walls walls (inches), concrete footing of footing
footing® (inches), concrete block (inches) (inches)

1 8 8 16 8

2 8 8 16 8

3 10 12 18 12

a.  Depth of perimeter footings shall be at least 42" below final grade



. The ground under the floor shall be permitted to be excavated to the elevation of the bottom of the footing.

¢.  Interior stud-bearing walls shall be permitted to be supported by isolated footings. The footing width and length shall be twice the
width shown in this table, and footings shall be spaced not more than 6 feet on center.

d.  Spread footings shall have a minimum of 2- #4 continuous horizontal reinforcement bars.

¢.  Foundation walls shall have a minimum of #4 reinforcement bars 18" on center in each direction.

£ Trench footings are allowed as a continuous 8 inch trench for single-story wood frame structures with spans not exceeding 16
feet. The trench must be at least 42 inches below finished grade and have at least two #4 horizontal reinforcement bars. Bars must
tie into abutting adjacent structure.

g  Foolings shall be permitted to support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of floors, Fooltings supporting a roof only shall
be as required for supporting one floor.”

27. Section 2902.6 Small Occupancies. Add at the end of the section: “Water dispensers in accessible locations

and within accessible reach ranges may be substituted for the required drinking fountain in business occupancies
determined to require only one drinking fountain by occupant load.”

28. Section 3109.1 General. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City™.

156.04 RESIDENTIAL CODE. The provisions of the International Residential Code for One-and Two-Family
Dwellings, 2018 edition, as published by the International Code Council, except for Part VII—Plumbing, and Part
Vili—Electrical; and with the addition of Appendix Chapters G, H, and J, are hereby adopted by reference, subject to
the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions:

I. Section R101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City

ELIEYY

Residential Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code”,

2. Section 104.11 Alternative materials, design and methods of construction and equipment. Add
Subsection 104.11.2: “104.11.2 Manufactured home installation. The lowa Administrative Code 661,
Chapter 16, Div. V1, Part 2, Manufactured Home Construction, is hereby adopted for installation of mobile
{manufactured) homes.”

3. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #2. Delete existing text.

4. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Building Item #5. Delete existing text and insert: “Sidewalks
and driveways located entirely on private property.

5. Section R106.1 Submittal documents. Delete “in two or more sets”.
6. Section R106.3.1 Approval of construction documents. Delete this section.

7. Table R301.2(1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria. Amend Table 301.2(1) to include the
following values:

Ground Snow Load: 25 PSF

Wind Speed (mph): 15

Topographic effects: NO

Special wind region: NO

Wind-borne debris zone: NO

Seismic Design Category: A

Weathering: Severe

Frost line depth: 427

Termite: Moderate to Heavy

Winter Design Temp: -T°F

Ice Barrier Underlayment Required: YES

Flood Hazards: As adopted in City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter
160

Air Freezing Index: 1896

Mean Annual Temp: 48.2°F



Elevation: 1010 fi

Latitude: 42°N
Winter heating: -T°F
Summer cooling: 90°F
Altitude correction factor: 0.97
Indoor design temperature: 70°F
Design temperature cooling: 15°F
Heating temperature difference: 77°F
Cooling temperature difference: 15°F
Wind velocity heating: 15 MPH
Wind velocity cooling: 7.5 MPH
Coincident wet bulb: 74°F
Daily range: M
Winter humidity: 30%
Summer humidity: 50%

8. Section R303.3 Bathrooms. Delete existing text and insert: Bathrooms shall be provided with a mechanical
ventilation system. The minimum ventilation rates shall be 50 CFM for intermittent ventilation or 20 CFM for
continuous ventilation. Ventilation air from the space shall be exhausted directly to the outside of the dwelling.

9. Section R310.2.4 Emergency escape and rescue openings under decks and porches. Add at the end of
the section: “All cantilevered construction elements shail be regulated in accordance with this section.”

10. Section R311.3.2 Floor elevations for other exterior doors, Exception. Delete “two” and insert in licu
thereof “three”.

I'l. Section R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. Add Exception #2: “2. Townhouse
structures that contain cight or fewer dwelling units and in which the gross finished and unfinished floor area
on all levels, including basements and exclusive of attached garages, is less than 18,000 square feet.”

t2. Section R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire systems, Add Exception #2: “2. Dwellings
that do not exceed 8,000 square feet or more of enclosed floor space on all levels, including basements and
exclusive of attached garages.”

13. Section R326.1 General. Delete “International” and insert in lieu thereof “Story City”.

14. Section R403.1.1.1 Conventional light-frame wood construction. Add Subsection R403.1.1.1 and Table
R403.1.1.1: “R403.1.1.1 Conventional light-frame wood construction. Footings supporting concrete
foundations and buildings of conventional light-frame wood construction shall be permitted to be designed in
accordance with Table R403.1.1.1.

Table R403.1.1.1
Prescriptive Footings Supporting Walls of Light-Frame Construction®®<d9f
Number of floors supported by the Width of footing Thickness of footing
footing® (inches) (inches)
1 16 8
2 16 8
3 18 12

a. Minimum 2,000 psf soil bearing pressure. Soil bearing pressures less than 2,000 psf shall use Tables R403.1{1) through

R403.1(3) and Figure R403.1(1) or R403.1.3, as applicable.

Depth of perimeter footings shall be at least 42™ below final grade

The ground under the floor shall be permitted to be excavated to the elevation of the bottom of the fooling,

d. Interior stud-bearing walls shall be permitted 10 be supported by isolated footings. The footing width and length shall be twice the
width shown in this table, and footings shall be spaced not more than 6 feet on center.

€.  Spread footings shall have a minimum of 2- #4 continuous horizontal reinforcement bars.

oo



f.  Trench footings are allowed as a continuous 8 inch trench for single-story wood frame structures with spans not exceeding 16
feet. The trench must be at least 42 inches below finished grade and have at least two #4 horizontal reinforcement bars. Bars must
tie into abutting adjacent structure.

g.  Footings shall be permitted to support a roof in addition to the stipulated number of floors. Foolings supporting a roof only shall
be as required for supporting one floor.”

I5. Section R403.1.4.1 Frost protection, Exception #1. Delete “600 and insert in lieu thereof “1,000".

16. Section R404.1.3.2.3 Foundation walls for conventional light-frame wood construction. Add
Subsection R404.1.3.2.3 and Table R404.1.3.2.3: “R404.1.3.2.3 Foundation walls for conventional light-
frame wood construction. Concrete and masonry foundation walls supporting buildings of conventional light-
frame wood construction shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with Table R404,1.3.2.3.
Table R403.1.1.1
Prescriptive Foundation Walls Supporting Light-Frame Construction®*

Helght‘of Thickness of Reinforcement size and Reinforcement size
foundation : : :
d foundation wall placement in concrete wall and placement in
sl masonry wall*
Gross | Net® | Concrete’ | Masonry® Horizontal Vertical y
No. 4 bar within 0.075 square inch bar
v No. 4 bar at . ) .
<g | <7.8” 757 8" 12” of the top and 72" o at 96” o.c. vertically in
- - ’ bottom of the wall maxin{u;n cells fully grouted with
and at mid-height Type M or S grout
» | No. 4 barat
>8 |>7-87| 8" Referto | No.4barat24” | Ty 0 Refer to R404.1.2
R404.1.2 0.C. maximum . ;
maximum

1. Concrete floor slab to be nominal 4” thick. If such floor slab is not provided prior to backfill, one 36" vertical No. 4 bar shal] be
embedded in the footing at maximum 84" o.c. spacing or a full depth nominal 2” depth x 4™ width keyway shail be instatled in
the footing.

m. All reinforcement bars shall meet ASTM A6175 grade 40 minimum and be deformed. Placement of bars shall be 3" from the
inside face of the wall and meet the provisions of chapters 18, 19, and 21 of the International Building Code.

n.  Material used as backfill shall be carefully placed granular soil of average or high permeability and shall be drained with an

approved drainage system as prescribed in Section 1805.4 of the International Building Code. Where soils containing a high

percentage of clay, fine silt, or similar materials of low permeability or expansive soils are encountered or where backfill
materials are not drained or an unusually high surcharge is to be placed adjacent to the wall, a specially designed wall shall be
required.

Maximum foundation wall height is 10" gross and 9°-8" net.

Net foundation wall height measured from top of basement slab to top of foundation wall

The thickness of concrete foundation walls supporting 3 floors shall be increased 27,

The thickness of masonry foundation walls supporting 3 fleors shall be increased 4”

No. 5 bar at 24" 0.c. maximum is an approved aliernative.

No. 5 bar at 30” o.c. maximum is an approved alternative.

Mortar for masonry walls shatl be Type M or S and masonry shall be laid in running bond.

If masonry block is 12" nominal thickness. wall may be unreinforced.”

fEr-wnowoe

17. Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency. Delete all sections except N1101.1,
18. Section N1101.1.1 Criteria. Add Subsection N1101.1.1: “N1101.1.1 Criteria. Buildings regulated by this
code shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the Story City Energy Conservation Code.”

156.05 MECHANICAL CODE. The provisions of the State of lowa Administrative Rule 641—Chapter 61 are hereby
adopted by reference, subject (o the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions, and shall be known as
the Story City Mechanical Code. References to section numbers will be to sections in the International Mechanical
Code.

I. Section 106.3.1 Construction documents. Delete “in two or more sets”.
2. Section 106.4.1 Approved construction documents. Delete this section.

3. Section 106.4.6 Retention of construction documents. Delete the final sentence of this section.



4. Section 106.5.2 Fee schedule. Delete existing text and insert: “A fee for each permit required by this code
shall be paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by the Building Official.”

5. Section 106.5.3 Fee refunds. Delete existing text and insert: “The Building Official is authorized to establish
a refund policy.”

6. Section 108.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who violates a provision of
this code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, or repairs work
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building Official, or of a permit issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.”

7. Section 108.5 Stop work orders. Delete the final sentence of this section and insert in lieu thereof: “Any
person who shall continue any work regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject
to penalties as prescribed by law.”

156.06 FUEL GAS CODE. The provisions of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2018 edition, as published by the
International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and
deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City Fuel

LIIRL)

Gas Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.
2. Section 106.3.1 Construction documents. Delete “in two or more sets”.
3. Section 106.5.1 Approved construction documents. Delete this section.
4. Section 106.5.6 Retention of construction documents. Delete the final sentence of this section.

5. Section 106.6.2 Fee schedule. Delete existing text and insert: “A fee for each permit required by this code
shall be paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by the Building Official.”

6. Section 106.6.3 Fee refunds. Delete existing text and insert: “The Building Official is authorized to establish
a refund policy.”

7. Section 108.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who violates a provision of
this code or fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who erects, installs, alters, or repairs work
in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the Building Official, or of a permit issued
under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.”

8. Section 108.5 Stop work orders. Delete the final sentence of this section and insert in lieu thereof: “Any
person who shall continue any work regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject
to penalties as prescribed by law.”

156.07 PLUMBING CODE. The provisions of the State of lowa Administrative Rule 641-—Chapter 25 with the
addition of Chapter 1, except Sections 101 and 102, Appendix A, Appendix B, Appendix C, and Appendix D of the
Uniform Plumbing Code, 2018 edition, as published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials, are hereby adopted by reference, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions,
and shall be known as the Story City Plumbing Code. References to code sections will be to sections of the Uniform
Plumbing Code.

1. Section 104.4.1 Approved Plans or Construction Documents. Delete this section.
2. Section 104.4.6 Retention of Plans. Delete the final sentence of this section.
3. Section 104.5 Fees. Delete “and as set forth in the fee schedule, Table 104.5.”.



4. Section 104.5.3 Fee Refunds. Delete existing text and insert: “The Authority Having Jurisdiction is
authorized to establish a refund policy.”

5. Section 105.2.6 Reinspections. Delete “To obtain reinspection, the applicant shall file an application

therefore in writing upon a form furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with
Table 104.5.”.

156.08 ELECTRICAL CODE. The provisions of the State of lowa Administrative Rule 661—Chapter 504 are hereby
adopted by reference, subject to the following additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions, and shall be known as
the Story City Electrical Code:

1. Reserved.

156.09 FIRE CODE. The provisions of the International Fire Code, 2018 edition, as published by the International
Code Council, with the addition of Appendix Chapters B, C, D, and 1 are hereby adopted, subject to the following
additions, modifications, insertions, and deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City Fire
Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code™.”

2. Section 105.1.2 Types of permits. Add at the end of the section: “A certificate of occupancy issued pursuant
to the provisions of the International Building Code may be considered as equivalent to an operational permit.
Building, mechanical, electrical, and plumbing permits issued pursuant to the provisions of their respective
codes may be considered as equivalent to a constiuction permil.

3. Section 105.4.1 Submittals. Delete “in two or more sets”.
4. Section 105.4.6 Retention of construction documents, Delete the final sentence of this section.

5. Section 110.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Persons who shall violate a provision of
this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair, or
do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a permit
or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be subject to penaliies as prescribed by law.”

6. Section 112.4 Failure to comply. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who shall continue any work
regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by
law.”

7. Section 308.1.4 Open-flame cooking devices, Exception 2. Delete existing text and insert: “LP-gas cooking
devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not greater than 20 pounds.”

8. Section 308.1.4 Open-flame cooking devices, Exception 3. Delete this exception.

9. Section 903.4.2 Alarms. Delete existing text and insert: “An approved andible and visual device, located on
the exterior of the building in an approved location, shall be connected to each automatic sprinkler system. Such
sprinkler waterflow alarm devices shall be activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler
of the smallest orifice size installed in the system. Where a fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the
automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.”

10. Section 907.1. General. Add Subsection 907.1.4: “907.1.4 Fire alarm control panels (FACP). Each
building shall have no more than one fire alarm control panel. Installation of the fire alarm control panel shall
not exceed six feet in height, measured from the floor to the top of the control panel. Exception: Suppression
system releasing panels are not required to meet the height requirement or the limitation on the number of
panels.”



I'l. Section 1009.2 Continuity and components. Add Item Number 11: “11. Concrete, asphalt, or other
approved hard-surface exierior walking surfaces.”

12. Section 1010.1.6 Landings at doors. Add Subsection 1010.1.6.1: “1010.1.6.1 Landing frost protection.
Exterior landings required by Section 1010.1.5 to be at the same elevation on each side of the door shall be
provided with frost protection.”

13. Section 1028.5 Access to a public way. Add at the end of the section: “Components of exterior walking
surfaces shall be hard-surfaced.”

14. Section 1030.4 Window wells, Add Subsection 1030.4.3: *1030.4.3 Window well drainage. All window
welis shall be provided with approved drainage.”

15. Section $§704.2.9.6.1 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. Delete existing text and insert
in lieu thereof: “Storage of Class I and I liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited within
the limits of the Residential (R), Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and PUD zoning districts established by
City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

16. Section 5706.2.4.4 Locations where above-ground tanks are prohibited. Delete existing text and insert
in lieu thereof: “Storage of Class I and II liquids in above-ground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited within
the limits of the Residential (R), Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and PUD zoning districts established by
City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

17. Section 5806.2 Limitations, Delete existing text and insert in lieu thereof: “Storage of flammable cryogenic
fluids in stationary containers outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits of the Residential (R),
Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and PUD zoning districts established by City of Story City Code of
Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

18. Section 6104.2 Maximum capacity within established limits. Delete existing text and insert in lieu
thereof: “The aggregate capacity of any one installation of liquefied petroleum gas storage shall not exceed a
water capacity of 2,000 gallons within the limits of the Residential (R), Commercial (C), Conservation (F), and
PUD zoning districts established by City of Story City Code of Ordinances Chapter 165-168.”

156.10 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE. The provisions of the International Property Maintenance Code, 2018
edition, as published by the International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions,
modifications, insertions, and deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City
Property Maintenance Code, hereinafter referred to as “this code”.”

2. Section 102.3 Application of other codes. Delete existing text and insert: “Repairs, additions, or alterations
to a structure, or change of occupancy, shall be done in accordance with the procedures and provisions, as
applicable, of the Story City Building Code, Story City Energy Conservation Code, Story City Existing Building
Code, Story City Fire Code, Story City Fuel Gas Code, Story City Electrical Code, Story City Mechanical Code,
Story City Residential Code, and Story City Plumbing Code.”

3. Section 103.5 Fees. Delete “as indicated in the following schedule™ and insert in lieu thereof “in accordance
with the schedule as established by the code official”.

4. Section 112.4 Failure to comply. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who shall continue any work
regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by
law.”

5. Section 302.4 Weeds. Insert: *12 inches™.

6. Section 304.14 Insect Screens. Insert: “April 1™ and “October 31",



7. Section 404.4.1 Room area. Delete “one person” and insert in lieu thereof “iwo persons”.
8. Section 602.3 Heat supply. Insert: “October 1" and “April 30”.
9. Section 602.4 Occupiable work spaces. Insert: “October 1" and “April 30”.

156.11 ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE. The provisions of the International Energy Conservation Code as
currently adopted and amended by the lowa State Building Code Bureau shall apply to all matters governing the design
and construction of buildings for energy efficiency. Administration shall be as prescribed in the Story City Building
Code and these regulations shall be known as the Story City Energy Conservation Code. Construction or work for which
a permit is required shall be subject to 3rd party inspections. The Building Official is authorized to accept reports of
approved inspection agencies, provided such agencies satisfy the requirements as to qualifications and reliability. Any
portion that does not comply shall be corrected and such portion shall not be covered or concealed until authorized by
the Building Official.

156.12 EXISTING BUILDING CODE. The provisions of the International Existing Building Code, 2018 Edition, as
published by the International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions, modifications,
insertions, and deletions:

i. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City
Existing Building Code.

2. Section 106.1 General. Delete “in two or more sets™.

3. Section 106.3.1 Approval of construction documents. Delete this section.

156.13 SWIMMING POOL AND SPA CODE. The provisions of the International Swimming Pool and Spa Code,
2018 Edition, as published by the International Code Council, are hereby adopted, subject to the following additions,
modifications, insertions, and deletions:

1. Section 101.1 Title. Delete existing text and insert: “These regulations shall be known as the Story City
Swimming Pool and Spa Code, hereinafter known as “this code”.

2. Section 105.3 Construction documents. Delete “in two or more sets”.
3. Section 105.5.6 Retention of construction documents. Delete the final sentence of this section.

4. Section 105.6.2 Fee schedule. Delete existing text and insert: “A fee for each permit required by this code
shall be paid as required, in accordance with the schedule as established by the Building Official.”

5. Section 105.6.3 Fee refunds. Delete existing test and insert: “The building official is authorized to establish
a refund policy.”

6. Section 107.4 Violation penalties. Delete existing text and insert: “Any person who shall violate a provision
of this code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter or repair
a pool or spa in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit
issued under the provisions of this code, shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law.”

7. Section 107.5 Stop work order. Delete the final sentence of this section and insert in lieu thereof: “Any
person who shall continue any work regulated by this code after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject
to penalties as prescribed by law.”

SECTION 2. REPEALER. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the provisions
of this ordinance are hereby specifically repealed.



SECTION 3. SEVERABILITY CLAUSE. If any section, provision or
part of this ordinance shall be adjudged to be invalid or unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect

the validity of the ordinance as a whole or any section, provision or part thereof not adjudged invalid or
unconstitutional.

SECTION 4. WHEN EFFECTIVE. This ordinance shall be in effect from and after its adoption
by the City Council and publication thereof as provided by law.

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 5' day of September, 2023.

ATTEST:
Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk




MINUTES RE: ORDINANCE 339:

The foregoing ordinance was considered for the first time by the City Council on
August 7, 2023. It was moved by Councilperson Phillips, and seconded by
Councilperson O’Connor, and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the Council, as
follows:

AYE: Phillips, O’Connor, and Sporleder

NAY:

ABSENT: Ostrem and Solberg

The ordinance was considered for the second time by the City Council on August 21,
2023. The second reading was moved by Councilperson , and seconded by

Councilperson » and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the
Council, as follows:

AYE:

NAY:

ABSENT:

The ordinance was considered for the third and final time by the City Council on
September 5, 2023. The third and final reading was moved by Councilperson , and

seconded by Councilperson » and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of
the Council, as follows:

AYE:

MAY:

ABSENT:

WHEREUPON, the Mayor declared Ordinance No. 339 duly passed and the title agreed
upon this 5% day of September, 2023.

ATTEST:
Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk




ORDINANCE NO. 340

AN ORDINANCE CLARIFYING SERVICES CHARGES AND RATES FOR SERVICE
BY AMENDING SECTIONS 92.01 AND 92.02 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES OF
THE CITY OF STORY CITY, IOWA.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE INFORPORATED CITY OF STORY
CITY, IOWA:

SECTION 1. Sections 01 and 02 of Chapter 92 of the Story City Code of Ordinances
(Sections 92.01 and 92.02) are hereby repealed in its entirety and replaced with the following:

92.01 SERVICE CHARGES. Each customer shall pay for water service provided by the City
based upon use of water determined by meters provided for in Chapter 91. Each location, building,
premises, connection, or individual rental unit within a rental property which is served off of a
single meter shall be considered a separate and distinct customer, whether owned or ontrotled by
the same person.

92.02 RATES FOR SERVICE. Water service shall be furnished at the following monthly rates
within the City:

1. Base Rate (Minimum Bill). Each customer, including each individual rental unit within a
rental property served by a single meter, shall pay a base rate of $20.04 per month. Consumers
with yard meters shall pay an additional base rate of $6.22 per month for each yard meter.

2. Usage Rate. In addition to the base rate, each customer shall pay for water used at the rate
of $6.22 for any amount up to 100 cubic feet and $6.22 per 100 cubic feet for amounts over 100
cubic feet, prorated to the actual amount used. This usage rate shall increase by $0.20 per 100
cubic feet beginning with the November 2021 billing, and an additional $0.20 each November in
the years 2022, 2023 and 2024.

The Base Rate shall automatically increase by 3 percent (3%) or an amount equal to the increase
in the Consumer Price Index, whichever increase is less, at the November billing each year.

SECTION 2. REPEALER. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with the
provisions of this ordinance are hereby specifically repealed.



SECTION 3. SEVERABILITY CLAUSE. If any section, provision or part of this
ordinance shall be adjudged invalid or unconstitutional, such adjudication shall not affect the

validity of the ordinance as a whole or any section, provision or part thereof not adjudged invalid
or unconstitutional.

SECTION 4. WHEN EFFECTIVE. This Ordinance shall be in effect from and after its
adoption by the City Council and publication thereof as provided by law.

PASSED, ADOPTED AND APPROVED this 5 day of September, 2023.

Mike Jensen, Mayor ATTEST: Heather Slifka, City Clerk
I hereby certify that the foregoing was published as Ordinance No. 340 on the day of
September, 2023.

Heather Slifka, City Clerk



MINUTES RE: ORDINANCE 340:

The foregoing ordinance was considered for the first time by the City Council on
August 7, 2023. It was moved by Councilperson Sporleder, and seconded by

Councilperson Phillips, and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the Council, as
follows:

AYE: Phillips, O’Connor, and Sporleder

NAY:

ABSENT: Ostrem and Solberg

The ordinance was considered for the second time by the City Council on August 21,
2023. The second reading was moved by Councilperson , and seconded by

Councilperson » and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of the
Council, as follows:

AYE:
NAY:
ABSENT:

The ordinance was considered for the third and final time by the City Council on
September 5, 2023. The third and final reading was moved by Councilperson , and
seconded by Councilperson , and, on roll call, carried by an aye and nay vote of

the Council, as follows:

AYE:

NAY:

ABSENT:

WHEREUPON, the Mayor declared Ordinance No. 340 duly passed and the title agreed
upon this 5" day of September, 2023.

ATTEST:
Mike Jensen, Mayor Heather Slifka, City Clerk




DATE: August 16, 2023

TO: Theresa Stromberg-Murphy, P.E.
Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc,
1523 §. Bell Avenue, Suite 101
Ames, IA 50010

RE: 1-35 Industrial Park Building—Site Plan Review
Project No. 7044.011
City of Story City, lowa (City)

FOX Strand has completed the second review for the I-35 Industrial Park Building Site Plan as received
on August 15, 2023 via email. Please address the following comments:

General Comments
l. This review letter does not make comment on fire code, sprinkling requirements or fire
accessibility. At the time of this letter, no fire department comments have been received.

FOX Strand recommends approval of the Site Plan subject to the comments above. Please provide a
signed .pdf of the storm water calculations via email for our records.

Please deliver 15 signed half-sized plan sets to City Hall by Thursday, August 17, 2023 at 12pm
(noon) for P&Z and Council review.

Site Plan Review Schedule
Planning & Zoning; August 21, 2023 at 5:15 P.M. at Story City City Hall
Council Meeting: August 21, 2023 at 6 P.M. at Story City City Hall
If you have any questions or concerns, please contact Mitch Holtz at 515-233-0000.
Sincerely,

FOX Strand

oY

itch Holtz, P.E.

c: Mark Jackson, City Administrator, City of Story City

MSH:5iRS\AMENT000--7099\7044\01 NCorrespondence\Reviews\2nd Reviewi2023 08 16 - SP - 35 Lot 2 Building - 2nd Review,docx



100 V0 SE255 dVIN NOLLVOOT

V RqmEo-appesdeD

T

JVIS OL 10N

dVIAL ALINIDIA

sviaa 0930052 L

MY DrLVIYSONYT a0 %
Nvd NOLNIATHY NOLUTTICH WELLYM WHOLS [-15 3+ m

Y] DNEOVID oD m Bl NOSBEOOW
- anammonma o SNOLLVOLIIDAJS QIVANVLS L

P e - ALID AMOILS 0 ALID FHL ANV (SVANS) NOLLIad sﬁz_m
sims un oov £207 ‘SLNAWAAOAIAT JITENd HO4 SNOLLVIIIIDALS 2
p—— R TIVANVLS NVEEN SAQIMALV.LS VAOI FHL 2

HLIA SONVAE0ODV NI 38 TTVHS STVTHALVIA ONV Hd0Mm

i
Z, {5 -y
E
&
¥
1S:
Liabe:]
2
§
F %

INAWHAV ‘SALLITLLN ‘ONIAVIO

~¢20C~
VMOI ‘ALID AYOLS
DONIATING dAVd TVIILSIANI $¢-1

{0010 I33HS _ 9LI0-5062 ON LOSr0Hd vBo Je———— h

013 B L Jom) L3 SEL LV Sleracid S0 CAT

B e




ZOFC&ZmOmZHA<MmZmU YAMOI AL AYOLS

NIQTING Y¥Vd TYRILSOQANI SE-1l—

!

Y-

3
L2153 L) s 0 Wb Ly el Dbty urunty
L1 T5 ] wed 09 01 w00} @IS, OPES NS U
W4 96901 [T
W 0000 wed 0%
we gL ey 05

N uamniding on 1w un obwmuts 1y wnwmmy

bl vopmndey ON W mwribg U weuy K] WUy
sodg weiy

1m0 Elamnp Anse T P1sig Buwoz sguopddy
25040u[
DN A0 W) W04 0 RS
“Aatng 30 Aqunte?y Ay Ax09E 10 KD 41 )0 suopmnBey BuioZ SUrSLd POOL 991 Jedeyn T Bupo? ‘paL. seaceyn uodn peesg)

amarary souspdwon Bupoy

NAROREL LON A'LIMESRN 1 HOBM 50 FOMILLITO BHL
L0 B AV BREEHL ATND RLYISOOOMSY ClRaBORNOS

ALRY WL NN VI VT

S3INVAROD ALINLLN

S03LT W00 NHOM 0131

'NOUWYYJTUL 40 31vD

-oﬁ-#nuéaeE'eE@éﬂE

TWAHE YAVD ¥ AT ALPWNG TIRLMLLY BIVANEENE 40 MOLS O TWLMODIOM
ALYWEDje/v ¥ ZONLLCE Sl BRI O SOOMLIN WOREAHGOND

'-_--oﬂ*#amine?

F TELNCZIOM PRI ¥ NP ALMELN WO WALMELLC I BDa 0L U0

L A CGENEYLI0 SILLULY 0 NOU VIO TILLMEA ¥ WLNCZWOH IR - vl

il CRRIYICT il '!EE-B- ERATT ALTYND FHIN SRJALENA AFA T

peli§3decsozppyfvanantessdazsnerrnyy

FT 20 LINER Bl IWY BONNYEA T L3

‘gHOJFY 40 WINMO

MEPRO0 INSTIEVE WOLLYVRLLINGSD SNkl -
TNOWY MW O Loeoe
TV S ETLvORe
TWVHPOE MBS RpFERIVORY

LNIOICT SAI0) 101 WO TR -

LNITING VI LNSARACD v
WM A vnohow
i Ove ACUEE ubeweieOle

oLy
Y3 2OV MOTIA 1 2
WOUMEE0  Aad [ =] e PRV = = e e =

SINIOd TOHLINOD

NOLLAIHDS30 VDI

TERRe  umeyr gy me

W  s860-Z6Z-009-1
TIVO iNO
ISso_@

v e =
onmoe
1804
o -
WELLIN DNORY .
TE DNMOINON L]
om0t Rt -
[T d
SORLON $¥ uaL) WS E-3
BT T &
0L, FOVVOLY DHNOHENIIN =
YL IVO an
0v1 Lam @
LT 3
Tances m
T [ ]
1O =
v &
o @
e 0|
e L
s ~r
PRT [
il W (8D &
[ ]

a
g
|

- Sy (LD Tt - SO0 Sl 1 441

Lo TR )




NV'1d NOILI'TOWAd VMOI'ALID A4OLS i~ meaa T - = =
¥ SNOLLIGNOD ONLLSIXT  IONIATING YAVd TVRILSAANI S€-I—=3x—==| =z T S — 78 S S— T
B TUm _ _ _
n_-ld.El“! m m
kS b ——— bk = = ettt
»n e N ﬂiFu.FnVl“usiﬂl #lehulua.lummmmﬂlﬂﬁlnnﬁﬁllﬂm.ﬂfnﬂhhh&lﬂlm.mm.m“n1 |il..||.|.|H|H||||m|.|.."_M|H.|| ||._n Fre) '
b | Tar L LT T 1 t
| | pmeme 1FIyLS Aarto Hod  _ Cgmms | 1 4 B
; [ o [ e P I
T..----T ; T e T e W -H.iwmwwﬂd.u..”.i..ﬁ.... Bt S
T I_u" e e - ey B e
..I.. lllll *l ; M | m:._a.lx—
ly TS _ v
emiwmug poay e el ¢ N -
.!I.l-h"—dl / _ —l l-
[ 3 ** il | A0V O 5 | __\ I
_ﬂ M m H 1l \_.l - i | o
R Iy N
Hlos MR It _ L
H AN L “ /v i o ma IR
= L \ 3 [ !
HEER R LTI ' ; | \
HER ol I~y N _ _
HEES i _ V! _ _
iyl = T n _ \ “ _ _
I & |1 \ I I
1 | | m
(AL . o s
I N J - Cat :
IR A e
_ e L]
I _ﬂ} \ _ . [
e | {00 [ | i |
_.m illu!-/. “_ﬂL i _ _
| geatf 8l |1 _ _ - =l
§] bt * i I I I 6
_ “ “ 1 II=|L| NOVRLIS LNOKA 05 _ _ l_w.!:-uai
b s SR i w2
I i ! / L aM__ | _dm _ J L. LTINS TSN
¥ 1N AN FAION NOUDNHIENGS NOUHGAaE ki
he 1 A ey o | S | R e, o S S X P
_ L |ale.¢|c-| i} |l|ll/.;|ll||l ||||| Bt [ ﬁr llllllllllllll !Ei.ﬁﬁﬁqﬁi&.ﬁdﬁl&gi u
m e L \ s . P e e
‘ LN ~ e mesrvne DL A IS G ST TR SO
_ it o Ery e T e e L T
| i ) Iigahuﬂﬂl!ﬁ_ﬁﬂ
§ { __"_ a% "SAL0ON NOLMOWS0 TVEaNTD
N |

ks I LEFI00 MUT g ) B H ) RS LA DA




1
—— e — — — =

_:_;I":_.,_:.EZ'. T

——————
et Y

ST WRLLE- L T




) NV1d ONIAvadD - — e
~ =] L= =
-
|
i
|
_ ‘o
“ =
_ =
| S
| )
-
o
| =
[ B e
_ a ] [} k]
_ FSRSEE LA PO TV avail
|
| stl—s—] sz
| _ T~
_ ‘]
i H
_ 200
f
_ MALIVY SOV OB T
| WO meOvoN T RaT
TIA g0 RGLOS -~
_ T 90 JOL L
_ Ll M0 o
_ AP0 HO -
_ D 40 0L o0l
| [EGEEQ
|
IO Y Nt i Wil BY B30 A LIV 1Y WOBS0L
RP b bl J
TS NN W L ANOWYL TWHE SOLOVMLNGD
WE QR L0M THAE Shal il TAON) FWABOE T
FONTIN T PO AVMY N0 QL BOVWD T
L MPHE VLYW TN LON TIVHE SR04
S310N DNIQVED WHINTO
N

SZTHA- LS G50 - 003 Ml Pendd i 3° A SOTMRE PSR T




NV1d NOLINGATdd
NOLLNTT0d ¥31vM WaoLs  ONIATING XAVd TVRLLSOANT Se-I|——3e———) _ =

£01 DR IVONE
M TSN LSO 40 P §¥ CRACRIY 9 0L 4308 0L 190400 T {5}

AVMIEYdS NOISIDTNS

40 ONB BHL 1 OBuDLEI T CRnCmln B Gl - VIRY LG v, RASRDMGS TRLEN @
A0 P JO QN BHL LY SRAOTNY B8 OJ - WOLLORLIONWN LN TIVLIW @
L Ol ML
$O 00 B vV (7
‘SALON NOLDMLLSNOD 0
am AULNGD FHL 36 TIWHS MGOM SIHL BOS 1S0DTHL '3
"NOLYENSNDD WHOLLIOOY LNOH1M
NOLLIGNCY TYAIN0 Ot NGNS HO/ONY "3V ki3 "UVaSY "NOWNIAT B0 SNOLLOY
TVIIINEY DIVL HSMMO 3HL 0L LS00 ON IV & Sh530 otk
ANV SAONTH IS MOS0 IHL W0k ALHSd0M] J1YAR B0 JNENd DNNONTY
NO SRAIIQ WO NOUYLTS HIHYT 30 NOLLY TN INSATH] TIVHE BOLIWEINOD 3HL
NOLLYSNIINGD
TYNOLLIODY LNOHLIM TELL GIEVIVG ANV NOLLIGNGS TYADIG (L NI BOANY
TIVLIEY WV SRV HIHY g!ﬂhﬁ:o:ﬁ-!.ﬂiigg
ANTNEAY 'SIANG STIVM ‘E3WVH0 FovRvg
NNV ONY 'STIOMIA ghétﬁaop%ghdsngao a
.zq:ﬁEﬂ;ﬂnzaE_._..EW::ﬂ._. 45 5V OINYINVI 39 ALDVYD HEHL 0509 LS SAVH SIUMLYES SHL NSHAL NIOZY TIVHS §30A50 T0MINOD LN 30
LS SN0 X LANOH 341 DNGITYNIS OL HOR Y3 SNNYID O0REd LOVALNGG FHL LNOHONOWHL HEHL BNIY WEH HO ‘DNIN.dSH 'ONINYTT) BNGIMION 3080 Ol LJ3NANS JHV SNOLLYHM0 HONS .,_o..-ﬁmcou.uﬂ_awtﬁinuugmcﬂﬁ.ﬁaozﬁzoo»i
ggzﬂuig!gghﬂﬁdlgﬁig W30k M WRLNGO ™ L TRANDI § BOLOVELNOD U S50 NV TOUIIN0D OV “VRILSTIGNE TVILLSNION ONY TVIDH2IN0D
FLERONOD TS5 MO CINVANDD ONY CINLED 28 TIVHS AN TIHEVM SHY SHENLL 3 RONCD SONVIELNIVW 8
T SYRAY TV SIN0S NOLLATIOA HHLD ONY 'ENOUYIO WLSANIQ! SYRIY ST Oy
AdOLISOLIA ALSYM, ‘SIALIEIVA AHVLNYS TIEVLEOH V¥ DRNINS CAIOMTINI NOWNTIOY T L LY 1935 N SNORLY DS W01 ONV SIVLE VKR TTV OL BMOHOTIV STYOREHI NV INGD Ez‘u!ggﬁg:ﬁg SALNLIY TANINORIDY Trony
WUNILO 30 S30UN0S TIV S0 INSINIYINGO SIAOWE TIVHS BOLOVEINGD TVHINTD 3ML D CENONYH 20 THM ATHL CRELINNCONT JH¥ SNOUWILLES KNS N3HM '0JU3INNOSNT 30 T STYRELLYI
NARORDINN JTHA IS TW ENOLLYTLLS LvHIL TWES0d €1 11 NOLLINMISNOD SiHL JO SEOD 3H) Deline SV STWINOE S35 0NV SLROSS-ALE CUL CALY T ELNVLFTTIOH SIORVA
UINMO 3HL AD 034D 39 TIVHS SNOLLYIC Jd ¥O0US DI SNYId TWI0T 50 JLYLS QIAOHIY '§ NIYLNGD NYD 350NN SHHL ATVUNGLOW cdd SIL 30 I0HINOD SHL ONCASE $1 1VHL O LSO HON
HIOLE LY A EINLYES TRUNOD NOSCUI HLM OTTICWLNOG 2SWAEHLO HIHLO B0 ZONVASANCT EIOWOkR dod SIHL UBASMOH *LN3AS TRIOLS ¥ 20 LVIS5UV SV GUUOLSHVIL 38
o T9 ASTWY SAV #1 N L E] LONSTR OIS TV '8 A TIVHS SHOUVIIOR HO ST ‘SMYY VI HIAHM INSINKEES ONY S105 01 YT MI0M SHL 30 1S5 E—EEE
SAUMALSTe TUON SHL ‘SNOUYINETH ONY STV SAYT TVLNSNNGGAOD WEHLO HUM LONINGD ¥ S0 LINSAT 3HL N NOLLMTIOW 40 S3DHN0S TVUNALO ¢
LIObd FHL 40 ONG FHL L¥ TEAOA gﬁ&ﬂgsﬁggiigm;égﬂqbgznfg
30 TIVHE 1V INIINSOROINGY AL SHE LIS SHELL WOHLNOD NOSOUS TTV ' dddMS 3HL TIVHS SAUEYM 33NN 20 WSO HOLIVIINGD HEANM WIS THE OL NEHL WELLEAS HIMIS HOLE ALID ANOUS O MO TIWA HHOM STHL FI0US 230NN THHO
HUW HINIS BRUNINNDO0 ONY ATLLYKINA §310M3LE0 SS0HL DNLISUB0D SIONZOLE0 SIOUINGD H3HLO » SUIINOMT LOIOU] SHL 1¥ TTH NO 53 THM NYId SHL 30 AJOD ¥ “SIOHLNOD TVHILISNHLENON NV TVRNLINKLS
ANY 30 TVHE LI HOTYIN ONY 'S30WHE HILO "5340 TOMdAL 0 SNOUYIOT b0H SLTTHS DNIOVLS SHL ONV 13345 SHL O WIS
gf&dﬁ%ﬁi%:n&ﬁigggﬂ “EVIMY (SENWLEXT TIY 30 NOULYLZOAN 0
QMY CEERISY NVl s L AOTIAI0 O A BUOLIVHLNGD UL HLA G0N 39 TIA NOWMRLLSNOD SHL NOLVELEIAM 0T34 HELAY HEINIDNE SHL AS (EMNGE130 00000¢ 30 TIM NOLLTLAI00 KLY 4 TIHL MOJ UDRANN 2N
W §1 1l WOLOVHINOD ML AH ATV INOTH CELLVEN 30 OL 1 LVHL AdebS I, 30 IV ¥ £ HOLIYH I NGOG H0 Stk BHI AB (TTTIVLEH 39 TIVHE SIUNEVIR S1vRIIOUAIY HIHIO ONY "SaviL FOVIIAY GIUVITUES SHL NOUVIDOSTY 208 MALSTIM-IITIONIN-RORYTS 30 VIV NV N1 GALYOOT S déd BHL
MEHLYY LD (WS} NV NOUNSASR U3LY) ;::nBEBl.ooU.:Bzﬂmﬂﬂﬂmﬁ LNIWOIS W3RNV TV MYLLLE Sv HONG S0k NHOM JHL SY
.¢ CRRINLEKD DNGEE IOV LEE SYH LOVKINGD BHL AR TIREADD ddd 3HL
X735 L HLM N INOD 36 TIVHS MICM BHL 0 NOUBOY HL TIRINUSH] DHEE SIUOV 166 TAVINLST NV HLM SOV 255 AELLYWKDHCAY SHIN0D) ded SHL
INCLLS NOONT B0 ZHOLS ¥ ESYTD END0E OLIVH 30 351 3L AD CITIORINGS BHIAYG ¥ DROVUD SN ‘NOLLIEE DNITHE ‘NOLLNORED
30 AYW SSUNLIYSH 3L 90U JOVHIE SHL 30 ALDOTIA SHL SRIVUO ONI JOTRIE ONY DNIOEIS THL SOELNC 35N 30 TIVHS NIITION) YAD! 'ABOLS: M DNKTHOA Jd¥d TYItLSKIN 56+ BO0S §1-lde) MY NOULNSATG NOLLTTIOH St
SNIVHA 3015 TSMIVEOENS QUVONYLS ONY TYNIGNUIDNG 30 SMYH0 3OVUNSANS G30MION SHL SOQHLIN DNCTUGVLS U#L0 ﬁggﬂ!gﬁnﬂ_ﬂﬁuﬂ%g!.ﬂa NOLLJIEDS3Q LS |
S3IDHYHISID WHDLSHON § L LSV SV HOS VWY (R9HMLSIO Y N HNOOO O TENNY M LOK 51 ALALLSY NOUDNEULENGS 3 ‘TaLIMULSNGD
Y SYEUY CIEULLE0 THL §V TUTWN00 58 TIVHS KN ONCTREV.S ASVHOMEL SDIVINI 15310kd O ONY i SHL N 0N GY NOWTTION LNZLOS
“NOUDSISN FHL 30 SAVG VONT VD € MILM 02LT W00 34 TIVHS SHOLLIY IS HALN0 SV INTTYANDS B0 SING 1S DNIGN SO0MION TIM SHL HEINONS LON0KA S AS TIN0M S0 SOUMOS ¥ 51 ME0M SSDHM SHOLOVEINODGINS HUM (ERVIHS ETHINN 30 TIVKS ALMEQIENOLS) SHL
SAUIEHRIO0 TH “SNOSIASH TIV INGINT T TIWHS HOLOVHINOD SHL “NOLLI3HSN) 211 20 SONINS SV HOXINY SNV Id IHL N 30 TiHg 580 Q3 TR SNAMOULIN 1IVAINGD SAALLNG HEHL U0 iddl NVLd HOUNZADMG NOLTTIOH SHE 30 NOLLYLNGNE P ONY ZONVTIN0D HO
FHL N0 (SEVE TSSWIM 59 AV ddd SEHL "ABVIO L3N0 WO LITI00 dddMS SH1L NI TIOTM ST 003 TR0 DNLLIFRAM ‘SHOCS TITH L5002 "SMEVE LS ‘TONEH LS TYHOLLIOGY "30VHD TTASNOGET 30 TIVHE HOLOVHINGD IWhid TH1 LS LIAN0H IHL SANSFN]3E L
38 TIVHS NOLLDIASHE SHU S0 SDRIONI 3HL "ONNOJ SIEDNSIIS0 TIY NO NOLIY JAUSTRIOD TN HEHL HOVE SYRY BY (ANIST 39 TIVHE NOLDMLINGS B0 QXT3N LON SV N NOUY1F0IA NOISORE STZIENIA LYHL USNNYIN ¥ N SNOUYISDO0 HOHL LONONOD TIVHS v
NFOE AEIGIN T “BAVD NIAZS ANSAD VY TS0 TADN NVD SHONNY MM SNOUYIO LV LIS 39 O) YV JHL 20 413005 JHL DO (RO
ALMOHLY IHLONY SHL AS A 1LNOr 3OV 30 TIHE ENOUDSIEN 28 TIVHS 204 LIS 'SNOUVHEA0 DNESNUD ONY DNV HO ‘NOUY, >¢Hn.uz.nsBeE NV1d NOILN3ASYd ROLLNTIOd
SNOLLIIJSNI £




1

W VMOI ‘AL A¥OLS T T Tom= - H. . . )
wEE  NVIdavosaNvI NIQTING YAV TVRIISOONI Se 1= . oS5 = i

|
|

.
0
&5
&
[
1]
&y
=
—
|
(=1
x
B
4
=1

D il { - (2510 0w D dep Pulioeabd iy | DOLD SCHLTWORRS PRl -IHEPS

I
+
il
+*
+!
*
o
8-
+*
"k
L
+
+
of
N
N
oL
"
s-
+
W
N
Fw
tkt

L i I S T R S S S S + 0+ o+ 4
L T T T O A I I I R
L T R T T T I R ) @ ++++++++ + +
L T T S e A T T T T S S

+*
+

2\

+*
+

L B N T SO NN, SO, UL SO, JOUL. S, . L. UL . . . R N
.—. + o+ ¢._..u.ld.|lﬁI«|+I?I|¢l-ﬁ-!ﬂ!¢|v.«-.4 2 ANt 2k 2l i o x i 4
+l+ + ¢+l 3+ + + + I TR R T . JONDRIVHRINMIE + + + + + - -

+
L )
+

+ ¥
+ .

+

—
+
+
+
»
+
= 3
-
»
+
+
* o+ b
+ + + o+ 4
+ o+
— e~
+ o+
+ o+
+ o+

+
+

+
+
+
+
IR NN N N N N N N N T
¥

* +

+ o+ * ko

+
*
-

.. v.... .. . ... . ........ .. - .. .... -... . ... . -... .. . ... .- .. + * ¥ hi
* *

+
+
+

UEANMO 4L A Q3ADESSY BY SEYHD SN, 3N ANLGH
UM (5000% 3 TG £056 SdvISONYT O LNIM3AYY

+
+ o+
+
Ll e B e e Sk =
+ + o+
LR R I T I N

AVMNEVYL NOISIOFHS

+
+

+ o+
+

30 NO TEALYTION Y (B NI SLNVM T 34 N0 VIS 3
A W Al
TWHS BOLIVHINGD IHL “TIMIHIE LN D IHL O TN

+
+
+ o+

LI I

e reoww e v a0 MY 25¥35K0 ‘RLIISH K T Y SNOMOCIA AHINVGH
TN T T T LT 'UNO% ‘WD JRIRIN 30 TV RELWI LW T
“BOLLSRLIVHAD TYLLMIEE IWYE DNLAVH

SIN3W3HINOIY 30vdS N3O 1NV 30 ALTHVA 30 T09 LETIWAINO3 LESHVN 30 TVHE

LIS N I B R B

+
+ 4+

‘NOLLYWHOANI ALS ‘B L BRMOTIO
+ 4+ - . o+

+ -

"
LI S O I S R I B DR T I IR T U R IR I
LI I S I

“HOUKE ANZYRI LSOM B0
g POOL-OSZ [EWY HIOLE ARISHNN M0 CHVONY.LS NYIRCNTY 0L

P Pmp——— FRIOI0D TS WRILLVIN LY 30 ALWIO Ooiv 308 'Oradl 1T
bt @ “TELIRHON] T RLON0U LI £

I 30 HL30 ¥ QU PO34 DNLRY Id TIV N ONY SIRIL TV ONNCHY
- Moy E!@ gggggdﬂé ]

i SHERVE MY SILILNVIYD 1D DMLY WD MO TIRIENGSR

S HOLOVEINDD "SNN000 LOMLINGD A TYATHE TV
Bt o 1 Ba ) OAYEN) A THO MOLLYYRIOS 10 T SALLUMND LNVL ')
“SILON NOLLDNHLSNOD I4VISaNY SALON 3dvISaONY

|

4 04
+¢4+4+4¢¢¢4f++4|ﬁ¢0 440¢lﬂ|o|vco
L R T T T T T I T R S TR T - S R R T
R I I I I R A A I I N T

L N . N N T T .

++++++++

T

|
|

L] whfur] ) S0 WER0S ), DL

1] L E ] W My NY

9 o), SapoD Reomuey Mpop MpRouin 0D

FIE RIRSAG SRR

.ﬁa “ALD VN NCreDd SN TYOINYL0G A
FINAIFHIS LNV

gD ST
R 5T
ANJ 0L

7 el




EEI

VAMOI 'ALID ABOLS T T B — -

$TIv.Lad NIQTINE YAVd TYRLISNANT §¢-1|——o— sl -5 b

ANGIEAY D 3HL N ATIVOUEA HYE BNOUO-NGR HUNZD @

|
|

il 1NERGAVA 503503 ANIGAYY 407003
GNOADE 2 (0dS) ALSNIT ANOASY It WOdSH AUSNIO ONOAZE 02 404E) ALSNI
HOLOOH (VONYS %58 BOLDOM UVONYLE %56 WOLIOU CUVONVLE %98
OLELINVINGS T8 TVHE LGN W TS OL ELWMOOTOTIHE
AVHDANS 30 24 dOL SRS S0 at500 P o
<] IV MI‘ V
Wi & = [avivem— . s -+— e
oS8 Y & k.- CHEVEETY s _ et S
T T WD N
P T I T 1 X el v 4
£ A ada T | _ Wy
u3d 7] e e
TV 360 g U3 o

5005 P iSTI0 M5 D LRI T SN

0




i
I
i
f

5 YMOL ALID AMOLS (ST S e
ﬁ sTv.iad _waoa:m MUV TYRILSAANI §§-1|——mo——me| __ -

IOV ONY LELLTMVICE HOMI #2 SHOMAY TTV 29901
NO (NOAY 5Y YL 3EYE IS} 2U¥Wd 301 (EZINVATVE TIVASN g 0

L
“R1706 HLM "ENOUYINEYL TINGEOd

TIHIVLLY TIENY HSNEALE GIZIVATYE ¥ HUM TYINES dd''S 36 A NOwY
TNCHS 003 (EOWOINIZ SHL V0KV OMY S3HONI 06 S278 NO L 1DVHINGD 29204

F AN

“NOUJY T A FHL SO NOLLYTIVAS HI O NOUY S

O NOUYSNIINGD T S1:TYLIN "SNObdY, HO-A 0 3Dtd WYL S0 1Hvd S¥ CTENCTH ATHWISO3SE NSHA w.
NOLLYTIVASNI HO DNTIONYH ONMNO0 HI000 YHL SNLIYDD BHL E =

0L FOVIVD U0 DAYIUE NOLLIVESUYS SHNIDNT SHL 01 Wvaedd 3

"FENAS DNMANOD TAAOMY WO Lk 11 SVRIZLIVW OL v334

.%
§§
3
|
i
B
el
BN,
LLERIELLE
! Ll ‘l‘hhhh&iﬂt
B3 | et

0L 03NT LSV ATSHNDSS Drakd DNEIS 3ADRGDY NY 350 5
AL NOLLVDIHOD TN S0 S1 LHEATD G0N A 9

AHIATD QL A0 NSV O MWD U0 108 T3A0HY
NV T8N Al TVLINRIEEIWIOMD 30 51 LEEATD TYAHON A Y

‘SMOTIO] B Idid LEATYED OU G3HIVLLY 38 AVIN SNOUDY

eS|
OF iy

“TYAOUdY B0 HEONONT SHL a [
OL G3IUNENS 38 AviA 2 W30 NOS A SLYIRELY SNOLLYOLRIZLS ®
QUYONYLS ML 30 191¥ NOLDES ML DNICINCS T3S
TIINYATYD MO TELLYDRITVA JEVATRYH ONY BNOHY TIVISN SNOGNAT)

dT i - £ 104 3 Ry A CH 005 3 - AR SE-C o R U

Z)
\aﬁﬂ\ m

-2




- STIV.1ad

CRININMIOA LIVILNGD SHL
NI L0365 NIHM O AUBOHLNY DHLLOVEUNGS SHL 51
NOUYLIOMENYEL 20 LINIRUYVIIO SHL NIHM T3}
=0 WL

TN LNOF

{
mAoms . 0 OIS NIHM HO 'ALRIOHLAIY ONULIVRLNGD St 51 |
2SOHIUVINOS ¥ HLW DHICYAS AS SENLLNG TULL LOVEN0O (2D FLNIOf NOLLOVHLNOD SSUAASNYIL o T e NOLLYLHOJENVALL 4O LNFALHY.E IHL NIHM TRAND T
-aMYL30

SIS TIMOG TLVRIAOMSY
MO WRILYW LNIOT NI STNOH WIOJIRC MO TR0 @

IV I-HLEYD 38 AYW SHYE EMOO

"SNOLLYDO DHYLNI LY "ANGNEAY HLM ONOE LNEATS

QU v M0 30 ON3 3 SHL V0D RN LG
ONY SIVAI] NOULVEEVS B0 SINaN355Y 13w 335 @

LFE) NS SUINDTR LON DNIDTS “OSIRI0] A

“39d GMNOS J0 HLGAD
L SANTTRIRU (D) INBNGAVS 0 QUM DNIAL KB (B)

Il OL LBOD WNOLLOAY ON Ly DNTIE0 3HL

Bt AYTE ONDD3S HEOHM

13 9 NYIHLL UESO0 ON 30V 1 "SLNIOT 00, B0 O Ny
NEIMLTE NOLLYIC TINYSOM ¥ LY LNIOE M0 2LV @

VL 325 uve =33 {(T)
EUVLIO NCILYDRIUVS U0d SINPAISEY BMD0 335 @

“TeON B0 JOL S0 TIENY

NV SAYH ONY HLENTTT NI Z 30 WORINIY ¥ 38 TIVHS SINIOE 2
“BONINTIS

WO MO INIONS AT Y $3dAL LNIOF INSIEAVG }

“SALON

S ST G2 D R STV IOG 3 O S EAS T DU




VMOIALID AHOLS

ONIATING YVd TVRILSNQNI ¢~

—_lll.l AW = paan SN 1
— A g U P i A, =
—aw———— omown | ey sempegyminy ] 1 [T N N 1
x )
W] T Pyl vy B
RS U Bl i [ ol I=
ol vemeni psap o | 3
Sl s 3
el s B
wmpe—rey el |
[3] £
L}
Al H
------- meRnm eo| |-
iiiiiii ropraony o ﬁ
™| |§
e pirdpiehi ) Y -]
ol e WR <1 ]
" ll 7]
Ty i
U 1 g, sk ol ), Ssrmat e T e R B AN 3]
S m_
i n 110
T B0 LU0 S Wt ST U ) sl iy 1w
T b8 Iy Varasandll Supin e ey Seanqey waey o
A i ibarkibgl ) 2l poinamieand il 6 e g = 14|
Wd Beaddens v W eEe AN iy poan ]
el v v Ay =)
iiiiiiiiiiiiiiii ) ]
e > LY hawy 3
BN Y B T A3 UM s 0L sbgfaoigh Uiy by []
wibarbrtny | weusmow
T Ty TR S 18 PR

Shuprg dns—.

HWYLI0

L3
\m...m..
e
o 7o
Tisa

gilnln..mu 8

G romarner

O Sy LR LAk ]
PO [,
R s

.* Iw o o




Construction Piy Estimate No. 3

Project Description: 2022 Water Main Improvement Project
Story City, lowa

Date of Contract: May 2, 2022

Contractor: Owner:

Keller Excavating City of Story City

Boone, lowa Story City, lowa

Base Contract Price $670,542.45 Materials on Hand $0.00
(See Attached Tab)

Change Order #1 ($194,447.02)

Change Order #2 $8,089.00 Construction Completed to Date $452,762.67
(See Attached Tab)
Total Amount Earned to Date $452,762.67
Less Previous Payment $286,507.26
Less Retainage 0.0% $0.00

TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE $484,184.43 _AMOUNT DUE THIS ESTIMATE $166,255.41

Requested by Contractor:

‘ W Secretary 8/2/2023
Kellér Excavat Title Date

Recommended by Engineer;

_‘_‘:MW"/“? - Tl Senior Project Manager 8/2/2023
Theresa Stromberg:Murphy Title Date
Clapsaddle-Garber Assoclates, inc.

Approved by Owner:
City of Story City Titie Date

Prepared by:
Clapsaddle-Garber Associates

Ames, lowa CGA Project No. 3391.06



ET

000215 z 000LZ 1S z 0008 0 0001 [oosees T | va B Xy 1000pon Builed Uy oRm] | 118
D0OVE LS L TWOKE 1§ l 000S 0 WOrs 1§ s b va A KL I EE
00'002°5$ 1 0000’58 | 00'0% 0 000058 [ooroas'ss 3 v3 X9 % .9 BARA F SAPUS Budan | ‘ERE.] VIRH JEM 05
00'00¢'SS \ 000055 1 0008 0 0000£'55 |00 00E S ! 3 PX Y Xy GNUA § SASe[S Dudd) ‘D] e JGEA 0
00 05rZLS SIS 00 08T L8 515 00s 7 00006685 |00921S 555 | 41 29 "dIQ SSRPUSIL IS 1) 505
0008 0 0008 0 0008 0 0000025 |0002S 0L | AS .0 '9SRaqng 1epwiei) 53
0008 0 0008 0 0008 0 000sS  |o0ozs % | AS - OSEGONG SRR 0T |
o008 0 0008 0 008 0 000858 |0wss 00t | AS L Ut A W0t
00526 6S Szt 00 52U'SS Szl 008 0 00008 1S |000sYS ¥ ar UORARIXD 107
LTreL'tLS ob'os 90208 LIZEL'SeS DOTES 6.3 STVIOL L NOISIAKG
T C Y A =T e — .=
Q3-01S ONY LINNOWY NOLLYONddY
Q3ILT N0 $) a3yols aoi3d SNOIATHd ADd
AINNOWY ATLNISTHd| SIHL LNNOWY $ ANNOWY L1IOVHLNOD
| $TvioL STYIMALYW $ V101
00'062'9% 520 0008 0 000588 520 0005.85 |00000GES | S20 | S1 UONRTHON 01t
0008 ] 0008 0 0008 0 000515 |SL 58 wz | 35 T1 8l sepng-usa] Wouswia) Bunoryy pus ‘Burme s ‘Bupess 10%
0005018 520 0008 0 0008018 SZ0 000S9LS (0000898 | S20 | 51 [ e X3
W 0 w008 0 W0 0 000558 |00558 oL | snoL wcapRy ¥ eAOWeY BuDeNg JERURID oL L
0008 o 000§ 0 o008 0 000558 |00Ses o | 4 ol W80 .i&u&ﬂ..!lil_lﬂsa 801
e 6ers S8 0008 0 BCBEPS 3 005765 |z ers 0 | I Ry ¢ ADLN ST e R ainD| | 204
Se95tS 1ey 90°Z9% GL0 65 v62S 95'E 0595118 _mw.a ¥l AS ey ¥ ADWRY ¥ '00d HewemS| S04
00 08}S F 0008 ) 000818 ZL 000128 [00StS ¥ | AS TeACIRy JeWeARg 73
00 G168 2l 0008 [ 006168 ZL 0FZIeS  Jovess ST | As ﬂ.nl_l_.an_ P d YWH t0L
[~ ooooLes z 0008 0000} 8% z 0000188 |00 0SS Y z va VU9 VS A IS
0005508 i 0008 0005588 L 0005558 [00055°08 3 va TueTsy JmipAH ey %8
000§ 0 000§ 0 0008 0 009168 |00Z218 [ a1 Z Ro W SRS IR €S
0000015 L 0008 0000015 L 0008 [00000°LS ] va 9X.9%.0 el Ty e JREN, 8s
000448 L 0008 0 00048 L 0005|0003 L va P X_p %y w1 TURid VIR SO s
00085'1§ z 0008 0 ~ 0009918 z D00S  |000CES 0 va Z\ X, ¥ Jeonpey "W M| - | EL5 |
005E9% 1 0008 0 00'5e88 T 005t0s  |00'5tos v va 0% ¥ 180npey ‘Dol ‘UeI JRe s
[~ ooosEcs T 0008 D 00084 TS z 000¥6 18 [000r6 1S T va 0 SAEA B e 08 505 |
00009 ZE$ 9zt — 0008 0 00009 ZES 9z | 000000Ys [o000is oor | 4 5 DAl FSONOURIL R RPN 105
DO PEE 1§ Ve 000§ 1) 00¥EE 1S ve 0008 00108 ] i 9 'ONd ‘PRURIL PN JSRA] | 10°S |
o0 avzs ZL 0008 [ o0 0PZS ZL 0000SS  [000Z% S¢ | A5 8 oseqgng U0 Yoz
02+ 3 0008 0 w2 9GE 000825 |0002S ¥l AS ¥ 98EGaNS ImNUBD €0z
2008 0 0008 7] 0008 0 BOSPLS  |0BSS = | AS Z} ‘oqeieteg epeibang Wt
g 0§ 0 009" g I i v | =M i

€202/L18 NI 22061 Q03d HOd
*31v0 NOILYDITddY
i ON NOLLYDIddY

90'L6EE Nd
joelotd Jusweacidw| uBW 81BM 2202 TOYd
LOVHINOD 3DRid LNN
LNIWAVC HOd NOWLYIMNdIY



EjoL

05'685'YS 60F 0008 0 08'6RE VS 60t 0008 Joozis 0 Fil 7 ) i WANeg %S
5% e 5 s 5 T I o e ]t
SR'96L'98 £8'LOL 0008 0 YU00L'ES £8'19L 00'00E'98  [00'ZTrs 051 Fyl % dor) w0 d eAeS IR 125
00000¥S ¥ 0008 0 o0 0007S ¥ 00N 0000018 z va 5%.0%.9 9e) Dumd wewsewm| | eLs
000LLES z 000S 0 000218 Z 0008 |00 5e3 I8 0 va ZLX g ‘s Do wenmem| | 8LS
c008es z 0008 0 00088% z 000ZELS  |000MS T va ¥ Ge) DUm SRR RS | EbS
00088 z 0w00s 0 00082% F D00LL'LS (000683 3 va -y Tric] B ey Janem %
000¥S'Z$ ¥ 0008 0 00 0¥E 28 y 0050645 005598 t | va LD ¥y Joanpay Bumd uen eM| | 11S
000D LiS 9 0008 0 00N 118 0G0ZESS  |D0OFE 1S 3 va 9 samp ol wen o] | 805
0008 7 0008 0 0008 0 i 004" b va L9X_9X_9 SAEA § easers Burddul Binmd ‘UEW RN | [0S
0008 o 000§ 0 0008 0 i i t va YRy K. ONUA 7 OASOrS DurdUeL Duiiid UK MEM] | 905
06°'9Zr 058 66zzl 0008 0 06'5Zr'058 66221 00°268°6YS |00 1S izl | o0 DA POPDURIL "B S8 M 'S
e 62 ¥Tv 0003 0 09 5BY'8S 62 v 00000'SS |00 029 0z | AS Lo wseqang epued| | 102
89 09rTs 62 ¥Tr 0008 0 s209¥'2S 62 ¥2y 000SK LS  [0WSS 052 | AS Z} 'uogaisdel spaabng 202
00067'SS Tk 0008 [} 00'06¥'5S ZZb 00007'1S |00 0SS v | un (] 10z
SEY08' Y0NS 0008 STHOSTILE 00es SSTEZBOLS *STV.LOL Z NOISIAIO
T — e E——
Q3YHOLS aNY LLNNOWY NOLLYDNddY
a3137dNOD $) a3yols ao3d SNOIASY IDMMd
INNOWY ATINISTHd | SIHL LNNOWY $ ANNONY LOVHINGD
$TVI0L STYINI LYW $Tvi0L -
0005L S 20 0005298 ST 0008 0 005,88 [o00005ES | S0 | S0 vonuzmaon] . | 0Lt
0008 0 0008 0 0008 0 0005¥'4S |00 06TS 5 V3 PAOWIOY PuB 107Y "VORETRISUI) SO0 VORReICId 1) 706
0008 0 0008 0 0008 0 CC I T oer | as i, S0 Swpng-umer] JusuTULE) By pue TUEie, Bupees gk 108
" o00se1s A0 0005015 ST 0 0008 =3 I 520 | 51 TRAUGD YEIL T
0008 0 0005 0 0008 [} X : 0L | SNOL i P SAOWSY TG JauRID) oL
e 15 o zERes 5L 0008 0 ; w | 38 o YT .i{.ﬂu_sliﬂn_u 50L
ELLYELS LLEL ELLYE 18 L'LEL 00°0% 0 i L9t a1 souyiey ¢ SAcUeY 52 1eqng § gand| 0L
£Z¥60'68 6601 £Z ¥60'63 6604 00'08 3 ZZ | AS ey ¥ SAGWSY ¥ 'O0d WeMePIS | 0L
9sonIs 78 05 051§ 8 0008 0 . . ® | AS FAOwe Yol
0008 0 0008 0 200% 0 059" ; o0l | As iadeq 1] Bred YWH 02
0008 o 0008 0 0008 0 g i %5C | AS W1 .2 VH WoweARd 707 |
0008 o 0008 0 0008 0 Ty i 8252 | AS 2 B vWH 0L
0008 0 0008 0 0008 0 008 o000 s [ va SO usamEnlry souue| | 108
DO0SOELS 3 000S8ELS € 00s 0 000G9ELS  [000S5 VS g va vua wer sl | 425
005458 ] 00'625% 1 0008 0 005458 S5 ] v3 ] v ip ) s 87'g
0005595 ! 0005598 1 0008 0 0005558 0005598 1 3 TrRuiesey WP 2d 5]
0000968 9 00°009°6% 9 0008 0 000008S  [00009'ES ] va SRS RN BERETE O] UCPeuog Y5
000§ 0 0008 0 0008 A 00965 [00z2iS ] a1 Z RAos #d SOAeS IGTA, @S
0008 0 0008 0 0008 0 0000ECS |00 PS [ a1 ) e e sy 1M, ws
0092565 (743 000568 [T-4 0008 0 o00LFYS  |002HS s0L | 0 A 0T Wk WANRG IS 7
00000 1§ AR 0000015 = 0008 0 000001S  [000001S a V3 9% .9%.9 we) Bum uey A s
000zes z 0008835 z 0008 0 00rs  |ooons L va - 9% Bamld ‘uew oW 515
i o0 06¢S L 0008 0 0006tS  |o00aes v v3 B Tura ‘We SO

B |




EJ0E

GIWOLSONV| | UNNOAV | TNOILVOMddY |

QIALT1dNOD $) Q3HOLS Qaoad SNOIAIYd 3014d
ANNONY ATLNISTHd| SIHL ANNOWY $ ANNOWY LOVHINOD
§ VIOL STVIIILYN $ TVIOL
S0YR0'FLZS 00°08 00'60Z'LS SUSLLTITS SLR6E'00LS
e TSI
J3”0ULE ANY TINNOWY NOILVOMNdd¥
GILITdNOD £} a3u0ls aoiRi3ad SNOIAIHS 301dd
ANNOWY AVLNISTHd | STHL LNNOWY $ LNNOWY LOVHINOD
$TYLOL STVIHI LY $V.iOL
000051§ 3 — 0T 00005'LS z 0oosis | 0008/§ | 2 | v3 . 'Pueq .G¥ '90) BumiZ URW JOIEM
[ oo00z1s ] o008 0000C 1S 1 0¢00z1s | 00°00218] | | w3 L% ,8Aq g ee) Bumy uiey Jeiepm
C06EESS 1 0008 00 89T 55 1 TO0GIESS_ | 006BESS| L 51 I
XewdH .0 pue Jednpel @ X .9 Jo} peymgsqns enjea [enbe jo wsy| ,
— | Jepag euayd ui pequosep Buueeuibue anjaa pejed o} peisnipe ueeq eaey seppuenb JOBHUOD 4|
00'0SL 5% 520 00'0% 0 0005285 5z0 0005298 20 | S1 wOgEZRIoN] . | LO'LL
000% 0 0008 o 000s ) SLESLES sTre | as Tt S| Sepng-umir jsumL.{} Bvpiy pus Duzgie] Topees SiFRIni | 106
00059'1$ 520 0008 7] 00059 15 20 0005918 20 | 51 e oy | 1R
SeL56"8 1828 0008 0 SUIST S 1828 000SL'TS 05 | SNOL ey 7 oW TURRENG Jenussg)] (197
YOSYIDLE e 201 ] 3 ZE' 081 915 ZL E0) I ELS ¥el | AS e g0 \Oed 00d 0L
T ¥ZLS 99°Gl, [TA75] 99°G] 0008 il 0008 0 F1 WG § ACWSY G T 1eN0D § QD 0L
SOC2I LS 145028 0008 0 9 1ZS 1 150ZE D0'SZL6LS 05z | AS 398 11 ¥18d YWH t0L
00 C0E TS 1 000s 0 0 00ETS 1 D000E 28 1 va G TISLIETIRY SOUUT 10D |
00002 84S [3 0008 0 00 00Z 815 000S5ELS t va SUI-oLL ey SR s
00558 1 0008 0 [ L 005258 v va BADWE Y ALUSTY WRIBAH o] 925
0005598 L 000 0 0005598 1 0005595 I va Rqwassy waiply exy S
00'009'2LS m 0008 0 00009218 1l 00000LS [ v3 SEOAIDS 1918, DU 0} UORIPULOD, (I




Construction P_&ﬂl Estimate No. 1

Project Description:

Railroad Crossing Improvements

Date of Contract: July 10, 2023
Contractor: Owner:
Manatt's Inc. City of Story City
Ames, lowa Story City , lowa
Base Contracl Price $187,648.20 Materials on Hand $0.00
(See Attached Tab)
Change Order
Construction Completed to Date $77,958.83
(See Attached Tab)
Total Amount Earmed to Date $77,958.83
Less Previous Payment $0.00
Less Retainage 0.0% $0.00
TOTAL CONTRACT PRICE $187,648.20 _AMOUNT DUE THIS ESTIMATE $77,958.83
aaeds 8-2-~ 2023
Title Date
Recommended by Engineer:
WMM ~Plessy| Senior Project Manager 8-2-2023
Theresa Stromberg=urphy, P.E. Tille Date
Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc.
Approved by Owner:
City of Story City Title Date

Prepared by:
Clapsaddle-Garber Associates
Ames, lowa

CGA Project No. 1709.06



0005 - 4 958 LIS 0008 C9RS6 425 0005 0L RIS SIVIOL
SIGIE ane TINNORT el AN ieT P ) =
3I0VNIVLIN HSINIZ 0L o gaL31dW00 $) g3-OLS aciy3sd SNOIASHd 3)Hd
AINYTvE LNNOWY ATLNSSTHd] SIHL LNNOWY S INAOWY A1DVHINOD
N $IWA0L SVINALYW $ WLOL
OE 05 %0 0008 00Cs w08 a ToCs T T
00 05 %0 DOCS 0008 008 7] 0508 | R0I0 uwa
0% 00 00525 %0 0005 ] 0TS 0 0008 Q0TG5 ES | eaD0% 15 T i) FUCInsUl AEAET] IP0.0 g FIGARY V666000
00 05 00 000 25 00 0% [ 0005 0 0C 0% G0 C00ZS B00'TS T 5 NG, SRBU0D) ORI TL
oC 08 0C 005 /5 w0 00 0% 0 W05 0 0005 G0C05 25 W55 T 1 UOGEZ Faty D20t 4
[ 00 005 25 %0 00°05 W00 0 00T 07008 25 3 0 3 Tonmg comnasw YOuaLL
00 05 DG 005 €5 %0 0005 06 15 0 00 ¢ 0005 CS  [eanoses T 5 SO, ORIOLT FOLOLL
00CS o0 BZres w0 0005 [ 0 00 0062765 fowsEoly 50 | o T D BoTwue) B Dass [CUOnUBAUGD) V0106
0005 00 0005 %0 003 0 00 05 0 00 C3 00 D00SS  Joroon'ss T S R0 AL AIe00u 1] OLCE
[ 005493 H0 0905 0 0005 0 00°05 Z L] EPVOBET] DU SO0y PRI oro0h
005 1690 25 %0 (XS 0 0005 0TS 0. | vis BLOEE TSI SBE Tt palE| 0208
opCs (e %0 [0S 0 50 0% [5 [ OC oer s foorls [ AS FAG0.a JoeweAiy HOVCL
oo'cs 0eres *0 [ ¥ [ [+ 30CS 00°0res 13 0¢ 38 SOUILUR] A BRIEBIB() O-0E0L
[ O 0GL S W 00CS v 1005 ToCs 0 05LEs  fonsTs % | A5 = 00a .,_-f.u.m_. e
0003 D0 O0C 15 "G 00Cs D 00§ 700§ OC 0% 1§ £ s | A5 HRRSDS G RADLEY) \V-0ED!
o0 Cs 00O5LEes | %0 DS 0 [ 0005 D005L 528 fouUsEs [ S L THH Teewaaed] B0Z0L
000E TBLYELS | W [ 0 0708 [ o0 0% DO9L¥LVS  POiES wer | 47 "L 2P D aue ging) Z30L0L
TS T w0 [0S 0 [ [ oL 0% SIS 1S [SToRs 5 | AS XS] v DeFPOW STEIANG 71010z
K0S DTSz LIS | %0 00 0 0L 0 oC 08 s &F | AS GIG00 .0 PATPON BLRIGNS, 1 T-9L08
2008 BT %0 o305 B 0208 0C 0% [ B 7is | A5 TonmiwORL SpRiban| DO
2608 30O 15 %0 0005 7 0CTs G 0% 002845 [OGIH5 | AD MR Ol S woReAe| T
T LOYRIAN] - WS PRGN
o6 05 00 0% %00t 30005 25 1 00005 25 L [ DIC052S | [oO0oe s T 51 TICRINTL] AL TORTT GATI0 0 f PGB V-666-0000
0005 0005 %001 000028 3 00000°CS L [ o0 00028 rl._us.a T 5 TADISER, RADLOD Y-O50'H 1
00 05 0005 w00t 00005 2§ b 00005 25 0TS WS Joooses ¢ 51 [Ty GZ0vF
0008 0008 %001 0000523 L 00006 28 0005 0C 00525 T 51 TGRS GoABARE ) vaL0ts
00 5 0CT5 w00} 00005 65 3 00005 ES 1 (5 T Gl .01, POMOLS] V-OL0 0%
[ ocs 0C 52755 %0 0045 0 0408 [+] 00Ls eSEOLS 50 v Bunpiu pest Buinis) “Burpass putnosalon Y-0L06
[ 00 0% 0L 00 005 56 [y 0600055 1 0008 7 [SRE T V-0LCE
[ [ %901 [ET F 00'B19% Z a0'Cs H v3 $oUBLET PUE 5:0GLAT DEIUEY D-0Z08
CO0s 0008 %00k wres Tz 1 Th S2r s €2 ¢ W00s K Vis SR D U SBUR Caleiig B ToE0e_
000s 08ers | %e0! 0PRSS [T 00 PSS BEE TS ST A ot 25 TRAGLA Y et} HOr0L
0008 150255 %ib 00 G20 025 501 00 020028 80E o0 DOOYS 02s |30 595 \ﬁ..m AE PR (T
Do 08 OIS | wZo! 00WIE 68 v QG L6 BE bLL 0C 0% 00 vri 8% W iws HE 'L UL B0 pow aing| 1 S0L0L
oc'0$ 001298 %0, 00069 68 Oty 00 06% 85 QEY 0008 00682'65  [o0kZS Eor AR e e L | L1002
0008 26105 %00+ 0TI LS 0tV 05 03615 [ 0 08 TLI6Es  [sF P fotr T3 SO Gorg SPERAE| 5002
05 o0 %00% Dotel 5% 65 DUEEL S BS [ [ S 3 3 WCLIOE 0} WIS wOnRAYaXE] F007
- T UGISIAK] - 1405 UGIBUISSA
09 [(o)| 3VOOL | 5iyq | (innoWy aoRszd |NOUYIMEdY |y vy
(00.0) [HSINHOL| % |CQIWOLSONY [ %\ h | ¢ g | GORISd sy | SNON3Ed Fonoqug | 30 | 30Md 1,000
FovNIviZH| SONYTIVE nwgnn(ou WIOL |A1NasTua| STHL INTOWY § | | nobnr b ANROWY | 1o o1 [AOVELNOD | LiNn YHOM 30 NOLLMDSI0
il STvmALYIY $WIOoL
$ Wi0L
31T AN0D ME0M 1VHINGD
] [+] d [+] N 1] i =1 = 7 ! ] H 5] | d |0 8 | “ON W)l L ¥
ETOZ/BEZILD - CZOZ/60/LC GO WOS 90’6491 ‘Nt
€Z02Z/218 31vd NOILYDITddY swewanoudiy| Bussoss peoljey FOMA
L ON NOILLYDINddY LIVHELNOD 30MHd LINA
L 40 3 30¥d LNINAYd B0d NOILYI1ddV




CHANGE ORDER NO. 1

PROJECT DESCRIPTION: Railroad Crossing Improvements CHANGE ORDER SUMMARY
PROJECT NUMBER: $1,679.00
DATE OF CONTRACT: July 10, 2023 NET CHANGE THIS ORDER {+ OR -): $7,500.00
OWNER: City of Story City REVISED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE:
CONTRACTOR: Manatt's, Inc.
CHANGE ORDER NO. XX
ITEM S AMOUNT INCREASE OR
NO DESCRIPTION OF WORK QUANTITY UNITS UNIT COST DECREASE
CO1.1| Additional mobitization due to delay by UPRR signals group 1.00 LS 7,500.00 $7,500.00
NET CHANGE THIS ORDER (+ OR -):| $ 7,500.00
NET CHANGES PREVIOUS ORDERS:| & -
TOTAL NET CHANGES TO DATE:| & 7,500.00
IOR APPROVED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE: 8/15/2023
DAYS INCREASED OR DECREASED: 0.00
REVISED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE:
REQUESTED BY CONT OR APPROVED BY OWNER
David Tyrpak, Project Manager
Manatt's, Inc. City of Story City, lowa
RECOMMENDED BY ENGINEER
Lhpnsn Sonbeng Wlspog.
Theresa Stromberg-Murpy, P.E.
Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc.
(I;A PAGE10OF 1



2120E. 13t st - |

Ames, lowa 50010 I
HAT , INC. www.manatts.com

8/3/2023

Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc
1523 South Bell Ave, Suitc 101
Ames, IA 50010

Re: Story City Railroad Improvements
Dear Theresa,

{ am requesting a change order for the delay and remobilization we had on
Washington Street.

On July 27, 2023, we were going to open the railroad crossing on Washington Street but
were denied from doing so because Union Pacific did not have two signals up and
running. An email from Clapsaddic-Garber Associates, Inc on July 27, 2023, detailed the
cquipment problems Union Pacific was having and would not be onsite until August 2,
2023. This put the project back almost onc week, making our due datc of August 15,
2023, very difficult to achieve.

[ am requesting an additional $7,500.00 to remobilize equipment and labor to the project.

Sincerely,

.

Az

David Tyrpak
Project Manager

Phone * 515-233-2005 Fax « 515-232-8741



2120 E. 13th St.

MA IIS Ames, Towa 50010
NA 7 INC. www.nanatls.com

8/15/2023

Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc
1523 South Bell Ave, Suite 101

Amcs, TA 50010

Re: Story City Railroad Improvements

[Dear Theresa,

I am requesting a change order for the additional survey layout on the Broad
Street railroad tracks.

Union Pacific was working on the westside of the tracks on Sunday August
6.2023 and while digging and setting their foundation for the railroad cross arm they
removed and piled dirt on our entire surveyed layout on the westside having us to have
that area resurveyed.

[ am requesting an additional $679.15 for the resurvey of the curb and gutter and also the
sidewalks on the cast and west sides of the tracks.

Sincerely,

S

David Tyrpak
Project Manager

Phone * 515-233-2005 Fax = 515-232-8741



CHANGE ORDER NO. 2

PROJECT DESCRIPTION: Railroad Crossing Improvements
PROJECT NUMBER; 1679

DATE OF CONTRACT: July 10, 2023

OWNER: City of Story City

CONTRACTOR: Manatt's, Inc.

CHANGE ORDER SUMMARY

NET CHANGE THIS ORDER (+ OR -}
REVISED CONTRACT COMPLET!ON DATE:

5679.15

CHANGE ORDER NO. XX

ITEM $ AMOUNT INCREASE OR
ES
NO DESCRIPTION OF WORK QUANTITY UNITS UNIT COST DECREASE
€02.1 Restaking for Broad St. due to UPRR tearing out hubs 1.00 LS 679.15 $679.15
NET CHANGE THIS ORDER (+ OR -);| § 679.15
NET CHANGES PREVIOUS ORDERS:| $ 7,500.00
TOTAL NET CHANGES TO DATE:| $ 8,179.15
RIOR APPROVED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE: 8/15/2023
DAYS INCREASED OR DECREASED: 0.00
REVISED CONTRACT COMPLETION DATE:
ESTED BY CONTRACTOR APPROVED BY OWNER
avid Tyrpak, Project Manager
Manatt's, Inc. City of Story City, lowa
RECOMMENDED BY ENGINEER
Theresa Strombéfg-Murpy,'i’.E.
Clapsaddle-Garber Associates, Inc.
CGA PAGE 1 0F 2



Fiscal Year 2022-23
Highlights
(unaudited)

General Fund

Revenues = $2,530,665
Expenditures = $2,350,392
B. Fund Balance = $1,635,573
Fund Balance =$1,815,846

Revenues: Local option sales tax dollars increased by $4,215, hotel/motel revenues
increased by $21,975/23% (back to pre-pandemic level), interest earned up
substantially, and building permit fees down (expenditures were down as well).

Revenues overall increased by $73,417/3%

Expenditures: Increased by $95,709/4.2%.

Road Use
Revenues =$461,272
Expenditures = $473,173

B. Fund Balance = $559,044
E. Fund Balance = $547,143

Revenues: Decreased by $4,056
Expenditures: Engineering services and capital projects

Capital Projects: In FY 2023-24, resurfacing of Forty Oaks and Hillcrest scheduled
for 2023 = $100,000

Hospital
Revenues =$132,930
Expenditures =$153,953

B. Fund Balance = $540,694
E. Fund Balance =$519,671

Hospital Fund is owed $400,000 and will be repaid with future TIF revenues.



TIF

Revenues =$838,418
Expenditures =$851,015
B. Fund Balance = $126,219
E. Fund Balance =$113,622

Economic Revolving Loan
Revenues =$ 1,812

Expenditures =% -0-
B. Fund Balance = $168,588
E. Fund Balance = $170,400

Equipment Replacement
Revenues =$129,615

Expenditures =$155,451
B. Fund Balance = $213,857
E. Fund Balance = $188,021



Library Trust Gilbert Golf Trust
Revenues =$ 16,946 $62,643 $66,922
Expenditures = $234,542 $44,948 $12,500
B. Fund Balance = $547,097 $14,082 $50,247
E. Fund Balance = $329,501 $31,777 $104,669
Self-Insurance Trees Forever  Housing
Revenues =$10,017 $10,278 $23,759
Expenditures =$14,429 $11,341 $15,069
B. Fund Balance =§ 5,124 $ 2,676 $42,707
E. Fund Balance =% 712 $ 1,613 $51,397
Fran Kinne Estate ARPA
Revenues =$ 48,483 $254,442
Expenditures =$ 444,228 $435,942
B. Fund Balance =$1,236,714 $172,237
E. Fund Balance =$ 840,969 $(9,263)
Debt Service Special Assessment
Revenues =$1,278,628 $ 3,536
Expenditures =$1,287,368 $10,000
B. Fund Balance =9$ 135,101 $72,213
E. Fund Balance =% 126,361 $65,749-
Storm Water
Revenues = $48,381
Expenditures = $42,745
B. Fund Balance = $14,401

E. Fund Balance

= $20,037



Sewer Sewer Improvement

Revenues = $827,962 Revenues =§ 44,587
Expenditures = $688,765 Expenditures =$ -0-
B. Fund Balance = $516,899 B. Fund Balance = $240,344
E. Fund Balance = $656,096 E. Fund Balance = $284,931
Sewer Sinking Sewer Reserve

Revenues =$116,270 Revenues =$ 3,947
Expenditures =$113,682 Expenditures =$ -0-
B. Fund Balance =$ 47,865 B. Fund Balance =$116,329
E. Fund Balance =9$ 50,453 E. Fund Balance = $120,276

Revenues: Customer charges increased by $91,893/13.2%

Expenditures: Increased by $67,845/11%. Capital equipment, new software system
sump pump inspections.

Water Water Improvement
Revenues =$768,187 Revenues =$ 29,706
Expenditures = $807,681 Expenditures =% -0-
B. Fund Balance = $264,649 B. Fund Balance = $154,676
E. Fund Balance: = $225,155 E. Fund Balance = $184,382
Water Sinking

Revenues =$173,490

Expenditures =$166,385

B. Fund Balance =$106,127
E. Fund Balance =$113,232

Revenues: Customer water sales increased by $38,598/5.8%

Expenditures: Increased by $93,633/13%. Utility costs, cleaning RO system, new
software system, replacement of meters, etc.




Bonds

Revenues = $ 49,125
Expenditures = $ 455,500
B. Fund Balance = $1,447,849
E. Fund Balance = $1,041,474

Ending fund balance bond proceeds can be used for streets, water mains, and trails.

Broad Street Reconstruction Phase 3 estimated cost is $800,000. Awarded CIRTPA
grant in the amount of $280,000. Net project cost of $520,000



Revenues
Expenditures

B. Fund Balance
E. Fund Balance

Revenues
Expenditures

B. Fund Balance
E. Fund Balance

Revenues
Expenditures

B. Fund Balance
E. Fund Balance

Revenues
Expenditures

B. Fund Balance
E. Fund Balance

Revenues
Expenditures

B. Fund Balance
E. Fund Balance

([

fl

f

Capital Projects

WW Plant
$335,888
$319,096
$(149,031)
$(132,239)

Streets
$ 235
$ -0-

$6,932
$7,167

Pool

$ 4,421
$ -0-
$130,306
$134,727

Downtown
$ 149
$ 65
$4,480
$4,564

Railroad
$ -0-
$26,200
$(8,774)
$(34,974)

Parks Projects CIP Levy

$ 2,654 $25,617

$ 61,565 $ -0-
$124,285 $ 5471

$ 65,374 $31,090
TIF Streets Broad Street
$65,550 $125,000
$67,675 $ 40,132

$ 2,167 $(110,638)
$§ 42 $(25,751)
Rec Center Trails

$ 1,995 $ 87

$ -0- $ -0-
$58,812 $2,582
$60,807 $2,669

1-35 Water Mains
$432,265 $270,127
$208,332 $406,603

$ 32,894 $ 50,299
$256,827 $(86,177)
City Hall Library Project
$ 50,000 $225,000
$228,569 $150,635
$(225,015) $ -0-
$(403,584) $ 74,365



Notes:

Wastewater Treatment Plant Improvements: Fund deficit will be paid for via
$75,000 transfer from the wastewater treatment fund in FY 2023-24 and interim
financing from the State Revolving Loan Fund (SRF).

Broad Street: The City will receive a grant in the amount of $125,000 in FY 2023-
24 for the Broad Street Reconstruction Phase II Project.

City Hall: Ending fund balance deficit will be financed with a bond at a future
date.

Water Main Improvements Project: The total estimated cost of the water main
improvements project is approximately $585,000 and will be financed from the
2021A Bond ($370,000 has been transferred) and a Story County ARPA grant in
the amount of $214,250.

Railroad Crossing Project: The City Council has previously approved agreements
with the lowa Department of Transportation and Union Pacific Railroad for these
crossing safety improvements. The City will be responsible for five percent (5%) of
the cost for the Washington Street crossing estimated at $17,890.

ARPA: City has committed American Rescue Plan Act funds ($494,000) toward
the replacement of meters and remaining to slip lining of sanitary sewer mains. The

city has been awarded an ARPA grant in the amount of $88,250 from Story County
for slip lining.

Fran Kinne Estate: Approximately $300,000 committed for the Carousel Ballfield
Project.



&/11/2023

Dear Story City Council,

We, Lynn Dahlsten and Jenna Wishteyah, wish to appeal the dicision the City
Administrator, Mark A. Jackson, has made for our dog Snickers. Snickers had lived with
us for about a year and two months without incidence. Yes, we live across the street
from the elementary school, but she has not attacked anyone before. We have taken
her outside when children have been walking and nothing has happened. She is up to
date on her shots. Snickers and Buddy both live with us to help Lynn while she goes
through treatments for cancer. Lynn’s mood has been brought up since both dogs have
came to live with us again. We will do anything to keep Snickers with us. We have taken
both dogs to the vet and have found that Snickers is perfectly health besides the fact
that she may have cancer herself. With this knowledge we have decided against getting
anything removed because we have been made aware that it might have spread
already. We believe firmly that the best decision was to leave it be. She is our family and

we don’t want to be away from her especially since we don’t know how much longer she
has.

Thank You,
Lynn Dahlsten and
Jenha Wishteyah

o o>
%WW

Recawad F1|2023,



B
— = —}
Siory City
August 11,2023

Lynn Dahlsten & Jenna Wishteyah
839 Hillcrest Dr., #2
Story City, lowa 50248

RE: Notice of Hearing
Vicious Dog

Dear Lynn & Jenna:

Based upon your appeal received on August 11, 2023, the Mayor and City Council
will conduct a hearing with possible action on Monday, August 21, 2023, at
6:00 p.m. in the City Hall Council Chambers.

The hearing is in regards to a vicious dog incident described in the letter sent to

you on August 11, 2023, and as described in the police report of the incident that
took place on August 9, 2023.

Please contact me with any questions
Sincerely,

Mark A. Jackson
City Administrator



Story City

August 11, 2023

Lynn Dahlsten & Jenna Wishteyah
839 Hillcrest Dr., #2

Story City, Iowa 50248
Re: Vicious Dog Notice

Dear Lynn & Jenna:

Enclosed for your information is a police report prepared by Officer Brice Haskin

with regards to a vicious dog incident that occurred at your residence on
August 9, 2023.

According to the report, “Snickers” attacked without provocation Meghan Sjoberg,.
Section 55.01(10.A) of the Story City Code or Ordinances defines a vicious dog as
“Any dog which has attacked or bitten a human being without provocation.”

b ]

After reviewing the police report and discussion of the incident with the Police
Department it is my determination to issue the following;

“Pursuant to section 55.09(1) of the Story City Code of Ordinances, as City
Administrator of the City of Story City, lowa, | hereby declare that “Snickers” to

be a vicious dog and the dog is not to be within the corporate limits of the City of
Story City, lowa, from the date of receiving this notice.

Please be advised that pursuant to section 55.09(4), the owner of the dog may
appeal the decision to the City Council by filing a written request with the City
Clerk within three (3) business days upon receipt of this notice. Failure to file a
written request for a hearing shall constitute a waiver of any right to contest.



Page 2

I have included a copy of Chapter 55 of the Story City Code of Ordinances.

Please contact me with any questions.

Sincegely, y

Mark A. JacKson
City Administrator



INCIDENT/INVESTIGATION

Agency Name Case#
Story City Police Department REPORT c 0000/
ory Ciy Iolice Depa n Date / Time Reported
1 | ORI 08/09/2023 18:19 Wed
N 140850300 Last Known Secure
CI: Location of Incident Gang Relat | Premise Type Zone/Tract oo 08/09:2023 1715 Wed
D 839 HILLCREST DR, Story City I4 50248 NO Residence/home STPD 08092023 17:15 Wed
E 41 Crime Incident(s) (Com ) | Weapon ! Tools | ;}C“V“Y
¥ All Other Offenses Entry Exit Security
20Z
D Cnme Incident [ 1 | Weapon / Tools | Activity
A |#2
T Entry Exit Security
A
#3 Cnime Incident | ) | Weapon / Tools | Activity
Entry Exit Security
MO
# of Victims ] | Type INDIVIDUAL/ NOT LAW Injury:
Victim/Business Name (Las1, First, Middle) Victim of DOB Race | Sex| Relationship | Resident Status Military
v | vi Crime # To Offender Branch/Status
1 I, Age 29 | W | F Resident
g Home Address Email Home Phone
]\IA Employer Name/Address Business Phone Mobile Phone
VYR Make Madel Style Color Lic/Lis VIN
CODES: V- Victim (Denote V2, V3) W1 = Witness 10 = Involved Other RP = ReponinEPerson (if other than victim)
o Type: INDIVIDUAL! NOT LAW ENFORCEMENT Injury:
T |Code |MName (Last, First, Middle) Victim of DOB Race | Sexf Relationship | Resident Status Military
H / Crime # ] To Offender Branch/Status
E Age 54 W |F Resident
R | Home Address Email Home Phone
b
Employer Name/Address o Business Phone Mobile Phone
1
N Type: INDIVIDUALS NOT LAW ENFORCEMENT {njury:
of Code |MName (Last, First, Middle) Victim of DOB Race | Sex| Relationship | Resident Status Malitary
8 I Crime # To Oftender Branch/Status
v Age 2] £ Resident
g | Home Address Email Home Phone
p |G —
mployer Name/Address Business Phone Mobile Phone
}=None 2=DBurned 3=Counterfeit/Forged 4 =Damaged/ Vandalized 5=Recovered 6 = Seized 7 =Siolen 8 = Unknown
"0J" = Recovered for Other Jurisdiction)
Vi Status
Code Frv'To Value Q) |OTY Property Description Make/Model Senial Number
P
R
0
P
E
R
T
Y
Officer/1D# HASKIN, _BRICE J  (HASK3203)
Invest IDA Q) Supervisor SPORLEDER, MATTHEW L
Complainant Signature Case Status Case Disposition:
Status e 08/09/2023 Page |

R_CS1IBR

Printed By: SPOR1907, STCRMS3

Sys#: 713247

08/14/2023 09.51



INCIDENT/INVESTIGATION REPORT
Story City Police Department

| Case # 23-000111 I

——————
4 = Damaged / Vandalized 5 =Recovered 6=Seized 7=Stolen 8 = Unknown

Status | = Nope 2 =Burned 3 = Counterfeit / Forged
Codes

IBR | Status Quantity Type Measure Suspected Type

WO CRUD

Assisting Officers

Suspect Hate / Bias Motivated:  NONE (NO BIAS)

NARRATIVE
Dog bite

R_CS2IBR By: SPOR1907, STCRMS3 08/14/2023 09:51 Page 2



REPORTING OFFICER NARRATIVE

OCA
Story City Police Department 23-000111
Victim Offense Date / Ttme Reported
A ALL OTHER OFFENSES Wed 08/09/2023 18:19

THE INFORMATION BELOW IS CONFIDENTIAL - FOR USE BY AUTHORIZED PERSONNEL ONLY

On 08/09/2023 at 18:35 hours | was called to 839 Hillcrest for a dog bite. I meet with the reporting party who was
also the victim, \y SN WO had a small mark on top of her left foot that was bleeding slightly.

S said they brought the dog's out when she was carrying in groceries and "Snickers" a Ratipin breed (Rat

Terrier/Mini Dobernan Pincher) came around the corner of the apartment building at her and bit her unprovoked.

[ meet with (RSN and later daughter SIS fromull who Co-own Snickers. "y

admitted the dog was out of her sight when it went around the corner of the building while she was holding the

extendable leash Snickers was attached to. [l didn’t know that Snickers had bit UUNMSENEES admitted the dog
is territorial, gy said the dog is current on vaccinations.

[ informed @MgD and g that | need to see the documentation for the vaccinations ASAP. Wil attempt to
get those from the Manson vet and provide those to us. (sl filled out a voluntary statement, she didn't want to
pursue any charges and had not gone to be checked out by any medical staff.

UPDATE: At 20:20 p.m While doing my report at Maple St, and Grand Ave. “gmpm pulled up and meet with me.
She advised that neither of her two dog's have current Rabies shots. 1 advised the dog’s must be current on Rabies
shots to be within the city limits. ggggmwsaid they will be taking the dog's out of the city limits to go live with other
family members in the City of Pomeroy. The name of the other dog which was not directly involved is "Buddy" a

Yorkie/Shih Tzu mix.

At 20:38 [ contacted Jllll® by phone to notify her that Snickers was not current on shots.

End of report  [08/09/2023 20:44, HASK 3203, 335)

Sgt. Brice Haskin (85-627)
Story city Police Dept.
(515) 733-2646 or (515) 733-4305

Reporting Otficer: HASKIN, BRICE J
R _c83NC

Printed By: SPOR 1907, STCRMS3  08/14/2023 0951

Page 3




CASE SUPPLEMENTAL REPORT Printed: 08/14/2023

Story City Police Department OCA: 23000111

09:51

THE INFORMATION BELOW IS CONFIDENTIAL - FOR USE BY AUTHORIZED PERSONNEL ONLY

Case Status: JCTIVE Case Mng Status: N4 Occurred: 08/09/2023
Offense: ALL OTHER OFFENSES

Investigator: HASKIN, BRICEJ (HASK3203) Date/ Time: 08/10/2023 [3:52:11, Thursday
Supervisor: SPORLEDER, MATTHEW L Supervisor Review Date / Time: 08/14/2023 07:00.:44, Monday
Contact: Reference: Supplement

At approximately 13:44 hrs on 08/10/2023 1 was called by dispatch to calt Jenna back SIS | called Jenna
back who informed me that she got shots for both her dog's Snickers and Buddy down at Pet Medical Center in Ames.

I informed Jenna she can stop by with copies of the vaccination's.

Jenna stopped in and provided me with copies, [ informed her that Snickers would still fall under the Vicious Dog

ordinance and that the administrator would decide what proper action to take if any.

End of report.
Sgt. Brice Haskin (85-627)

Story City Police Dept.

Investigator Signature Supervisor Signature

r_supp3

Page 4



VOLUNTARY STATEMENT
(NOT UNDER ARREST)

I, /’) &m not undar arrest for, nor am | being detained tor any crimin:

oftanses concerning the events. | am about fo make known to. _QLlL.!-—_#‘{ j.k

Without being accused of or questioned about any criminal offanseas ragarding the tals | am about to state, | volunteer the follawing infor

matien of my own frae will, for whatsver purposes it may Berve. Ph _

lam lﬂ_vnm of age, 0.0.B. —nd I ilve at —“_ = ik A

When T care }vmr: Crom qetliy,  aweenes ot approgiall
M r“1~f EOfa ,}Jﬁl were fak ?{)&(Lo dfj;,.

D“I.ﬁf% ’Dn'CKcr‘b - the. Chiuqua A, ,f)f-‘w-f Me and Maf‘\ft-q‘c(\’;

Loane  ayee C‘«n;_ b-\- Mme.  oN ‘“\gz fﬂ? OE ‘Ih; L: f Fw

T e Q_‘S l::m.’/fm f’tao\} bu.']‘ H\L d.:za was oan a Pﬁ;{fﬂcfﬁLlc‘

If’"aﬁ‘n anc}_ %CD DPPSL\ n& i s

PaGE NO._2) oF &/ pace:

T am pot prcss. Chorees louk  Janted . to mpor*ﬁ o
LN _L65¢ ..:Qf*_\_ \ﬁ__ll (s ’H}u__._k\amlfiﬁ Qq&\n. R

| have read esch page o1 this statemant conslsting ol 4 page(a), aach pags of which bears my signature, and corrections,
any, bear my inltials, and | certity ihat the lacts contained herein are true and carrect.
i day of AU{US" . 9-'_92—‘3

Deted at , this
< 2
WITNESS:
T Signature of person glving voluntary statement

WITNESS: e



0 coOPY

Pet Medical Center

1416 S Duff Ave
Ames, IA 50010
(5158) 232-7204

Rabies Certificate
Client 1D: 39394 Patient ID: 39394
Client Name: L Patient Name: Snickers
Address: L Species: CANINE
8 Breed:; MIX
L ) Sex: Female
Color: black
Phone: F Markings:
Birthday: 11/10/2008
Weight: 14.80 pounds on B/10/2023
Microchip ID
Tag Number: 27973 Vaccination Date: 8/10/2023
Vaccine: Nobivac 2 Expiration Date: 8M0/2024
Producer: Zoetis Lot Number: 594846
Brand: Nobivac 3 Drug Expiration Date:  5/5/2024
Type: Killed Virus
Manner of Subcutaneously
Administration:
Staff Name: Dr. Nicole Oldfather Rosel

License Number:

Doctor Signature:

8407

MM
———————For-Rabigs-Only




Pet Medical Center
1416 S Duff Ave
Ames, |IA 50010
(515) 232-7204

Rabies Certificate
Client ID: 39394 Patient 1D: 39394-2
Client Name: L ] Patient Name: Buddy
Address: S Species: CANINE
8 Breed. MIX, YORKSHIRE
L] Sex: Male - Neuter
Color: Ten
Phone; S Markings:
Birthday: 08/10/2014
Weight: 12.00 pounds on 8/10/2023
Microchip ID; '
Tag Number: 27837 Vaccination Date: 8/10/2023
Vaccine: Nobivac 3 Expiration Date: 8110712024
Producer: Zoetis Lot Number 594846
Brand: Nobivac 3 Drug Expiration Date: 51512024
Type: Killed Virus
Manner of Subcutaneously
Administration:
Staff Name: Jarod L. Rosel, DVM

License Number:

Doctlor Signature:

8083

s
P ooy




Dear Story City council and neighbors of 711 4%,

It has been brought to attention that we are required to get permission to
have fowl in city limits. So, 1 am asking in hindsight for permission to keep the
fowl we have, limiting it to 6 fowl with no roosters. We will cull/ relocate as
needed. We currently have 8 chickens {first 4 we got were not sexed and we
believe are roosters) and 2 female ducks.

| am submitting this to the city council with signatures of neighbors. If you
have any reservations, | ask that you note them on this page also.

/450 "
10 Qs Peisd
‘{ 14 4. Wﬁlf//,/-»&vt.— (T bt ol dueks )

404%' Kl’ﬂ‘" /UWIW
ﬂ;t—%liﬁm

7/&“ WW

qg,\ A £ G — /UO/

workh Praw /Z‘Céd K
Ugg  Latagettc Ave. D Gm oé;@lm N e




Sidewalk Improvement Program Application

City of Story City 504 Broad Street |515-733-2121

Date: Y'/)’23

Property Owner: Jennifer and James Schroeder

Property Address: 312 Elm Ave

Phone Number: 515-231-7409

Email: jschroed@iastate.edu

Is the property used exclusively for residential occupancy? X} Yes [ ] No

Have you received funding from this program during the last 12 months? [_] Yes No

Quantity of sidewalk to be replaced:

Length: Width; Depth:

Estimated cost to replace sidewalk: Sl Y0

Please attach a sketch showing the location of the sidewalk as it is located on your property.

Y‘ /]r ?/5

Date

Applicant Sign

Reimbursement will only be disbursed after the following conditions are met:

* Final inspection and approval of work MiKe C 515203 - 0205
¢ Bill showing the actual replacement cost , ’ff).d'f&{ VL beqan
e Proof of payment to the contractor rh 7265623 when e
He stated he needed +o see behre
Office Use Only (’,oncrszfﬂ{ftﬂ but 1M hot Sune i fu/

e 7Y 2

Sketch received:[_] Yes  [| No
Bill & proof of contractor payment received:[ ] Yes  [_] No

Date of final inspection and approval:

Date of disbursement of funds:







STENBERG CONCRETE CONST., INC.
620 ARRASMITH TRAIL

AMES, IA 50010 US
515-232-3889
office@stenbergconcrete.com
wWwW.stenbergconcrete.com

INVOICE
BILL TO SHIP TO
RESIDENT RESIDENT
RESIDENT /OWNER RESIDENT/OWNER
312 ELM 312 ELM ST
STORY CITY IA 50248 STORY CITY IA
50248
ACTIVITY OTY
REMOVAL 1
REMOVE/REPLACE DRIVEWAY.
REMOVAL 1
REMOVE /REPLACE SIDEWALK ?d u)[
m—
PAD (i HH2e5 1
SHED PAD K
PAD 1
PATIO
THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS AND SUBTOTAL
HAVE A GREAT DAY! TAX
TOTAL

BALANCE DUE

INVOICE # 072315
DATE 07/27/2023

DUE DATE 08/17/2023
TERMS net 21

RATE
8,238.00

1,400.00
1,785.00

1,895.00

AMOUNT
8,238.00

1,400.00
1,785.00

1,895.00

13,318.00
0.00
13,318.00

$13,318.00



ABElication for Boards and Commissions

City of Story City 504 Broad Street |515-733-2121
Date:

The City of Story City Council encourages citizen participation on advisory boards and commissions. If
you are interested in serving on one of the bards listed below and are willing to commit the necessary
time, please complete the form below and return it to the City Clerk’s Office. Please feel free to attach
additional information. Your application will be kept on file for one year and will be considered when
vacancies occur on the board you have designated.

Name: | hlec mm ,t"rlbdfh Phone: (3)6’)3(’0"2)?
Address: _ 910 l@g@ f m [\A'l)' TA Y5,

Education: H’ﬁ' (ﬁ( w C_C) BH' (JEM %ﬂ) JD [ P@bl '.NJO)

Occupation: Cp)uﬂ?d ‘%f O 6(‘"\1]’& 00 Jﬁ&lkmﬂa w& /L(/

Board Preference: bbfm,l md OP MS

Other Community Activities:

L s od Member g5 mlm&z@‘_@ymm@ﬁu&@u
%%m& Gmdﬂ,_aiﬂ.uiub:o%:@h&df.nr W0

Signature M 01 M M@J/M Date (24215' /202

Boards & Terms

* Board of Adjustment

5 Year Term / 5 Member Board Meets as needed, usually on the 3™ Thursday of the month.
¢ Planning & Zoning Commission

5 Year Term / 7 Member Board Meets as needed, usually prior to city council meeting,

¢ Board of Trustees Bertha Bartlett Public Library

6 Year Term / 5 Member Board Meets the last Thursday of the Month

* Board of Trustees Story City Municipal Electric Utility

6 Year Term / 3 Member Board

¢ Tree Board

4 Member Board



oy Oy

City of Story City, IA

CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT

By Segment (Select Below)
Payable Dates 8/7/2023 - 8/18/2023

Vendor Name Description (Payable) Amount
Department: 1110 - POLICE DEPARTMENT
COMPLETE COMMUNICATION... PHONE/INTERNET 85.26
KEY COOPERATIVE FUEL 1,032.67
VERIZON WIRELESS SERVICE 121.32
COMPASS BUSINESS SOL Business cards 30.90
VISA/SC PURCHASING multiple dept purchases 119.95
Department 1110 - POLICE DEPARTMENT Total: 1,390.10
Department: 1150 - FIRE DEPARTMENT
COMPLETE COMMUNICATION... PHONE/INTERNET 193.58
KEVIN DOYLE Reimbursement 5-13 batteries 812.99
KEY COOPERATIVE FUEL 32.71
ACTIVE 911 INC ActiveAlert subscription 420.00
MPEC/NAPA Auto Parts misc supplies 209.00
Department 1150 - FIRE DEPARTMENT Total: 1,668.28
Department: 1160 - FIRST RESPONDERS
KEY COOPERATIVE FUEL 121.98
Department 1160 - FIRST RESPONDERS Total: 121.98
Department: 1170 - BLDG INSPECTIONS
SAFE BUILDING city code inspections 2,115.34
Department 1170 - BLDG INSPECTIONS Total: 2,115.34
Department: 1190 - ANIMAL CONTROL
HEARTLAND PET HOSPITAL impound fees 344.23
Department 1190 - ANIMAL CONTROL Total: 344.23
Department: 2210 - STREET/ROADWAY MAINT
AWS SERVICE CENTER GARBAGE SERVICE 49.35
COMPLETE COMMUNICATION... PHONE/INTERNET 107.58
KEY COOPERATIVE FUEL 743.76
KEY COOPERATIVE FUEL 112.37
MANATTS INC 2023 St Improvements Pay Ap... 47,237.00
VERIZON WIRELESS SERVICE 124.93
GRIMES ASPHALT & PAVING cold mix 237.00
PREFERRED PEST MANAGEM... SERVICE 45.00
MARTIN MARIETTA Streets- gravel 406.59
CLAPSADDLE-GARBER INC 1709 2023 HMA projects 7,481.09
MPEC/NAPA Auto Parts misc supplies 83.12
STORY CITY BLDG PRODUCTS supplies + hardware 5.52
STORY CITY BLDG PRODUCTS supplies + hardware 64.82
WIRTH CONCRETE CONST Curbs 6,531.00
TRUCK CENTER COMPANIES 09 Freightliner 2,398.18
Department 2210 - STREET/ROADWAY MAINT Total: 65,627.31
Department: 4410 - LIBRARY
AWS SERVICE CENTER GARBAGE SERVICE 31.50
Department 4410 - LIBRARY Total: 31.50
Department: 4430 - PARKS
AWS SERVICE CENTER GARBAGE SERVICE 169.78
COMPLETE COMMUNICATION... PHONE/INTERNET 195.43
JOHN DEERE FINANCIAL Theisens purchases- CT 86.40
JOHN DEERE FINANCIAL Theisens purchases- CT 175.92
KEY COOPERATIVE FUEL 1,119.81
VERIZON WIRELESS SERVICE 131.41
ABBOTT ELECTRIC FVL, Park light repairs 1,351.73
WOODRUFF CONSTRUCTION Bridge plank replacement 19,018.10
8/18/2023 11:25:45 AM Page 1 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT
Vendor Name

PREFERRED PEST MANAGEM...
PORTABLE PRO

MGMC

STORY CITY BLDG PRODUCTS
STORY CITY BLDG PRODUCTS

Department: 4440 - RECREATION DEPARTMENT
TREASURER STATE OF IOWA

COMPLETE COMMUNICATION...

VERIZON WIRELESS

AMES FITNESS CENTER

VISA/SC PURCHASING

VISA/SC PURCHASING

VISA/SC PURCHASING

VISA/SC PURCHASING

Department: 4445 - SWIMMING POOL
TREASURER STATE OF IOWA
AWS SERVICE CENTER
COMPLETE COMMUNICATION...
SAM'S CLUB

ACCO UNLIMITED

PREFERRED PEST MANAGEM...
POOL TECH

PLUMB SUPPLY COMPANY
STORY CITY MUN ELEC UTILITY
VISA/SC PURCHASING

VISA/SC PURCHASING

VISA/SC PURCHASING

Department: 4450 - CEMETERY
AWS SERVICE CENTER

Department: 5520 - ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CITY EDC

Department: 6300 - PARTIAL SELF FUNDING
BENEFITS INC

Department: 6611 - EXECUTIVE (MAYOR, ADM)
KEY COOPERATIVE
MGMC

Department: 6620 - FINANCIAL AD (CLERK,TREA)
GATE HOUSE DB IOWA HOLDI...

COMPLETE COMMUNICATION...

VERIZON WIRELESS

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC

INTENSITEE INC

IOWA LEAGUE OF CITIES

MGMC

RACHEL ISEBRAND

VISA/SC PURCHASING

Department: 6650 - CITY HALL/SENIOR CENTER
AWS SERVICE CENTER
EARLY BIRD WINDOW WAGSHI...

Description (Payable)

SERVICE

South park service
MEMBERSHIP
supplies + hardware
supplies + hardware

REC/POOL TAXES
PHONE/INTERNET
SERVICE

Summer Rec tennis lessons
multiple dept purchases
multiple dept purchases
multiple dept purchases
multiple dept purchases

REC/POOL TAXES
GARBAGE SERVICE
PHONE/INTERNET
Sam's purchases

pool chemicals/supplies
SERVICE

pool parts
parts/supplies

SERVICE

multiple dept purchases
multiple dept purchases
multiple dept purchases

GARBAGE SERVICE

property tax
EDC Contributions w/water bil...

Claims/010-0041

FUEL
MEMBERSHIP

Minutes/Notices July
PHONE/INTERNET
SERVICE

computer data assistance
EMB logo jacket CM
member dues
MEMBERSHIP

clothing reimbursement
multiple dept purchases

GARBAGE SERVICE
window cleaning

Payable Dates: 8/7/2023 - 8/18/2023
Amount

100.00

90.00

37.80

193.04

18.99

Department 4430 - PARKS Total: 22,688.41

238.76

139.53

50.71

399.00

68.00

169.00

106.77

28.79

Department 4440 - RECREATION DEPARTMENT Total: 1,200.56

755.87
75.00

99.90

1,720.16

1,816.80

55.00

826.18

190.75

2,143.85

-18.91

8.97

28.92

Department 4445 - SWIMMING POOL Total: 7,702.49

46.00
Department 4450 - CEMETERY Total: 46.00

618.00
303.28
Department 5520 - ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT Total: 921.28

304.10
Department 6300 - PARTIAL SELF FUNDING Total: 304.10

32.52
37.80
Department 6611 - EXECUTIVE (MAYOR, ADM) Total: 70.32

721.20
218.76

37.11

262.50

42.00

2,211.00

56.70

28.46

79.44

Department 6620 - FINANCIAL AD (CLERK, TREA) Total: 3,657.17

116.76
150.00

8/18/2023 11:25:45 AM

Page 2 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT
Vendor Name

PREFERRED PEST MANAGEM...
USA BLUE BOOK

CONVERSE CONDITIONED AIR
CONVERSE CONDITIONED AIR

Department: 6670 - DATA PROCESSING
SALTECH

Department: 8760 - I-35 DEVELOPMENT
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CO TREASURER
STORY CO TREASURER

Department: 8761 - CAPITAL PROJECT
CLAPSADDLE-GARBER INC
CLAPSADDLE-GARBER INC

Department: 8774 - RICH OLIVE STR PROJECT
MANATTS INC

Department: 8784 - CAP PROJECT-STREETS
VAN WALL

Department: 8846 - FRAN KINNE ESTATE
| & S GROUP

Department: 9211 - STORM DRAINAGE
TREASURER STATE OF IOWA

Department: 9810 - WATER UTILITY
MENARDS COMMERCIAL CAPLI...
TREASURER STATE OF IOWA
AWS SERVICE CENTER
CHRISTINA MCCONNELL
COMPLETE COMMUNICATION...
KEY COOPERATIVE

VERIZON WIRELESS

USA BLUE BOOK

USA BLUE BOOK

HACH COMPANY

BIG STATE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
BIG STATE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY
PREFERRED PEST MANAGEM...
NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL & SAF...
HAWKINS INC

HILL'S BACKHOE & TILING

USA BLUE BOOK

USA BLUE BOOK

USA BLUE BOOK

USA BLUE BOOK

CORE & MAIN

MGMC

MGMC

Description (Payable)

SERVICE

supplies, flag

Condenser work + seasonal se...
Condenser work + seasonal se...

computer data services

property tax 0208350020
property tax 0207480080
property tax 0208350010
property tax 0208350030
property tax 0208350001
property tax 207480030

property tax 208300120

property tax 0207400350

1679 2022 RR Crossing Project
1679 2022 RR Crossing project

2023 St Improvements Pay Ap...

2023 JD ZTrak

Proj 21-25690 ballfield improv...

LF, STORM, SEWER

Monthly bill/receipts
WET

GARBAGE SERVICE
Deposit reimbursement
PHONE/INTERNET
FUEL

SERVICE

supplies

supplies

chemicals

tools

tools

SERVICE

safety supplies
chemicals

3 man backhoe/labor
supplies

supplies

supplies

supplies, flag

parts

MEMBERSHIP
MEMBERSHIP

Payable Dates: 8/7/2023 - 8/18/2023
Amount

75.00
115.75

1,791.18

144.45

Department 6650 - CITY HALL/SENIOR CENTER Total: 2,393.14

225.00
Department 6670 - DATA PROCESSING Total: 225.00

154.00

324.00

152.00

504.00

154.00

156.00

652.00

70.00

Department 8760 - I-35 DEVELOPMENT Total: 2,166.00

1,739.60
495.00
Department 8761 - CAPITAL PROJECT Total: 2,234.60

58,481.00
Department 8774 - RICH OLIVE STR PROJECT Total: 58,481.00

17,862.04
Department 8784 - CAP PROJECT-STREETS Total: 17,862.04

1,917.50
Department 8846 - FRAN KINNE ESTATE Total: 1,917.50

37.78
Department 9211 - STORM DRAINAGE Total: 37.78

186.24
3,370.84
50.40
125.00
179.20
162.71
141.43
616.00
21.95
1,260.00
169.70
499.50
45.00
719.30
2,330.80
2,777.75
616.00
177.08
171.35
1,193.64
3,434.35
37.80
37.80

8/18/2023 11:25:45 AM

Page 3 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT
Vendor Name

MPEC/NAPA Auto Parts

STORY CITY MUN ELEC UTILITY
STORY CO TREASURER
VISA/SC PURCHASING
CUMMINS SALES & SERVICE
CUMMINS SALES & SERVICE
MICROBAC LABORATORIES, I...
DAKOTA SUPPLY GROUP

CORE & MAIN

Department: 9815 - SEWER UTLITY
TREASURER STATE OF IOWA
AWS SERVICE CENTER
COMPLETE COMMUNICATION...
KEY COOPERATIVE

VERIZON WIRELESS

CARRICO AQUATIC RESOURCES
VESSCO

STORY CITY MUN ELEC UTILITY
MICROBAC LABORATORIES, |...
MSA PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MSA PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Description (Payable)

misc supplies

SERVICE

property tax 112405140
multiple dept purchases
Water plant

water plant maintanence
Lab testing

parts

parts

LF, STORM, SEWER
GARBAGE SERVICE
PHONE/INTERNET

FUEL

SERVICE

UV Technical Consultation
Aerzen rebuilds

SERVICE

Lab testing

SC Sump Pump inspections yrs...
SC Sump Pump inspections yrs...

Payable Dates: 8/7/2023 - 8/18/2023

Department 9810 - WATER UTILITY Total:

Department 9815 - SEWER UTLITY Total:

Grand Total:

Amount

38.98
7,578.98
2,194.00
550.00
1,012.23
2,619.39
60.00
33.81

1,860.88

34,272.11

880.44
50.40
179.20
380.21
101.42
270.00
8,487.50
4,137.92
2,439.50
2,210.59
868.77
20,005.95

247,484.19

8/18/2023 11:25:45 AM

Page 4 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT

Fund Summary
Fund
001 - GENERAL FUND
110 - ROAD USE TAX
115 - PARTIAL SELF FUNDING
134 - FRAN KINNE ESTATE
135 -1-35 DEVELOPMENT
320 - TIF STREETS
329 - RR CROSSINGS PROJECT
350 - EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT FUND
600 - WATER UTILITY
610 - SEWER UTILITY
740 - STORM WATER DRAINAGE

Grand Total:

Account Summary

Account Number
001-1110-6181
001-1110-6331
001-1110-6373
001-1110-6499
001-1150-6210
001-1150-6330
001-1150-6331
001-1150-6373
001-1150-6504
001-1160-6331
001-1170-6490
001-1190-6413
001-4410-6371
001-4430-6181
001-4430-6210
001-4430-6320
001-4430-6331
001-4430-6350
001-4430-6372
001-4430-6373
001-4430-6498
001-4430-6499
001-4430-6798
001-4440-6320
001-4440-6350
001-4440-6373
001-4440-6418
001-4440-6498
001-4440-6507
001-4445-6332
001-4445-6371
001-4445-6373
001-4445-6413
001-4445-6418
001-4445-6490
001-4445-6499
001-4445-6503
001-4445-6507
001-4450-6320
001-5520-6413
001-5520-6499
001-6611-6331

Account Name
CLOTHING ALLOWANCE

MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...

TELEPHONE
MISCELLANEOUS
DUES & SUBSCRIPTIONS

MOTOR VEHICLE MAINT...
MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...

TELEPHONE
MINOR EQUIPMENT

MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

PAYMENTS TO OTHER A...

UTILITIES

CLOTHING ALLOWANCE
DUES & SUBSCRIPTIONS
BUILDING & GROUNDS

MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...

EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
SANITATION SERVICES
TELEPHONE
CONTRACTUAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS
CAPITAL PROJECT
BUILDING & GROUNDS
EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
TELEPHONE

SALES TAX
CONTRACTUAL SERVICES

MISC. OPERATING SUPPL..
VEHICLE REPAIR & MAIN...

UTILITIES
TELEPHONE

PAYMENTS TO OTHER A...

SALES TAX
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS

MERCHANDISE FOR RES...
MISC. OPERATING SUPPL..

BUILDING & GROUNDS

PAYMENTS TO OTHER A...

MISCELLANEOUS

MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...

Payment Amount
44,575.80
65,627.31

304.10
1,917.50
2,166.00

58,481.00
2,234.60
17,862.04
34,272.11
20,005.95
37.78
247,484.19

Payment Amount
119.95
1,032.67
206.58
30.90
420.00
812.99
32.71
193.58
209.00
121.98
2,115.34
344.23
31.50
86.40
37.80
387.95
1,119.81
1,351.73
90.00
326.84
100.00
169.78
19,018.10
68.00
169.00
190.24
238.76
399.00
135.56
998.02
2,143.85
99.90
8.97
755.87
55.00
75.00
1,720.16
1,845.72
46.00
303.28
618.00
32.52

Payable Dates: 8/7/2023 - 8/18/2023
Report Summary

8/18/2023 11:25:45 AM

Page 5 of 6



CLAIMS REGISTER REPORT

Account Number
001-6611-6499
001-6620-6181
001-6620-6230
001-6620-6373
001-6620-6402
001-6620-6490
001-6620-6499
001-6620-6506
001-6650-6320
001-6650-6490
001-6650-6499
001-6670-6490
110-2210-6330
110-2210-6331
110-2210-6350
110-2210-6373
110-2210-6413
110-2210-6490
110-2210-6499
110-2210-6526
110-2210-6798
115-6300-6150
134-8846-6490
135-8760-6499
320-8774-6798
329-8761-6490
350-8784-6727
600-9810-6210
600-9810-6331
600-9810-6350
600-9810-6371
600-9810-6373
600-9810-6418
600-9810-6420
600-9810-6490
600-9810-6499
600-9810-6504
600-9810-6506
600-9810-6507
600-9810-6520
610-9815-6331
610-9815-6350
610-9815-6371
610-9815-6373
610-9815-6418
610-9815-6490
610-9815-6499
740-9211-6800

Project Account Key

**None**

Account Summary

Account Name
MISCELLANEOUS
CLOTHING ALLOWANCE
TRAVEL & TRAINING
TELEPHONE
PUBLICATION ADV/LEGAL
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS

OFFICE SUPPLIES
BUILDING & GROUNDS
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MOTOR VEHICLE MAINT...
MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...
EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
TELEPHONE

PAYMENTS TO OTHER A...
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS

ROAD MAINT. SUPPLIES
CAPITAL PROJECT
INSURANCE, GROUP HE...
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS
CAPITAL PROJECT
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
CAPITAL EQUIPMENT
DUES & SUBSCRIPTIONS
MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...
EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
UTILITIES

TELEPHONE

SALES TAX

CONSUMER DEPOSIT RE...
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS

MINOR EQUIPMENT
OFFICE SUPPLIES

MISC. OPERATING SUPPL..
METERS, CLAMPS, HYDR...

MOTOR VEHICLE OPER. ...
EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
UTILITIES
TELEPHONE
SALES TAX
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES
MISCELLANEOUS
CAPITAL FEE

Grand Total:

Project Account Summary

Grand Total:

Payment Amount
37.80
70.46

262.50
255.87
721.20
2,211.00
56.70
79.44
2,085.63
75.00
232.51
225.00
83.12
743.76
2,398.18
232.51
6,531.00
7,526.09
161.72
713.93
47,237.00
304.10
1,917.50
2,166.00
58,481.00
2,234.60
17,862.04
625.60
162.71
3,631.62
7,578.98
320.63
3,370.84
125.00
2,882.75
2,952.58
1,067.73
21.95
4,393.04
7,138.68
380.21
8,487.50
4,137.92
280.62
880.44
5,788.86
50.40
37.78
247,484.19

Payment Amount

247,484.19

247,484.19

Payable Dates: 8/7/2023 - 8/18/2023

8/18/2023 11:25:45 AM

Page 6 of 6



July 2023

Water

Completed meters and rechecks

Completed Bac-t sampling

Completed well draw downs

Replaced RO2 filters

Wigens cleaned both RO1 and RO 2

Keller had a fish kill in North Park

Keller caused 2 water main breaks, 8" St and Maple ST while working on new 6 inch main on 8t
Replaced 10 meters with new radio meters

Did 5 sump pump inspections

Dwain tested for water treatment (failed)

Spoke with Automated system about meter for weli 2 and status on the blend valve for the
water plant

Worked with Jess to sort out issues with meters in apartment buildings

Worked with Ferguson on getting the right sized meters for some customers

Wastewater

Weekly & monthly sampling. (TSS, Ammonia, BOD, Tank Samples)

Monthly Maintenance: cleaning, greasing, exercising valves.

Continued increased Aluminum testing to monitor for regulations coming on our new permit in
2024,

Took sludge sample from the reed beds to prepare to haul out the sludge form the west 2 beds.
We have Keaton with Abbott Electric still working on getting parts and coming out to move the
breaker bucket tc a new location on the panel.

Sprayed along the perimeter fence at the wastewater plant for weeds.

Cleaned the Effluent weir with the Jet.

Replaced a ballast that went out on the UV system

Got our Dr 3900 machine back from repair. (the screen had stopped working.)

Continued using the new time sheet system. Seems to be working good.

Vessco brought back the 2™ of two blowers that we are having rebuilt. We now have both back.
Automatic systems was out in June to look into historical trending problems we are having with
the SCADA System. Problem is resolved for now

Met with MSA to discuss some details before 90% meeting. | have been in contact with Clint
quite a bit finalizing some planning details.

Mowed lawn 2 times.

Applied to reed beds 2 times

Adam read meters



Street Department Activities for July

W NV AR WRLR

I )
BWN = O

Maintained brush sites

Attended safety training

Swept streets

Cleaned off intakes

Repaired 2 sinkholes on 800 block of Hillcrest
Installed new batteries in 09 Freightliner dump truck
Started seal coat program

Mowed right-of-way and cemetery

Leveled and poured new concrete on 2 manholes

. Picked up down branches around town and in cemetery

. Filled several potholes

- Sprayed for weeds in right of ways and cemetery

- Received new JD zero-turn mower and loader attachment for JD SO75 tractor
. Continued mosquito control program

Activities Scheduled for August

bl b

Maintain grounds at the cemetery, mow ditches, and right of ways
Maintain trucks and equipment

Paint crosswalks on Grand and by schools

Asphalt patch areas

Continue seal coat program



STORY CITY PARKS AND RECREATION DEPARTMENT
MONTHLY ACTIVITIES REPORT
JULY 2023

Spot sprayed roundup around pool and east diamond on 7/3

Cole and | marked out and began digging out an area to install a sand volleyball court in South Park 7/5
Lekwa Heating and Cooling replaced AC and furnace at FVL, they replaced the 2 units that do the main
room a year and half ago, and replaced the unit that does the kitchen and bathrooms this time.

Carrico Aquatics came on 7/6 to troubleshoot issues with our UV system at the pool. Found and fixed
some issues

Safety training (hearing conservation/hearing testing) on 7/6

Pre construction meeting for Carousel Field fencing/dugout project on 7/6

Swim lessons started back up on 7/10-7/21

Woodruff Construction began replacing the remaining bridge planks on the pedestrian bridge 7/10
Finished digging out and prepping sand volleyball court. Started hauling in loads of sand on 7/11

Kelly trimmed bushes by tennis courts and along bike trail on Sunrise

Jenny opened up registration for all fall activities on 7/11

1.25" of rain on 7/12

Spread the first 4 loads of sand out at the new sand volleyball court on 7/14, set posts for nets on
7/17/2023

Woodruff completed replacing the remaining 182 bridge planks on 7/17 and re-opened the bridge. We
now have about 60 extra bridge planks that will be stored and used, if necessary, in the future.

Spot sprayed roundup by carousel, areas in North Park and areas in boulevards

2 more loads of sand on 7/18 for the sand volleyball court

Cole and | set posts on 7/18 for the sand volleyball nets, then finished spreading out remaining sand and
leveling it, installed volleybalt net on 7/19

Safety training at FVL on 7/20

Kelly trimmed trees and shrubs in various parks on 7/21

Cole and | re-painted the basketball court lines on the outdoor court in North Park on 7/25

Cole and | mowed and weed-eat the empty Library lot on 7/25

Jenny opened up registration for a fall sand volleyball league on 7/26

Spot sprayed roundup at high school baseball parking lot, areas by east diamond, and McCormick Park
7/26.

Cole an | took apart the chlorine injector at the pool and cleaned it since it was clogged and not working
properly. 7/27

Water fill line at the pool sprung a leak on Saturday 7/28, so had to take that apart and rebuild a section
of it

Spot sprayed roundup on cracks at City Hall, fire station, and library on 7/31 also spot sprayed weeds in
the fence and infield of the carousel field and east diamond

Cole cleaned up the landscaping at the Senior Center on 7/31.

Asphalt behind senior center is falling apart, garbage truck has been making it worse lately, so Cole and |
moved the dumpster towards the alley and contacted Aspen Waste to have them only access that
dumpster from the alley and not on senior center property. We will work with street dept to try and
figure out a patch for the areas that are torn up and falling apart, but for now we dug up all the broken
pieces and filled in the areas with millings.



Story City Police Department
Summary Report
07/01/2023 00:00:00 - 07/31/2023 23:59:59
Quick Overview

Calls for Service: 305 Traffic Stops: 21 New Cases: 15
Outreach Events: 1 Extra Patrol: 2 Fire Alarms: 0
Number of Arrests: 2 Total Charges Filed: 2 Juvenile Referrals: 2

Calls For Service
Officer Involved

i B BUSINESS SECURITY CHECK 26.7%
. GENERAL COMPLAINTS 14.0%
B FOLLOW UP 9.3%
[ MEDICAL CALL 8.7%
B OUTREACH / COMMUNITY SERVICE 7.0%

| | TRAFFIC STOP / ENFORCEMENT 7.0%
| I LAW DEPARTMENT ASSIST 4.3%
| [ SUSPICIOUS ACTIVITY 4.3%
| W THEFT/BURGLARY/PROPERTY CALLS  3.7%
| I WELFARE CHECK 3.3%
H ADMINISTRATIVE ACTIVITY 1.3%
CITY CODE ENFORCEMENT 1.3%
COLLISION 1.3%

| B FIREWORKS COMPLAINT 1.3%
ALARM 1.0%

M CHEMICAL SPILL/ODOR 1.0%
[ CIVIL MATTER 0.7%
[ DISORDERLY CONDUCT 0.7%
I DOMESTIC DISPUTE 0.7%
@ HARASSMENT 0.7%
B DEATH INVESTIGATION 0.3%
DRUGS AND ALCOHOL 0.3%

#l EXTRA PATROL 0.3%
¥ FIRE OTHER 0.3%
B SHOTS FIRED 0.3%
Total: 100.0%

Page 1 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.06



Number of Events

Number of Events

Number of Events

Events by Day

Officer Involved

Sun Maon Tues Wed Thurs Fri Sat
Day Of Week

Events by Hour - All Days

Officer Involved

24

15

—— e I I I - I

0000 0100 0200 0300 0400 0500 0600 0700 0800 0900 1000 1100 1200 1300 1400 1500 1600 1700 1800 1900 2000 2100 2200 2300
Hour

Events by Hour
For Sunday

0000 0100 0200 0300 0700 0800 08900 1100 1200 1300 1400 1500 1600 1700 1800 1800 2000 2100 2300

Hour

Page 2 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.06



Number of Events

Number of Events

Number of Events

Events by Hour
For Monday

0000 0100 0400 0700 0800 O0S00 1000 1100 1200 4300 1400 4500 1600 41800 1900 2000 2100 2200 2300
Hour

Events by Hour
For Tuesday

0000 000 0200 0300 0700 0900 1000 1300 1500 1600 1700 1800 1900 2000 2100 2200 2300
Hour

Events by Hour
For Wednesday

0000 0100 0300 0400 ©O60C 0800 1200 1300 1400 1500 1600 1700 4800 2000 2100 2200 2300
Hour

Page 3 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.06



Number of Events

Number of Events

Number of Events

Events by Hour
For Thursday

0000 0100 0200 0400 0500 O70C 0800 0900 1000 1100 4200 1300 4400 1600 1800 1900 2000 2100 2200 2300
Hour

Events by Hour
For Friday

0000 0200 Q300 0600 0700 0800 0800 1000 1100 1400 41500 1600 1700 1800 1900 2000 2100 2200 2300
Hour

Events by Hour
For Saturday

0000 0200 0300 0400 0500 0600 0700 0800 0900 1000 1100 1200 1300 1400 1500 1600 1700 1800 1900 2000 2100 2200 2300
Hour

Page 4 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.06



Number of New Cases

Number of New Cases

Number of New Cases

Cases by Day

Sun Man Tues Wed Thurs Fri
Day Of Week

Cases by Hour

20

18

12

08

0.4

0.0 b .
0BOO 1000 1300 1400 1600 1700 1900 2000 2100 2200 2300

Hour

Cases by Hour

For Sunday
1.0

0.9
0.8
07
0.6
05
04
0.3
02
01
0.0

Page 5 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.06



Number of New Cases Number of New Cases

Number of New Cases

20

16

1.2

08

0.4

0.0

1.0
0.9
0.8
0.7
0.6
0.5
c.4
0.3
0.2
0.1
0.0

1.0
0.9
08
0.7
0.6
0.5
0.4
03
0.2
0.1
0.0

Cases by Hour
For Monday

Hour

Cases by Hour
For Tuesday

1000 1300 1700 1800
Hour

Cases by Hour
For Wednesday

Hour

Page 6 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.06



Number of New Cases

Number of New Cases

1.0
0.8
0.8
0.7
0.6
0.5
04
0.3
0.2
01
0.0

1.0
09
08
0.7
0.6
0.5
04
03
0.2
0.1
0.0

Cases by Hour
For Thursday

0800 1300 2300
Hour

Cases by Hour
For Friday

1400
Hour

Page 7 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.06



CAD Event Breakdown by Day - All Events

 MEDICAL ASSIST/AMBULANCE CALL

[MOTOR VEH CRASH/ INJURY

MOTOR VEH CRASH/PROP DAMAGE

[MOTORIST ASSISTANCE

'OPEN DOOR

[OUTREACH

| PARKING ENFORCEMENT/COMPLAINT

|PUBLIC INTOXICATION

RECKLESS DRIVER

|

|SCAM

SHOTS FIRED

|SUSPICIOUS PERSON/VEH/ACTIVITY

| THEFT / FRAUD / FORGERY

| TRAFFIC HAZARD

' TRAFFIC STOP / ENFORCEMENT

'TRAINING

 TRESPASS

|VEHICLE UNLOCK

Sun | Mon | Tues | Wed | Thurs | Fri Sat | Total

TOTAL M. 3s 46 4 46 305
1911 HANG UP / INCOMPLETE CALL [ 0 1
| ANIMAL CALL 5 12
|BURGLARY / ATTEMPTED BURGLARY o] 20)]
'BUSINESS SECURITY CHECK 10 | 80
|CHEMICAL SPILL/ODOR 1] 3
| CHILD WELFARE CHECK 1| 2
[CITIZEN CONTACT 1] 13
|CITY CODE ENFORCEMENT 1] 4
|CIVIL COURT PROCESS SERVICE A 5] 2
'CIVIL MATTER 0 | 2 |
| DEATH INVESTIGATION | o | 1
' DISORDERLY CONDUCT | 1 | 2
| DISTURBANCE & NOISE PARTY 1 o | 1
' DOMESTIC DISPUTE 1 | 3
|ESCORT BUSINESS/FUNERAL 0 | 1005
' EVIDENCE TRANSPORT/PICK UP o | 1 |
|[EXTRA PATROL | 2 |
|FINGER PRINTING 0 | 2
[FIRE OTHER 0 1]
| FIREWORKS COMPLAINT 0o | 5
FOLLOW UP 5 | 28 |
| GENERAL ALARM BANK / RESIDENTI 0 | 3
| GENERAL INFO/COMPLAINT/ASSIST 0 | 6 |
'HARASSMENT 0 | 2
JUVENILE TROUBLE | L 2Fi|
|LAW DEPARTMENT ASSIST 1 | 13
|LOST OR FOUND PROPERTY 1 i) 2|

5 | 26

0 1

0 3

0 2

1 1

(] 1

0 6

1 1

2

1

0

1

1

1

3

0

0

0

0

=IO QIOIW=OW=iC~=oO =0 Q = O b =2=O0=NO =000 0000 I0NCO|l=20~NDCO
NN=2O MO W =00 =200 Q0= =0NQ WO IC=0NO O =0=00Co0C|C=doovowo
NOOQNOQQ’QQ—‘ONQOOQO@QWQOOOMOOQ-‘QQQOOOQO—‘-‘QOOOQ—DE

2 IOINIC W= 2000 OCDO 20022000 00 OANINW-O0Oo0ooOOaAco2000 ~NO| -0

| WELFARE CHECK

®ww=aNoodalalo

Page 8 of 10

08/14/2023 10:27.06



Offense Numbers

A report can have more than one offense. The total for this table may be larger than the number of reports listed on page 1.
This data is from the Mobile database and may not reflect final data in RMS as offenses may change during the approval process .

n | Mon | Tues | Wed

Thurs

Fri

Total

T _ 5
ALL OTHER OFFENSES

I

4
0

s

[=2F 3

|

—
i

18

-t

'ANIMAL AT LARGE

T

|ASSIST OTHER AGENCY

'BURGLARY 3RD DEGREE - BURGLARY/BREAKING AND ENTE

CHILD ENDANGERMENT {OTHER) AGGRAVATED

| COLLISION REPORT

|CRIMINAL MISCHIEF 5TH DEGREE

[CRIMINAL TRESPASS

DEATH INVESTIGATICN

|RECKLESS USE OF FIREARMS W/DAMAGE

ITHEFT 1ST DEGREE - MOTOR VEHICLE THEFT

e =

| THEFT 2ND DEGREE - EMBEZZLEMENT

|THEFT 4TH DEGREE - ALL OTHER LARCENY

| THEFT 5TH DEGREE - THEFT FROM MOTOR VEHICLE

OO0 0|0 =00|0(0)|=0/0 0|0 Nt

O=2 0000 =a—00oo

=000 O=00 =00 Cc -

OIC|O= 0|00 |= 0|0 =00 =M

OO0 IC OO0 ==200=00|wW

1
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
0
1
0
0

i) Y g ) PG I P PP I Y I Y

Page 9 of 10

08/14/2023 10:27.06



Charge Numbers

Sun | Mon | Total

|

ACCESSORY AFTER THE FACT
' BURGLARY 3RD DEGREE - BURGLARY/BREAKING AND ENTE
|CHILD ENDANGERMENT

| CRIMINAL MISCHIEF 5TH DEGREE

—t | | | P 2

O =lO O -
N R Y P

Page 10 of 10 08/14/2023 10:27.05



30 1 abed WY 62:£0:6 £Z0Z/91/8
19'659'65 199026 ¥6'751'05 {1004 NO WIVIIJHSYI JINIS HIM3IS 000T-T18
L8 L6Y'8LY STHIT'VE I EEEPSY {1004 uo wie D) HSYD ALIILN YIM3S fo0T-G19
¥S5'7L8 9g's 8T'618 (1904 Uo WIeD) HSYD IAHISIY HILYM 000T-€09
99'9T 7181 TUTEL'T PSSEY'BLL (1004 uo wie) HSYD AOYdWI HILYM 0001-705
00Ty TTELT'PT 08 080°0¢ {1004 uo wie|3) HSYD ANIS YALYM 0001-109
08959°vT 85°L09't T LPOOT {lood uc wie(d) HSYD HILYM 000T-005
68'950'T9 60°6YT 08°208°09 {1004 uo wre(d} HSVD YILNII NOILYIYIIY 000T-0F%
Y Or9'BET T 691 cE- ST9T8'TLT (loed vo wieD) HSYD ONNA 32V1d3Y dND3 000T-058
1269902 19°40€ 09v9e'vL (1004 Uo wne|)) HSYD NOISNYJX3 917 000T-t5E
Lrove'os 00858121 €87 LT T NOILONYLSNOD3IY 1S OvOyd 000T-0£€
08'989¢- 08'688'T- 00°SL6'vE- (1004 U0 Wied) 17310Yd SONISSOUD Yy 000T-62¢
£0LLYT 110t 76'99%°'C WIVTID HSYD NOLLYIQIINIY dLMM 000T-8ZE
6€€90'86T- 00'FZ8°s9- 6E'6ETZET- WIVTID HSYD (0Yd L¥3dL MM 000T-£2E
¥ 0PT'SEO'T ZT99L'E IS VLY THOT (1904 uo wiepd) HSYD SANOa 000T-9¢E
LO'ESESY 50t 6S'ELES9 {lood uo wie(D} HSYD roYd SHEYJ ON 8 05 000T-72E
TS 6LTSET L8158 89 LTLPET {1004 uc W) HSYD IOYd 100d ONIWWIMS 000T €<
9t'SST'9L- TLL6T9L- STIv {100d uo une|d) S133Y1S Jil 00CT-0zE
6£'089'C £6°0T 9%°'699°7 {1004 uo wrep) HSYD IVYL/ISNOHENTI 000T-v1t
$5'96T'L €67 8T /9T {1004 uo wiep) HSYD 3A0Y4NI 133Y1S DOGT-ETE
SPELTTE ZE'S8T 9T°'880°TE (1o0d uo wie) HSYD S123r0Hd Tv.LIdYD DOGT-Z1E
86°285'7 0L'8T 8T ¥9St (1004 uo wied) HSYD IAOUIINI NMOLNMOG DOOT-T1E
0z ZI0bI- Z1'1987 TEELR'ST- (100d uo unep3) HSYD A¥3IS 1830 000T-00¢
LLT06'TT- 0009z LLTIT'E {100d uo wiedINYd INISIY NYIIYINY 000T-9rT
8T'648'LST Z0'750'T 91°'£28'952 (100d uo wie|d) HSYI LNIWJOT1IAIA SE-( DOOT-5ET
08'tTH vee 08'br's 00°0L6'0v8 {100d NC WIVTD) HSYD 31V1S3 INNIN NvYd OO0T-VET
6T°19T 990 £5°091 {1004 uo une) HSYI ANNY IAYISIY 1L B00T-9¢1
SS'6EE'DZT 68'9L89 99'Z9V'ETT {1004 uo wie) HSYD JINVNIY LNIWIHINI XVL 0001-521
0L TET- St'EvS- BLITL (1004 uo wie) HSYD ONN 313S TVILYYd 000T-511
0Z'620'995 BB'ELSPT- 60 €09'065 (1004 vo wieD} HSYD XYL 35N AYOY 000T-0T1
BT°8T0'99 TE'69T L8'8pL'59 {1004 uo wWie|d) HSYD LSISSY TvidAdS 300T-190
PTSLTIT 65'SY S96TT'IT (1904 uo WieD) HSYD Y340 LNIVIA/MM 000T-£50
EO'EET'BE £6'vr9's- 96 LLLTE (1004 uc WIB) HSYD AYVHEN LYIgUD 0001 £E0
EESPST 96°L9- 6TET9T (1004 Lo wie D) HSYD YIAIYOL SIUL B00T-¢£0
S TBS'LIE 85°S562'T 9§°987'9TE (l00d uo wied) HSY 1SNYL 141D 9N 00T 150
SL'L09'1S £5°012 TTLGE'TS {1904 uo WIeD) HSYD L1SISSY ONISNOH 000T-220
TT8ILEL6 SROST9ET- L0'SL9°650'T (j00d uo wied} HSVD TYYINID 000T-T00
(100d ue uneD) HSYD - 000T :3PODIUNONIY
2juejeg Juipuy Ayapy jejo) auejeg Suiuuidag Swepn wnoxny

£202/1€/£0 - £202/10/£0 :9buey 23eq

Alewwng JunooJYy

uoday |ie1eQg

Ay Adog

VI ‘A Ado3s Jo A3D



b 30 7 abey WY 6214046 £T02/91/8
S9'P6SPITL TYEVSOLT- LTBET'S6Z'L :5|E30), puEIs)
8L 496'9LT'T LLTBL'E TOZRT'ELT'T (INNQIIV SONIAYS TYHINID - TOTT :3P0JIUN0IIY (8101
¥6'852'€8 8782 99'0£Z'€8 120V AVS WLIdSOH ToTT-089
£2'T0£'S9 8122 S0'6£2°59 LDV AVS Td34 OA/MM TOTT-Z19
10'v80'66T £ET'8Z6 88'SST'86T 120V AYS HIM3S TOTT-019
EP'PTE'S 19°42 78'968'S 120V AVS JAQYdINI YILVYM TOTT-209
LVOrs'es LE'BRE O TST'E8 130V SONIAYS ONINNIS ¥ILVYM T0T1-109
£6'T09'60T S§01IS ZT'160'60T 197 AYS HILVM TOTT-003
DO'ET9 1Z'0 64719 LI2V AYS 34D dY3d INID T0T1-00%
SO0TT'ST LTS 88°v0Z'SE 120V AVS 1434 dIND3 TOTT-05¢
TTI8TINT 41 D6 EET'TPT L120¥ AVS 3D1AY3S 1930 T0T1-00C
0E'TEO'ETT vZ'907 90°'S88'ZIT L102% AVYS A3Y A3Q NOD3 T0T1-0v0
0L'8TT'ET 6t TZPIT'ET L1I0V AVS 1SNYL 1419 81 TOTT1E0
9t°'RE8'SHE E'ITYT 592 Ve 122% AVS ANNF TYH3INID T0TI-T00
INNOIIV SONIAYS TYHINID - TOTT :9p0IIUN0IY
{8'629'LY6'S 6E9ZE'VLT- 97'956'TZT'Y :{jocd uo WIB)) HEY - ROT :2POIUNCIIY [E10]
98'£8S 8€'T 8r18S (1994 uo wie))) HSYD LI34Y04 3I2N04 000T-008
S9°860'V8 ST1L8°02- 06'699'v01 (100d uo wiefd) HSYD LSNYL 3SYN0D 4109 000T-15Z
STS9E'TT rTTZ6°01- 6E9BT'ET {1004 uo wre(d) HSVD NIVYQ Y3LVYM IWHOLS 000t-0vZ
T 6I8LEE YI'8LE'T 66°0bP'9EE {1o0d uo WieD) HSYD Y LIdSOH DODT-089
Y6902 89'Z61 9v°9LZ°0TT {1004 uo une|D} GNNJ IAYISIY HIMIS DOOT-cid
85°/9E'TTT £S'PPRE S0€25'801T {10od uo wie) HSYD ANNS 1d34/4IM3S 000T-Z19
auejeg Jurpu3 Astanay je1o) uejey Juuudag awen Wnody
€20Z/1€/10 - €£20Z/T0/£0 :28uey 2eq yoday 1m33g



b jo € abed WY 6Z:£006 ETOZ/9T/E
STSSEZT #1°1Z6'01- 6E'98T'ET IOVNIVHA HILYM WHOLS - ObL
LO'BLOTTY oYt S9TL9'6TY ANNOJIDV TVLIISOH - 089
1694021 8976 9942021 aNN4 IAYISIH HIMIS - ET9
T8'8IILLY 14998 0T Z08'ELT QNN 1d34/dNI HIMIS - ZT9
19'659'6S £9'907'6 v6'TSE0S ONDINIS 43M3S - TT9
88 TBS L9 8€°Z60°SE 05681759 ALIHLN ¥3M3S - 0T9
vS7Es 9F'E 81618 CGNNd IAYISIY HILYM - E09
60'TPT'L8T EL'BSL'T 9E'IBE'VET ANIWIAOUANI ¥ILYM - 202
et LTT 65'Z15'PT O06'TET'ELT ONIINIS YILYM - TOS
LL7952PTT EP8IT'S PEBET'EIT ALIILM Y3LVM - 009
0OET9 170 64219 YYD TVNLIdYId A¥ALINGD - 00S
68'950'T9 606%T 0840809 H3IENID NOILVIEITY - Obp
68'958'PST YT PITEE- €1'TZ0'88Y GNN4 ININIIVIdIY LINIWGIND3 - 0SE
12°699'vL 19°'v0€ 09 v9EvL 123r0Hd NOISNVdX3 A¥WYEIT - EEE
LTore'os 00'858'T7L £ L19'TY- NOILDNYLSNOD3Y 1S avOYd - OEE
08'798'9%- 08'688'T- 00'SL6'vE" 13310Yd SONISSOYD HY - 67E
EOLLYV'T 1101 T6'99¢°T NOILYIQIWIY dLMAM - 8ZE
6E'E90'361- 00 ¢Z8's9- 6E6ECTET- AINYTd LNIWLVIYL HILVMILSYM - L2E
vLOVE'SEO'T TT99L°E T9PLYIRO'T SANOS - 92¢
LO'ESE'ST T5°0T- 69 ELE'ST 1J3r0¥d SNYvd ON ONY OS - ¥iE
TS6LT'SET 8155 S9LTL'PET 193108d 100d SNIWWIMS - £2E
9SS T'9L- 1L L6292 STTY S133YLS H1L - 0ZE
GE0B9T £6°01 9'699°'Z 123r0¥d TIVYL/ISNOHEND - ¥TE
vS96T'L 9E'6T 8TL9T'L LNFWIAQUdWI LIIHLS - ETE
8 ELTIE TE'S8T 9T'880'TE S123r0Yd TWLidvd - Z1E
86°78S'Y o8t 8T ¢95't LNIWIAOYGWI NMOLNMOQA - TTE
200L2'9TT vir606'T 85°09€'9ZT 3DIAY3IS 1930 - 00T
LLTOE'TT- 00'ovre'z- L7926 NV1d 3NI53d NYIIIIAWY - 9T
BT 6L8'LST T0ZS0'T 91°'£78'95¢ LNIWJO13IAI0 SE-1 - SET
08’ rIt'res 08 Pb'E 00'0L6°0P8 31VLISI INNDI Nvdd - vET
61191 990 £5°09T aNNZ Q3AYISTY 411 - 92T
S5'6EE'0ZT 68'9.8'9 9979t 1T ONIINYNIA LNIWIHINI XVL - ST
0L TET- 8t EPB- 8LTTL ONIANNA 4735 WILYYd - STT
02620995 68°E/S'YT- 60°E09°065 Xv13Sn avod - 0TT
6T'8T0'99 TE'692 L8'8rL'S9 AN JIONVLSISSY WII3dS - T90
PTSLTTT 65°SY S96ZT'TT Y340 LNIVIA/MM - £50
OE'TEO'ETT 90T 90'SB8'TTT NYOT ONIATOAIY A3 NOD3 - OV0
EO'EET'ST E6'r9'E- 96°LLLTE AYYHEI 2NINd 1H39H9 - EE0
EE'SPST 96" L9- B6TETS'T WYYDO0Ud YIAINOL SITL - ZEO
tT'TO8'0EE L0°00E'T LTTOS'6ZE AanNNd LSNYL 141D AHYHEN - TEO
SLL09'TS £5°0TZ TTLBETS aNN4 JINYLSISSY ONISNOH - Z20
£9'950°692'T E6' VPR PET- T9TO6 S0 T anNn4 WYINIO - 10D
auejeg dupuy ANANOY [B1CL asuejeg Jujuudag puny

Arewwing puny

£Z0Z/TE/L0 - €202/10/L0 :93uey 3eq woday pelag



b J0 p 3beg WY 62:£0:6 £20T/91/8

S9'P6SVIT'L TIEVSOLT- LTBET'S6T'L ‘jelol puess
98'€8S 8T 8’185 $3°AL1343404 32i10d - 008
S9'860't8 STTLS0T- 06699701 aNNd 1SNYL ISYNOD 3109 - TSL

Arewwung pung
£202/1€/L0 - £202/10/L0 :98uey Meg woday ig32g



5 Jo T a6ed

WY 71:85:6 £202/01/8

TO'VOTOE TTETT 08'080°0¢
08'¥S90€ 85°L09°02 TTLPO0T
07°600ES 000 02°600°ES
68'95019 60'6% 08°£08'09
¥3'9P96€ET TP'69T E€- STIIBTLL
1769904 19'0E 09 vIEvL
£9°E8SEOL- 000 £9'€85'E0-
£1°0vZ08 00°858'TZT €8 LT9'TH-
08'¢989¢- 08°'688°T- 00'SL6'VE-
€0'LLVT TT0T 76'99¢°7
6€'€9086T- 00'PT8'S9- 6E6ETTET-
PLOYZSYOT Tr99L's T9PLE'THO'T
LO'ESESH 5°0t- 65'ELE'SD
TS6LESET L8155 SO LTLPET
9t'6829L- TLE6T'9L" ST
ET°LL198- 000 €1°LLT°98-
6£°0892 £6°0T 9t'699°Z
¥5°96TL 9¢'62 81°29T°L
8P ELTIE TE'S8T 91'830°TE
86785t oLgt 8TVISY

0z ZI0PI- T 1981 TEELB'ST-
LLTOBTT- o0ore'z- LL'T792°6-
8164857 20°750°T 9E£Z8'957
OB PIFrt8 0g8'vrr's 00°0L6°0b8
6T°T9T 990 £9°09T
SS6EEDZT 689489 99°Z9'€TT
OL'TET- 8r'Eve- 8LTITL
07'6Z0995 68'ELSVT- 60°€09'065
61°8T099 2E'692 L88L'S9
PTSLITT 69'SP S9ELT'IT
86 YBPIY- 000 86°Y8Y'TY-
g 8:74 £6'b9'E- 96 LLLTE
£E'SKST 96°L9- 6T EIT
PSTRSLIE 85°662'T 96°982'9TE
SLL09TS £5°01Z TTLBE'TS
LT IIZELE S895P'9ET- L0'SL9'650°T
douejeg duppuy Ajanoy g0l acuejeg Suiuu)dzg

£202/1£/40 - £202/10/40 :abuey ajeq
Alewwng Junoooy

uoday |eleg
P\:ﬂ S ograa Py DD

{1004 uo uNE) HSYI INIS Y3LVM

{1004 uo wied) HSYD YILvm

(joogd uo wieD) HSYD VYD du3d WD

(100d uo une|d) HSYD ¥3LNID NOILYIUD3Y
{1004 uo wieD} HSYD ANNF IDV1d3Y dNDA
{lood vo wWieD) HSYD NOISNYJX3 911
SE2AMQU SALLITIDVY SHYOM DNENJ/TIVH ALID
NOILONYLSNODIY 1S avOoud

{1004 uo wne|)) 173r0Ud SONISSOYD ¥
WIVTD HSVY NOLLYIQINIY dLMM

WIY1D HSYD [Odd 1VI4L MM

{190d uo wiep)) HSYD SANOY

(1004 uo wneps} HSYD) fOYUd SNUYL ON 8 05
{100d uo wWieD) HEYD [0Y¥d 100d ONININIMS
(100d vo wiepy) S13TULS 1L

{1994 uo wie(d) S1I3f0Ud HILYM

{1004 uo une|d) HSY UYHL/ASAOHENTD
{1ood uo wne|d) HSVD IAQHINI 133YLS

(1904 uo wWie3) HSYD $103r0Yd WLIdYD
(1o0d U0 WIe)) HSYD 3A0YJINI NMOLNMOG
(100d uo wieD} HSYD AY3S 1830

{100d uo WIRPDINYId 2N253Y NYIIYIWY
(1904 uo WieD) HSYD LNIWIOIIAIA SE-I
{100d NO WIVT2) HSYD 31v153 INNIY Nvyd
(100d uo wie|3) HSYD ANNG JIAYISTY 411
{1004 w0 WIRD) HSYD IINYNIJ ININIFYINI X1
(100d uo wie|d} HSYD ANNY 3135 TVILYYd
(1004 uo wie)d) HSYD X1 3SN AVOY

{1004 uo ute|]) HSYD 1SISSY WIDAdS

(1004 uo WD} HSYD Y340 LNIVIN/MM
(100d uc wiep) HSYD NVOT ATOAZY A3Q NOD3
{1004 U0 wWie|J) HSYD AYVYEN LYIGND

(1o0d uo wie|d) HSYD Y3ATYO3 S3TUL

{100d uo wie(3) HSYD 1SNYL 1419 41

{1004 uo Wie3} HSYD LSISSY ONISNOH

{1004 uo wied) HSYD TYHINISD

sweN

(1004 uc wieR) HSYD - D00T PPCIWNOITY
WNoWPY

oy oo

vI ‘AD Aoy go Ao | )




§ 30 7 abeq

WY Z1:55:6 £202/01/8

000 000 00’0

00’0 00 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 o000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

00’0 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

o0'0 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

00’0 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 00’0

00’0 000 000

00’0 000 00'¢

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000
£E"E6E'29VS G6E9TEPLI- TLBLLTPY'S {100d uo WILD) HSYD - 00T :3POIIUNOINY |EI0L
98°€8S 8ET 8’185
59°'860¢8 SZ'TL5'02- 06'699°P0T
ST'S9ETT ¥ETZE'0T- 6E'98Z'E€T
ET'6TBLEE PUBLET 66'0vP9EE
1692021 89°Z6% W'SLTOTE
85496801 |28 244 SO'E25'80T
T9'65105 EE'E6T- ¥6'Z5K'08
L8'L6ETEY STYI0'LE ZYEEE PSP
5728 9¢'€ BT'618
99'9176L1 ZTTEL PSSBUBLT
acuejeg Suipuy  AnAROY [EI0L aduejeg Juuufag

€202/1E/£0 - €£202/10/20 :93uey 21eq

HSVD H31lvMm

HSYD 39vD d¥3d W3

HSYD Y31N3D NOILY3YIY
HSYD aNn4d 1438 4IND3
HSYD NOISNVJX3 AHVHE1
HSYD SL03108d 1V LidVvI
HSYD S£33r0Yd 1vLIdvD
HSYD SLI3r0Yd Tv1idv)
HSWD Odd Sidvd ON 8 0%
HSY) (O4d 1004 ONIWINIMS
HSVI S13341S 1L

HSYD

HSYD UIVYL/3SNOHENTD
HSYD JA0¥4NI 133415

HSV2 SLOII0¥4 TWLIdVD
HSVD IACHdINI NMOLNMOA
HSYD AY3S 1934

HSV2 NV1d 3NJ53Y NYJIYIWY
HSYD LNIWJO13A30 SE-1
HSV) ONNJ Q3AH3S3Y dIL
HSY2 IINVNIJ LNIWIHINI XvL
HSVJ ANNd 4735 TvILEvd
HSVD XV1 35N avOoy

HSYD 1SISSV WID3dS

HSYD 34O LNIVIA/MM
HSYD NYO1 A10A3Y 13AIG NOD3
HSYD AdVHE1T 1438119

HSY2 H3AIHOS S33dL

HSYD 1SNYL 1419 801

HSV) 15185V ONISNOH

HSVYD TWY3INID

{100d uo wieD} HSYD LI344904 3010d

(1004 vo wied) HSYD 1SNEL 3S¥N0D 109
{1004 Lo WNEID} HSYD NIVYQ HILYM WHOLS
(1004 uo wieD} HSYD TYLISOH

(1004 uo wiep3} ANNS IAYISTY YIM3IS
{1ood uo wie|3) HSYD ANNJ 1d3Y/43IMIS
{100d NO WIVIDIHSYD MNIS HIMIS

{100d vo wneD) HSYD ALITILA Y3M3S

(1004 uo wWieD) HSYD JAYISTY HILYM
{1004 uo wieD) HSYD AQUdII HILYM

WuNodY

uoday pe1ag



5 40 ¢ abed

WY Z1:55°6 £202/07/8

EE'EVS'BIV'S 6E9TE VLT TL'698219'S S|ej0L puesn
00°0ST 000 00051 IHSYD ALL3d - TZTT :BPOIUNGIGY |e30)
000sT 000 00°0ST

000 000 000 HSVYD ALL3d - OTTT :3pOJIUN0DDY |E30)
000 00'0 000

000 000 000

000 00’0 00°0

000 oc'o 000

000 00’0 000

000 00’0 000

000 [0 ] 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 00'0 000

000 [ 1)) 000

000 oc'o 000

oo'o 000 000

00’0 00’0 000

00’0 000 000

00’0 000 000

000 000 000 *HSVD - 00TT :3p0JIUN0DY [EI0L
000 000 00’0

00'o 000 000

000 000 000

00’0 000 000

000 00'0 000

00’0 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

00’0 000 000

duejeg Jwpuz Ajanay jeyo) aocuejeg 3uwwdag

£20Z/1€/L0 - €202/10/L0 :23uey Meq

HSYD ALL3d

HSVD ALL3d
HSYJ ALl3d
HSVD ALL3d
HSYD ALl13d
HSYD ALL3d
HSYD ALL3d
HSYI ALL3d
HSVD ALl3d
HSVD ALL3d
HSVD ALl3d
HSYD ALL3d
HSYJ ALL3d
HSYO ALl3d
HSYD ALL3d
HSVD ALl3d
HSYO ALlL3d

HSVD 1134404 30104

HSYD LSNYL 3S4N0D 109
HSVD NIVYQ 3LV WUOLS
HSYD TV LIdSOH

HSYD QNN JA¥ISIH HIMAS
HSVD 1d3Y /dWI YIM3S
HSYD ALNILLA H3IM3IS

HSV) 3AYISTY HALVM

HSV JAQUdWI H3LVYM
HSYOINIS H3LVM

aweN

TCTT-T00
HSYD ALL3d - TTTT :2pOIUN0IY

HSYD ALL3d - 0ZTT :2p0unony

DOTT-008
goTT-15L

wnoxny

uoday jieraq



85°£9680T ES by SO'ECSBOT QNN 1d3Y/dN) 943M3S - 2T9 Q0ErPPSIBETTO
1965105 £E'€E6T LAY ONDINIS HIM3IS - TT9 QOErrSIRETTY
LB LBETEY STP90LE LIEEEPSY ALITILN Y3M3IS - 0T9 00ErtSTB60TI
v5'ees 9E'E 8T618 AONNA IAYISITY YILvm - €09 00er0T86EQ9
99'9TZ641 CIU'TEL PSS8YBLT AINIWIAOHdWI H3LVYM - 209 00evt0T86209
20020 [£474" 8°0800¢ SNDINIS 431¥M - T09 00trr0T86TO9
8'¥S90E 85°2090C T LP00T ALITILN Y31VAM - 009 Q0EVFOTB6009
z'600tS 0 7'600ES JYVI IVNLIdYId A313W3D - 005 000560100
68'95079 60'6vZ 820809 H31NID NOILVIYI3IY - Otb 00EVFOCTBOPY
v8or96ET Tr'e9TeeE- ST'9T8LLT 14 INJW3DV143IH LINFWCINDI - 0SE O0DEVFOSE00SE
TZ'699%L T9v0E 9vIErL pun4 uoisuedx3 Ateiq) -£€€ OOEVPZILBEEE
€9°ERSEOT- 0 £9°€8SE0P- SHHOM DNANJ/TTVH ALID - TEE 0OErrZ9L8TEE
L1°0PZ08 8681ZT ER LTI NOILINYLSNOI3Y 1S aVOye - Ot 00E¥r0SLB0EE
8'v989¢E- 36881~ Si6tE- 12310Hd SONISSQYD HH - 6C€ 00E¥t0SLB6TZE
€0°LLPT 1T0t 26'99%T NOILYIQINIY dLMM - BZE 00E¥P0BLBBIE
6E'E9086T- ¥Z899- 6L 6ETTET- Ad ANJNLYIHL HALYMILSYM - LTE DOEYPELLBLZE
L 0PSPOT TT°994¢€ I9'vLPTIVOT SANOSE - 92& 00EtP8LL89TE
LO'ESESS 79°0¢- 69'ELESY 1J3r0dd SXYvd ON ONV 0S - #Z€ O0EPPSLLBYTE
TS'BLTSET L8'TSS S9LILVET 12310dd 100d ONININIMS - £2¢ 00EtPELLBETE
9t S6T9L- TL L6294~ STy S13341S 4IL - 0ZE 00ttty £L80TE
ETLLTO8- 0 €T LLT98- S13310dd HILVM - 9TE 00EYFS3L89TE
6£°089Z €601 9t'699¢ 1231084 YYL/3ISN0OHAND - IE 00ErPrOLBYTE
$5'96TL 9£'6C 8T L91L AINIWIAAOHAINI L33YLS - ETE OOEPPEILBETE
8P ELTTE ZE'GBT ST'880TE S103r0dd WLdYD - ZTE 00ePPOSLLTTE
8678V L8T BZ'Hasy ANIWIACHdWI NMOLNMOQ - TTE O0EVFPZLLBITE
[ar4 10} 4% ¢1°1981 ZE'ELBST- ADIAH3S 193Q - 00C 00EFPOTLLO0Z
LLT06TT- or9z- £477926- NV1d 3NJS3H NYDIHIWY - 9¥T 00EFPT9L3911
81°6L8LST TO'ZSoT 9T°LZ89ST INIWI0IIAIQ SE-| - SET 00EPPOTSSSET
g rivtys 8744 0L6078 31V.L1S3 INNIY NVYd - vET 00Evor8ereT
6T 19T 990 €5°091 ANN4 A3AY3S3Y JiL - 92T Q0Etrr 0560921
S5°6EE0CT 689489 99°T9PETT DNIDNYNIJ LNFWIFHINI XVLE - STT 00EtP0S60SET
L'TET- By EvyS- 8LTIL OSNIONNZ 4135 TVILHYd - STT Q0Eb00E65TT
7°620995 68'ELSPC- 60°£0906S Xv13SN Qv0d - 0TT 00EVFOS60T00
6T'81099 7€69¢ {8'8¥L59 QNN INVISISSY TVID3dS - T90 00EPreTZLTIR0
FOSLTTI 65°St 99'6ZTIT1 ¥3dO LNIVIN/MM - €S0 QDEPFSTBEESO
86'V8¥ Y- 0 868y NYOQT ONIATOAIY AIQ NOD3 - 010 00EVFOTSSOr0
EQ'EETRT £6'PoE- 96 LLLTE AUYHE 2018Nd L4399 - £€0 COEPROTHIEED
€E°SPST 96°LY- 62°ETST WVEDOHd HIATHOL S3IHL - ZE0 00EPPOTSBTED
PS5 C8SLTE B8S°S6CT 96'98¢91¢ ANN- 1SNHL 141D AdYdan - 120 00EPFOTVPTED
SLL09TS £S°01¢C 2T LBETS QNNd FINVYLSISSY ONISOOH - 220 00e¥P0OESSEZ0
TLBIEETH S8 95rOEL- L0°ST8650T AaNNd IYY¥3INIO - TOO 00E¥P0SE0T00
uejeg uipuz Anarpy [ejoL souejeg Suluindag pung

Asewwing pung €202/T€/£-€202/10/L0 :98uey ajeg woday yereq



VEVPY'9ZLSS
vLE0TS-
LELVR'TS-

St'SeY'8TLSS
Z1'Z0T'092%

1315183) JUBWAIL]S YUBY YIIBW P|NOYS [e10) |euld
:{uonpaned JuswAiediuawisnipe ssa|

:s31g3Q SuipueisIno s53)

12151831 JuaWIIEIS HUBQ YDIBL PINOYS JeI0),
supaJ) duipueising 1215199y Juawaels Jueg sn|d

£E°E6E'89V'SS |eloagns

00°0STS- ysed Anad

£EEVS'RIYSS aduejeq Asewwng pury

EEEVSE9PS 6€9ZEPLT- TL'69829S

92'€8S RET 8185

59°860p8 STTLS0T- 6'699%01 -
STS9ETT ¥1'1260T- 6E'98ZET

£T°6T8LEE PUBLET 66°0VY9EE

PT'69L02T 89°Z6t ar'9.Z07T

‘|ej0l pueiy
$34¥N11343504 32N0d - 008
ANN4d LSNY1 3S8N0J 4109 - TSL
JOVNIVYQ Y31VM WHOLS - Ot L
INNOJDY TYLIdSOH - 089
QNN JAYISIH HIAMIS - €19

00ertTTTTOOR
00EPPOLBETSL
00ErtTTZE0VL
00EvPSY8S089
00EYPSTBEETY



€ 4o 1 9bed

WY §£:60:6 £202/91/8

*HSYD ALL3d - TZTT :3poJuno10y [e10L

NNOOV SONIAYS TYHINID - TOTT :2PeJIUN0NY [210)

000 000 000

000 00’0 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000
00'000°00T 000 00'000'001
000 000 000

o000 000 000

oo 000 000
0005t 00°0 00°05T
00°0ST 000 00'0sT
8L¥96°9LTT LL'TBL'E TOTBLELTT
¥6'852'€8 8T8T 99'0£7'€8
000 000 000
£2'70£'59 817z SO'6L2'59
10'P80'66T £1'826 88'SST'86T
£P'PTE’S 1942 T8968'S
L Ops'es LE'68E 0T TST'E8
L6109'60T $8°01S ZT'T60'60T
00°ET9 Tz0 64219
000 000 000
SO0TIT'ST LTS 88'v07'sT
[LArA:T4r4 48 zE'sy D6'EET'THT
000 000 000

000 000 000

o000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000

000 000 000
O0E'T60'ETT vz 90T 90'S88°TTT
000 000 000
0L'8TT'ET 6t°t TTYIT'ET
000 000 o000
9¢"REB'SPE T6'TT9'T ¥S9TTPYE
duejeqg Juppug Ananoy jejoL 2ouejeg Jupuwdag

£20Z/1E/L0 - €£202/10/£0 :abuey a3eq
Alewwing JunoooYy

podey fie1eQ
c207 hyne

11504340 40 $3LVIIdI1YTD 0FTT-907
1150434 40 SILYIIHILNID OFTIeL
1150434 40 $3LYIIHI1H3D OPTT-5¢t
35N QVOd "d30 40 '1432 [yatEsi
L1S0d3Q 40 S3LYIIHILHID OPTT-150
N1 NOD3 'd3d 40 133D OPTT-OFD
1150430 40 SALVIHILNID 0PIT-250
1150430 40 SALYIHILYID ZAR#G]
OW € NN N39 430 40 1¥3D OvTi-100

LS0d3Q 4O SILVIEILYIS - OFTT "9p0oOUN0ddYy

HSYD ALL3d TCLE-100
HSVJ ALL3d - TTTT :3pOUN0IIY

120V AVS TV LIdSOH TOTT-089

1DV AVS ONNM4 3IAYISIY HIM3IS TOTT-E13
120V AVS 1434 OW/ MM T0TT-219
190V AYS 4IM3s TOIT-GL3

LI2V AYS 3IA08dNI HILYM 0TT-209
100V SONIAVS ONIINIS YILYM TOTT-T0%
100V AVS ¥ALYM TorT-003

LIDV AYS 39D dH3d WD TOTT-005
ANNODIY SONIAYS TYHINID TOTT-0bF
150V AYS 143 dIND3 TOTT05¢

190% AYS 321A¥3S 1830 T0TT00¢
ANNODIV SONIAYS TVYINID ToTT-arT
ANNO3IY SONIAYS TVYINID TOTT-5ET
LNNOJDV SONIAYS TVYINID TOTT-5¢t
LNNODOV SONIAVS TVYINID TOTT-0T1
LNNOIDY SONIAYS IVYINID TOTT-T90
LNNOJOV SONIAYS TYYINID TOTT-¢50
120V AWS A3¥ A3 NOD3 TOTT-060
LNRIOJOV SONIAYS TYHINID TOTT250
170V AVS 1SNYL L9 911 TOTT-TE0
LNNOJOV SONIAVS TVHINID TOTT-220
L1J0V AYS ONNY TWYIN3D TOTT-T00

1INNO2DV SONIAVS TVHINID - TOTT “ap0IuUnondy

Iwen oSy

ALY
VI ‘Ajp Aoys jo Ao [ ]

/«\




¢ Jo z sbeqd

WY SE160:6 €20Z/91/8

89'TL0'556°T LETBL'E 16'887'156'T
00°000'00T 00°0 00°000°00T
00°000°00T 000 00000001
000 000 000

000 000 000
00°000°00T 00'0 00°000°00T
00'000°00T 000 00000001
06°956'4Z 000 06°956'LT
06'956°LT 000 06'956°LT
000 00°0 000

000 000 00'0
00°000°00T 00'0 00°000°00T
000 000 00’0
00°000°00T 000 00'000°00T
00°000°052 000 00°000'052
00°000052 000 00'000°052
00°000°00¢ 000 00°000°00Z
00’0 000 (4. 60)]
00°000°00T 000 00'000°00T
00’0 000 00’0

00'0 000 o000

000 000 o000

00’0 000 000

ao'o 00’0 00'0

oo'o Do0 00’0

oo'e 0o'0 000

000 000 00’0
suejeq 3uipu3 Auanay [ejog ajuejeq dujuuiag

€20T/TE/L0 - £202/10/L0 :23uey aleq

s|eeL puesn

QD WLIdSOH - G9TT 3pOJIUN0INY [RI0L

10D HAM3IS - 6PTT '2POJIUN0IDY jej0L

{0 HALYM - BPTT :3p0JIUN0dY €301

10D IUVD dH3Id W3ID - LYTT :BpOUNODY |01

TI6SH LSNUL AUVHEN - EYTT -3pOJIUN0ODY |e30L

150434 40 SALYIIAILHID - ZPTT :IPOIIUNCIDY 2101

‘03 TYHINID - TYTT F9pOOIUNo2dY |30

11ISOd3A 40 SILVIIHILYID - OPTT :3pOIUN0Y [el0]

a2 1vL1dSOH 05TT-08%

@2 TVLIJSOH - 09TT :9pounoday
QD ¥3IM3s BPIT-015

D Y3IM3S - GPTT :PPOWN0IIY
Q2 Y3ILYM BPTT-009

@D YILYM - 8PTT :2POJWNODY
a2 38vD dH3d W3D IvET-005

a2 VD d¥3d W3D - ZPTT JPPOJIIN0DY
TTESH# 1SNYL AYvaEN EYTT-IED

TIGESH LSNYL AYVHEN - £PTT :9polUNcIY
0T6S# LSNYL Avvean TYTI-1E0
100d ONNd N39S THTI-T00

1150434 40 STAVIIEHILNID - ZETT :FPOIUN0DY
OW 9 QD T¥Y3IN3D TeTT-100

a2 TVHINID - TPTT :2pojIunody
OW € dSOH "d3a 40 133D OeT1-039
“IIVIdIY MM 433 40 "183D oritT-219
11S043Q 30 SILVIHILY3ID BFTT-01%
11$0d33 30 STLVIHLILEI) OPTT-209
1150434 30 SILVIHHILYID OFTT-105
1150434 30 SILYHHILEID OeTT-009
1150434 30 SILVHLILYID THTT-005
L1S0430 40 S3LVDIAILY3D ORIT-0vF
LIS0d3a 40 SALVYIIAILYID oFiTOeE
L1S0430 30 SALYLILY3D DETT-00¢
IwenN WUNQIDY

woday |lelag



	Agenda
	Minutes
	Resolution 23-61
	Resolution 23-62
	Resolution 23-63
	Ordinance 339
	Ordinance 340
	Administrative Items
	Mayor and Council Agenda Items
	Bills and Claims



